
PPF96 APR 5 1978
 
DEPARTMENT OF STATE 

AGENCY FOR INTERNATIONAL DEVELOPMENT 
WASH It4aroJL.G.-aoua.. 

ORIGINAL
 
W- -

Mr. Alfred A. Whittaker 
Executive Director 
Institute for International Development, 

Inc. 
410 Pine Street, Suite 300 
Vienna, Vf.ginia 22180 

Subject: General Support Grant 
Grant No. AID/csd-3705, 
Amendment No. 10
PIO/T 932-OO34-73-3289204 Al 

Dear Mr. Whittaker: 

Pursuant to the authority contained in the Foreign Assistance Act of 

1961, as amended, the Agency for International Development (hereinafter 

referred to as "A3D" or "Grantor") hereby amends.the grant to the Institute 

For International Development, Inc., (hereinafter referred to as "InI" c­

"Grantee") as follows: 

1. 	 In the cover letter of Amendment No. 9 delete the date'"Mach 31, 1978" and substitute in lieu thereof "May
31, 	 1978". 

2. 	 In the Prram Description, pars D, Estimated Budget,
delete the date "3/31/78" and substitute in lieu 
thereof "5/31/78". 

All other terms and conditions remain unchanged. 

.Please sign the original and all copies of this letter to acknowledge 

your acceptance of the conditions herein. Retain one copy for your file 

I 



and return the original and rainingm copies to tis offtl e. 

ACKNOWLEDGED 

INSTITUTE FOR 

--.BY:. 

TITLE:
 

DATE:._Az 

Sicr rs, 

Michael H. Snyder 
Grant Officer 
Services Operations Division 
Office of Contract Management 

INTERNATINC. 

/ 1 



2 
FEB 10 1978ORIGINAL ..-. 

DEPARTMENT OF STATE
AGENCY FoR INTERNATIONAL DEVELoPME,ANT 

WASHINGTON. o.C. 1023 

FEB 10 1978 

Mr. Alfred A. Whittaker
 
Executive Director
 
Institute for International Developmentq
 

Inc.
 
8150 Leesburg Pikep Suite 504
 
Vienna, Virginia 22180
 

Subject: General Support Grant
 
Grant No. AID/csd-3705,
 
Amendment No. 9
 
PIO/T 932-0034-73-3289204
 

Dear Mr. Whittaker:
 

Pursuant to the authority contained in the Foreign Assistance Act of
 

19619 
as amended, the Agency for International Development (hereinafter
 

referred to as "AID" or "Grantor") hereby grants to the Institute For
 

International Development, Inc.# 
(hereinafter referred to as "IlDI" or
 

"Grantee") the additional stu 
 of $65,000 in support of the program in
 

fostering indigenous businesses in LDC's as more fully described in
 

Attachment A to this Grant entitled "Program Description". 
 The total
 

amount obligated under this grant is now $675,460.
 

This Grant is effective as of the date of this letter and is applicable
 

to comitments made by the Grantee in furtherance of program objectives
 

for the period February I, 1977 through March 31, 1978 as indicated in
 

the Budget.
 

The subject grant, as amended, is hereby further amended as follows:
 

Program Descrietion
 

1. 
Delete "D. Estimated Budget" In its entirety and substitute in
 

lieu thereof the following:
 



-2­

"D. Estimated Budget 

.. udet 

8/18/72 2/1/76 2/1/77 
1/31/76 
Actual 

1131/77 
Actual 

3/31/78 
Budget Total 

1. Salaries & 

benefits $567,595 $1649721 $264,240 $ 996,556 

2. Travel 112,379 42,724 78,592 233,695 

3. Rent, Services & 
Equipment 62,224 14,114 11,844 88,182 

4. Utilities & 

Office Expenses 54,389 139774 18,158 86,321 

5. Professional Services 8597 2,466 15,522 269585 

6. Promotion Expenses 3,435 -0- -0- 3,435 

7. Entrepreneurial 
Training Centers -0-

$808,619 
33321 

$271,120 
379564 

$425,920 
70p885 

$1,505,659 

AID Contributions $269,540 $160,460 $245,460 $675,460 

2. Program Description, 1I. Budget Provisions, subparagraph d.
 

Delete the amount $6109460 and substitute in lieu thereof $675,460.
 

The Grant is made to the IDI, Inc., on condition that the funds will be
 

administered essentially as described in your proposal and in accordance with the
 

terms and conditions as set forLh inAttachment A entitled "Program Description" 

Attachment B entitled "Standard Provisions", and Attachment C entitled "Payment 

Provisios", all of which have been agreed to by your organization. 



Please sign the original and all copies of this letter to acknowledge
 

your acceptance of the conditions under which these funds have been granted.
 

Please retain a copy for your files and return the original and all remaining
 

copies of this Grant to the Office of Contract Management. Be sure to return
 

all copies stamped "Funds Available".
 

Sincerely yor, 

hael H. Snyder
 
Grant Officer
 
Services Operations Division
 
Private and Development Corporation

Office of Contract Management
 

ACCEPTED: 

INSTITUTE FOR INTERNATIONALDEVEL ENT9 C. 

BY: Z1 = -

TYPED NAME IfZ-1- 9 

TITLE '?'. " 

DATE 



DEPARTMEN OF STATE A&S. 
AGENCY FOR INTERNATIONAL DEVELOPMENT 

WASHINGTON. D.C. 20523 

Mr. Alfred A. Whittaker FEB 14 JAN 311977 
Executive Director 
Institute for International Development, Inc. 
8150 Leesburg Pike, Suite 504 
Vienna, Virginia 22180 

Subject-:ORIGINAL 
General Support Grant 
Grant No. AID/csd-3705, 
Amendment No. 8, 
PIO/T 932-13-950-034-73-3279214 

Dear Mr. Whittaker: 

Pursuant to the authority contained in the Foreign Assistance Act of
 

1961, as amended, the Agency for International Development (hereinafter
 

referred to as "AID" or "Grantor") hereby grants to the Institute For
 

International Development, Inc., (hereinafter referred to as "IIDI" or
 

"Grantee") the additional sum of $150,000 in support of the program in 

fostering indigenous businesses in LDC's as more fully described in
 

Attachment A to this Grant entitled "Program Description". The total
 

amount obligated under this grant is now $610,460.
 

This Grant is effective as of the date of this letter and is applicable
 

to commitments made by the Grantee in furtherance of program objectives
 

during the period February 1, 1977 through January 31, 1978 as indicated 

in the Budget. Subject to their availability, additional funds may be 

granted. 

The subject grant, as amended, is hereby further amended as follows: 

Program Description
 

1. Delete "D. Estimated Budget" in its entirety and substitute in 

ORIGINAL
 



Institute for International 


Development, Inc.
 

lieu thereof the followings
 

"D. Estimated Budget
 

I. Budget
 

1. Salaries & Benefits 


2. Travel 


3. Rent-Services & Equipment 


4. Utilities & Office Expenses 


5. Professional Services 


6. Promotion Expenses 


7. Entrepreneurial Training 


Centers
 

8-18-72-

1-31-76 


$567,595 


112,379 


62,224 


54,389 


8,597 


3,435 


-


2-1-76 

1-31-77 


$176,560 


30,000 


17,040 


12,000 


2,000 


-


33,320 


2
 

2-1-77­
1-31-78 TOTAL 

$225,000 $969,155 

35,000 177,379 

20,000 99,264 

15,000 81,389 

3,000 13,597 

- 3,435 

67,000 100,320 

$808,619 $270,920 
$365,000 $1,444,539
 

A.I.D. Contributions $300,000 $130,000 $180,460 
 $ 610,460
 

2. 
Program Description, II. Budget Provisions, subparagraph d.
 

Delete the amount $460,460 and substitute in lieu thereof $610,460.
 

The Grant is made to the IIDI, Inc., on condition that the funds will
 

be administered essentially as described in your proposal and in accordance
 

with the terms and conditions as set forth in Attachment A entitled "Program
 

Description", Attachment B entitled "Standard Provisions", and Attachment
 

C entitled "Payment Provisions", all of which have been agreed to by your
 

-7 



__ 

Institute fpr International 
 3 
Development, Inc.
 

organization.
 

Please sign the original and all copies of this letter to
 

acknowledge your acceptance of the conditions under which these funds
 

have been granted. Please retain a copy for your files and return the
 

original and all remaining copies of this Grant to the Office of
 

Contract Management. 
Be sure to return all copies stamped "Funds
 

Available".
 

7 

Sincefely yours, 

Gerald P. Gol 
/ Grant Office 

/ Chief, PHA Branch 
Central Operations Division 
Office of Contract Management 

ACCEPTED:
 

INSTITUTE FOR INTERNATIONAL D LLOPMENT, INC.
 

BY: _______________ 


TYPEDN Alfred A. Wbh1takpr 

TITLE: Executive Diretnr 

DATE: February 15. 1977
 

C 



SJAN 1977
 

DEQRLPtWATE )d'3
 
AGENCY FOR INTERNATIONAL DEVELOPMEN'-.f.± 

WASHINGTON. CC. ZOSZ$ 

Ut.' . It 

Mr. Alfred A. Whittaker 
Executive Director SEP 2 41976 
Institute For International Development, Inc.
 
8150 Leesburg Pike, Suite 504
 
Vienna, Virginia 22180
 

Subject: Grant No. AID/csd-3705,
 
Amendment No. 7,
 
PIO/T 932-!3-950-034-73-3219215
 

Dear Mr. Whittaker:
 

Pursuant to the authority contained in the Foreign Assistance Act of
 

1961, as amended, the Agency for International Development (hereinafter
 

referred to as "AID" or "Grantor") hereby grants to the Institute For 

International Development, Inc., (hereinafter referred to as "IIDI" or 

"Grantee") the additional sum of $30,460 in support of the program in 

fostering indigenous businesses in LDC's'as more fully described in 

Attachment A to this Grant entitled "Program Description". The total 

amount obligated under this grant is now $460,460.
 

This Grant is effective as of the date of this letter and Is applicable
 

to coumitments made by the Grantee in furtherance of program objectives
 

during the period February 1, 1977 through January 31, 1978 as 
indicated
 

in the Budget. Subject to their availability, additional funds may be
 

granted, pr(vided that the Grantee complies with the matching requirement
 

specified in the Budget.
 

The subject grant, as amended, is hereby further amended as follows:
 

ORIGIN'
 



Institute For International2
 

1. Attachment A, Program Description, B- Scope of Grant Related
 

Activities
 

In subparagraph "2", delete the first sentence "In the perfor­

mance of the above stated activities and other related tasks IIDI will 

not make business decisions, operate a business enterprise, contribute
 

or invest its funds in any organization that has been assisted under the
 

terms and conditions of this grant." and in the second sentence delete
 

the first word "Furthermore".
 

2. Program Description, II. 
 Budget Provisions, subparagraph d.
 

Delete the amount "$430,000" and substitute in lieu thereof "$460,460".
 

The Grant is made to the IIDI, Inc.,.on condition that the funds will
 

be administered essentially as described in your proposal and in accordance
 

with the terms and conditions as set forth in Attachment A entitled "Program
 

Description", Attachment B entitled "Standard Provisions", and Attachment
 

C entitled "Payment Provisions", all of which have been agreed to by your
 

organization.
 

Please sign the original and seven (7) copies of this letter to
 

acknowledge yobr acceptance of the conditions under which these funds have
 

been granted. Please return the original and six (6) copies of this Grant
 

ORIGINAL /o
 

http:Inc.,.on


ORIG: AL
 
Inotitute For International
 
Development, Inc.
 

to the Office of Contract Management.
 

yours,
y 


Si 


/ Grent Officer 

Chief, PHA Branch 
Central Operations Division 
Office of Contract Management 

ACCEPTED: 

INST.TUTE F I=L TERATNAL DEV PME7, INC. 

TYPED 

INxRIA 

DATE: S~r ~ (,(
 

ORIGINAL
 



DEPARTMENT OF STATE M4R 1976 
AGENCY FOR INTERNATIONAL DEVELOPMENT 

WASHINGTON. D.C. Z0523 

ORIGINAL
 
Mr. Alfred A. Whittaker
 
Executive Director
 
Institute For International Development, Inc. MARi 1976 
8150 Leesburg Pike, Suite 504
 
Vienna, Virginia 22180
 

Subject: Grant No. AID/csd-3705,
 
Amendment No. 6,
 
PIO/T 932-13-950-034-73­

3269220
 

Dear Mr. Whittaker:
 

Pursuant to the authority contained in the Foreign Assistance Act
 

of 1961, as amended, the Agency for International Development (herein­

after referred to as "AID" or "Grantor") hereby grants to the Institute
 

For International Development, Inc., <hereinafter referred to as "IIDI"
 

or "Grantee") the additional sum of $130,000 in suppo. 
 of the program
 

in fostering indigenous businesses in LDC's as more fully described in
 

the attachemnt to this Grent entitled "Program Description" as hereto­

for amended and as revised in this Amendment No. 6 . The total amount
 

obligated under this grant is now $430,000.
 

This Grant is effective as of the date of this letter and is
 

applicable to commitments made by the Grantee in furtherance of program
 

objectives during the period February 1, 1976 through January 31, 
1977
 

as indicated in the Budget. 
 Subject to their availability, additional
 

funds may be provided for another year. provided that the Grantee complies
 

with the matching requirement specified in the Budget.
 

The subject grant, as amended, is hereby further amended as follows:
 

ORIGINAL
 



Institute For International
 
Development, Inc. 2.
 

1. 	 Attachment A, Program Description, B. Scope of Grant Related Activities
 

a. 	 Add paragrapn l.h:
 

"h. IIDI expects to achieve a total of 37 projects "underway"
 

("underway" means financial commitments made by project principals), at
 

a rate of about 17 for the grant year from'2-1-76 to 1-31-77 and 20 the
 

next grant year."
 

b. 	 Add paragraph 3 as follows:
 

"3. IIDI will also conduct the following one new activity:
 

Entrepreneurial Training Centers, a new pilot activity to
 

develop key personnel at management/supervisory levels for new small
 

businesses, limited to two countries in the next two years. 
IIDI's
 

project experience has shown the importance of such personnel in new
 

business ventures. 
For these centers, volunteer North Americans will
 

serve 	as teachers, joining with local businessmen. Indigenous voluntary
 

agencies and groups will also participate from the start and assume
 

responsibility for the centers in about four years.
 

These centers will offer business and selected technical
 

subjects at the management/supervisory level for both established local
 

businessmen and prospective entrepreneurs. The pilot program is planned
 

for Honduras. A second program in another country would be added in the
 

next year if the Honduras experience is positive. ACORDE (a group of local
 



Institute For International
 
Development, Inc. 
 3,1
 

voluntary agencies) would have a leading role; government and private
 

agencies, and the Chamber of Commerce, would also be involved, and
 

would help identify and interest prospective trainees.
 

The staff, comprised of local, and North American
 

(volunteer) businessmen, would offer two to three two-week sessions a
 

year at several locations. 
About 60 trainees a year are planned. IIDI
 

and ACORDE will evaluate each session and make needed changes; contact
 

with each trainee will be kept, also. By the fourth year from now, the
 

training center is to become the primary responsibility of local entre­

preeneurs and voluntary grouls."
 

c. 	 Add paragraph 4 as follows:
 

"4. Evaluation Plan. 
 IIDI has shown a growing capacity to
 

avaluate the progress of its activities critically. For its work on
 

)usiness projects, it will continue to chart the outcome of proposal
 

7eviews at each stage leading to possible financial commitments, invest­

ient amounts, and number of jobs created.
 

Semiannual reports to be made by IIDI to AID will include
 

;he following indicators:
 

(a) 	Number of New Jobs Created
 

(b) 	Number of Jobs Expanded
 

(c) 	Number of New People Trained
 



Institute For International
 
Development, Inc. 
 4
 

(d) 	 Number of People Trained on the Job
 

(e) 	 Extent of Profit Sharing
 

(f) 	 Number of Joint Ventures Created (Started/Continued) 

(g) 	 Number of Operating Businesses 

(h) 	 Number of Outside Investments Developed

(Including size. and time period to present)


(i) 	 Number of Experienced Outside Personnel Brought 
into the LDC; and the number that now Remains 

d. Program Description
 

Delete "D. Estimated Budget" in its entirety and in lieu thereof
 

substitute the following:
 

"D. Estimated Eudgct 

I. Budget 

8-18/72- 2-1-76- 2-1-77­
1-31-76 1-31-77 1-31-78 TOTAL 

1. Salaries & Benefits $567,595 $176,560 $225,000 $969,155 

2. Travel 112,379 30,000 35,000 177,379 

3. Rent-Services & Equipment 62,224 17,040 20,000 99,264 

4. Utilities & Office Expenses 54,389 12,000 15,000 81,389 

5. Professional Services 8,597 2,000 3,000 13,597 

6. Promotion Expenses 3,435 - - 3,435 

7. Entrepreneurial Training 
Centers - 33,320 67,000 100,320 

$808,619 $270,920 $365,000 $1,444,539 

(4
 



Institute For International
 
Development, Inc. 
 5
 

II. Budget Provisions
 

a. 8/18/72 - 1/31/76
 

The line item budget is based o:n a contribution of AID grant
 

funds of $269,540. The reLaining portion of this budget amounting to
 

$539,079 shall be funded from the Grantees private funds.
 

b. The above line item budget for the period 2/1/76 to 1/31/77 is
 

based on a maximum contribution of AID grant funds of $160,460. 
The
 

remaining balance of this estimat-d budget, $110,460, will be funded
 

from the Grantee's private funds. 
 No AID funding will be provided for
 

the next grant year unless this matching requirement is met satisfactorily.
 

The Grantee may adjust the line items in the above Budget as necessary to
 

achieve grant objectives.
 

c. 2/1/77 - 1/31/78
 

Subject to fund availability and subject to the Grantee's ability
 

to achieve the above matching requirements, AID is planning to contribute
 

grant funds of $215,000 during this Budget period. The remaining portion
 

of tae budget, amounting to $150,000, shall be funded from the Grantee's
 

private funds.
 

d. The total amount obligated under this Grant by AID is $430,000 

which constitutes AID's maximum liability for reimbursement. 

.e. After T). Estimated Budget, add "E. Reports. 

"E. Reports 

IIDI will provide semi-annual reports of.its activities.
 

These reports will be in sufficient detail to provide a clear picture
 



Institute For International
 
Development, Inc. 
 6
 

of IIDI activities under the grant. These reports, in duplicate, are due
 

within 30 days after the end of each reporting period-."
 

The Grant is made to the IIDI, Inc., on condition that the funds
 

will be administered essentially as described in your proposal and in
 

accordance with the terms and conditions as set forth in Attachment A
 

entitled "Program Description", Attachment B entitled "Standard Provisions",
 

and Attachment C entitled "Payment Provisions", all of which have been
 

agreed to by your organization.
 

Please sign the original and seven (7) copies of this letter to
 

acknowledge your acceptance of the conditions under which these funds
 

have been granted. Please return the original and six (6) copies of
 

this Grant to the Office of Contract Management.
 

relyyor

n 


Gerald P. Goly 
Grant Off ic
 
Chief, PHLA Branch
 
Central Operations Division
 
Office of Contract Management
 

Attachments:
 

A. Program Description
 
B. Standard Provisions
 
C. Payment Provisions
 
D. Statement of Assurance of Compliance
 

ACCEPTED:
 

INSTIUT FOR INTERNATIOL DEVEL NT, I1;C. 

BY: -A. 
TYPED NAME Alfred A. Whittaker 

TITLE: Executive Director 

DATE: March 23, 1976 

Ii
 



N - ./mk DEPARTMENT OF STATE JI" " 

.'l7 CP/.4, AGENCY FOR INTERNATIONAL DEVELOPMENT 
WASHINGTON. D.C. 20523 

ORIGINAL 
Mr. Paris W. Reidhead
 
Director JAN 14_ 1976 
Institute for International
 
Development, Inc.
 

8150 Leesburg Pike, Suite 504
 
Vienna, Virginia 22180
 

Subject: Grant AID/csd-3705
 
Amendment No. 5
 

Dear Mr. Reidhead:
 

Pursuant to the authority contained in the Foreign Assistance Act
 

of 1961, as amended, the subject grant, as amended, is hereby further
 

amended as follows:
 

1. In the Cover Letter, paragraph 2, delete the date "January 17,
 

1976" and substitute in lieu thereof "April 17, 1976".
 

2. In Attachment A, Program Description, D. ESTILATED BUDGET,
 

second column, delete the date "1-17-76" and substitute in lieu thereof
 

"4-17-76". 

The Grant, as previously amended, is hereby ratified confirrmed and
 

continued in full force and effect in accordance with its terms.
 

Please acknowledge receipt of this avendment by signing in the 

ORIGINAL
 



Institute for International
 
Development, Inc. 
 2
 

space provided below and returning the original and six (6)copies.
 

n rely yours,
 

Gerald P. Gold 

Grant Officer 
Chief, PHA Branch 
Central Operations Division 
Office of Contract Management 

ACCEPTED BY: 
IIDI '-

TITLE: ~I ~ 

DATE:_'
 

x . 



DEPARTMENT OF STATE," 
v FOR INTERfNATIONAL DEVELOPMENT 

WASb Nc.ru, 0 C o: 

oORIGINAL 
Hr. Paujt. 	 %j. RT.ddhead 

DIrect or
 
Jnsrltute for 7ritern.,tionNal 
 INov8 WS 

fl c! rp t'r! , Inc.
 
6150 LcTe". IT. Fl l.e, .tfte 504
 

Subject: 	 Crant AID/csd-3705,
 

Amendrment No. 4
 

Pv.ar Mr. }Reidhead: 

Pursuant to the authority contained in the Foreign Assiutnnce 

Act of 1961, a . rPended, the subject grant, as am.endled, is hereby 

fuithi.r arrendl.d a- follovs: 

1. In th Cover Letter, paragraph 2 - Delete the date 

"Novct.bcr 17, ad . lieu1975 	 rt.!,Stitutc In thercof "January 17, 1976". 

2. In AttaChr, t1L2?, S'l;:L:,T:n vI.Ic:T, second column, - Delete the 

date an1-17-'5"suhstlrut le ]I .t tlert.of "1-17-76"..,d 	 in 

3. Delete the t;-r, "A'tchvcrt 1" and suhstltute in lieu thereof 

the term "Attichin(nt A". 

4. Dclt'eL the t ,.'r s "/,tta.ichpt'nt 2, I' I:VI D UD .T" and In 

AttAchmrent A after C, add "D. E:TI1iA D I,UI ;". 

5. Delct "Att'.(henr 3, 1"cis and CoindirIns" and in lieu 

thereof ubrtJtLteC "Attachrent B, $tandird Prov sIon." dared 10-15-74 

attached hereto. 

6. After 	Attachment B
 

ndd "Attachr.ent C, PAMEN'T PROIVISTON", attached hereto. 

ORIGINAL
 

http:tlert.of


-2-


Please acknowledge receipt of this amendment by signing in the
 

space provided below and returning the original and six" (6) copies,
 

including those stamped "Funds Available". One copy may -be retained
 

for your records.
 

Sierely yours, e 

Geral P. Cold
 
Grant Offico
 
Chief, PIIA Branch 
Central Opera ions Division
 
Office of Contract Management
 

ATTACHMENTS 

ACKNOIZLFDGED 
INSTIlUTE FOR INTERNATIONAL 

DEVEI.OPMLN-'r 1. r 

BY
 

PUNTErlD A,i'- f M- . _ -


I 1 "T 

DATEI---_ F ­



Attachment B
 
10-15-74
 

STANDARD PROVISIONS
 

a. Allowable Costs (Oct. 1974)
 

Only those co.ts shall be attributed to this rant which are
 
rea:ionable, allocable, and allowable in accordance the termu or
with thi.I
 
Grant and Subpart 15.2 of the Federal Procurement Regulations (FPR)

(Princtples and Procedures for use in Cost Reimbursement Type Supply and
 
Reseaich :cntracts withl Coerical Organizations) in effect .on the date
 
of this G. nt.*
 

•-lf this ,rant is made to a university, the applicable cost principles
 
are contained in Federal 'ManagementCircular 73-8 (Cost Principles for
 
Educational Institutions).
 

b. Accountln., AudIt, and Records (Oct. 1974)
 

The Grantee shall s'ubmit to the Grant Officer an annual financial 
statement certified by un independent public accountant. Financial 
records covering all plhtse-1 of the ';rantee'o program, including 
documentation to support entries on the account records and to substantiate 
expnl.t'e., 5h:all be riaintained in accordance with accorunting principles 
gcnerally accepted in the U.S. and consistently applied, and shall be 
available for e:at..Ition by pcr!:o!nt'l ruthor.zed by AID. All such 
flincIal record:; ;1all be T7-1nt.rlned for at lea:st three years after final 
(l~l.ur:seic t of fund-; rncier thio Grant. The Al!) Audtto General and the 
Co:niptro11vr General or thcir duly authori:,ed repre;entative rcesrve the 
rig;ht to coduct an nudit 0c*t1 Grantce's books and records to determine 

t i a",:1 r: . :e Grin e ha,; I r: in, or';a n, exp:nd;d ftnds accordance 
Withi the terr, and conriit 'c;.: of thi'j Grant. 'Ihe Grantee agree's to make 
availabl. atty further infc r'::ation requestea by AID with respect to any 
questions arising as a result of the audit. 

C. Refunds. (Oct. 1974) 

(1) If use of the Grant funds results in accrual of interest to 
the Grantee or to any other person to whom grantee makes such funds 
available In carrying out the purposes of this Grant, Grantee shall refund 
to AID an a.lunt. equivalent to the an-ount of intere;t accrued.
 

(2) Funds obligated hereunder, but not disbursed to the Grantee 
at the time the Grant expires or is terminated, shall revert to AID 
exceTpt for funds encumbered by the Grantee by a legally binding transaction 
applicable to this Grant. Any funds disbursed to but not expended by the 
Gi-.nt~ee ind in the custody of the Grantee at the time of expiration or 
tcrrination of the Grant shall be refunded to AID. 



2
 

(3) If, at the end of the period supported by this Grant, and
 
the end of each sub.-equent pariod if the Grant is extended, AID determines 
that the Grantee has not expended an amount equal to the amount provided
and received under tiiis Grant during such period for costs properly
attributable to this Grant in accordance with its terms az. conditions,
then the Grantee will refund to AID the dlfference between such amount of
funds provided and received and such amount expended for costs properly

attributable to this Grant. 

d. Ineligible Countries (Oct. 1974)
 

Unless oth.rqise approved by the Grant Officer, no Grant funds

will be attri.ated to costs incurred in countries ineligible for 
assistance under the F.oreign Assistance Act of 1961, as amended, or under
 
acts appropriating funds for foreign assistance.
 

e. Eqial jopicrtur.itv (Oct. 1974) 

With roegard to the employment of persons in the U.S. under this

Grant, Grantee agreeis to take all reasonable steps to ensure equality of

opportunity in it,- ci: ployment practices without regard 
 to race, religion,
sex, color, or natiinal origin of such persons; and that, In accordance withTitle Vt of the Civil R!.ghts Act of 1964, when work is performed in the
U.S. no person shall, on the grounds of race, religion, sex, color, or

national orig,in, bC ccIlt:.Cd fret,p"articipationi, be deL-:ed benefits, 
 or
be subjlcttn d to discriufnatlon. In addition, the Grantee agrees to comply,
in accordance with its vritten assurance of withcompliance, the provisions
of Part 20)9 of Chapter Ii, Title 22 of the Code of Federal Regulations,
envitlod "No-Di;crination in Fedcral.ly Assisted Pro raams of the Agency

for International Dev]lopment - Effectuation 
of Title VI of the Civil
 
Rights Act of 1964."
 

f. Termination (Oct. 1974) 

This grant Pmay be terminated in whole c from time to time inpart, by the Grant Officer upon written notice tu the Grantee whenever
 
for any reas;on he !;hall determine that such te,',ination is in the best

interes;t of the_ Cvernrneiit. 
 Upon receipt of and !r:accordance with such
noticC, the ;rCintee shall forthwith take appropriate action .,,rfjnimize
all expenditures and obligations financed by this andGrant shall cancel
such obligation. whenever possible. Except as provided below, no further
rei1,trseri sia.l be made after the effective date of terriinat:ion, and

the Grantee shall, within thirty (30) calendar days after the effective

date of such teri:1in.tion, repay to the Grantor all unexpended portions
of funds theretofore paid by the Grantor to the Grantee which are not
other%,Ise obligated by a legally binding transaction applicable to thisGrant. Should the funds paid by the Grantor to the Grantee prior to theeffective date of the termination of this Grant be insufficient to cover
 

1', 

http:Fedcral.ly
http:ccIlt:.Cd


3
 

the Crantef."s obligt!ons p-mnuant to the aforementioned legally binding
tranFactiln, the 'r.,t..!e fiay submit to the Grantor within ninety (90)
calendar days After the effective date of such termination a written claim
 
covering :iiclh obligitions and, subject to the limitatiorvs contained ill
 
this Crart, the Crantor shall determine the amount or amounto to be paid

by the Giantor to the Grantee urder such claimt.
 

g. OfficiWl:; Nor To -Benrftt (Oct. 1974) 

N.~oc:'.,et of or delegate 1o Con ;ress or 
resident commissioner
 
sLhall be ,dritted to any !share or part of this Cr;ait 
or to any benefit
 
that may arise thc-refrorm; but thin provision shall not be construed to
 
extend to thl.:; Grant if r'.i: with a corporation for its general bentfit.
 

h. Co.'n,,nt Aeai:nr!t runt.eit_ ees (Oct. 1974) 

The Grantee w:rrant9 that no person or selling agency has been
 
employed or rot;:i;:od to u;.))JcIt or necure thi Grant 
 upon an agreement or 
understanlinf- for .1 cor-':luion, e-ccntar-e, hrolera?.e, or contingent fee, 
except bona I d ci:.ploye..c: or bon.- fide :L;tjhlJ.hed cc'.-.;rcial or selling
Jg(:ncie' we Ii t.: :cl by thr, Gra~ti',tO,.ui- the purpote of :ccurtiqg bu:;iness. 
For b-eac;l Or vi l.'. 1:1 of t:!-± -:r1 , ,A11 lha 1 have the right to
 
canccl thit': 
 1,ant '..iJt11oj lI..hi I..r, or In iti; di',crctton to deduct
 
fror. the Ci.:nt a:-nunt, or crl: - c rccovc;, t!.,,full amount of each
 
comwris:;Icn, p'rcer.tdgc, 
 brokerpc, or continenrit. fee. 

i. .A' !'._i- (Oct.,- 1974) 

Ilhe (;rant A,rett.,unt r.av be arnended by fonal moc1l fIcat ions to
 
the basic ;rant docer.tint or b', :ans of ain exchange of letters between
 
the AID Gratt Off'-.*ir and ,inapproprinte oflictal of the Grantee. 

J. Gr,.t; I IrL,..-, t . 1974).A' (,)ct 

The !t .,r t. th 
 C,rantc sign.d by the Cranr Officer, the
 
Purpose and Ijo:1- .n ,,t (i: J Ct; *t, the 
 SPtanidcard Provision!, and the
 
'ayucnt P'rovJ..v;.s, al1 of w1;ich hive been reviewed and agreed to by the
 
Gratitee, con ;iutLe L.;e (Crant. AgrCeent. 

k. ':otirc:. (Oct. 1974) 

Any ,,orice 1;iven by any of the parties hereunder, shall be
sufficient only if In sr~tng and delivered in per.on or sent by
telegraph, cable, rep.1stl.red or regular tnail .as follows: 

TO T1IL: Cc';nJz.;t AID Grant Officer 

TO (;:'11.1: At (;r.,ntee( address shown in thit Grant, or to
suclh otlh:r adJi(..;,; :!.citi:t. of quch parties ,oh.ill designate by notIce 
given ;t:;herein rc uirced. Notices hcreunder, shall be effective when 
delivered in accorda-.c.e with this clause or on the effective date of the 
r tice, whichever i!. later. 

http:Gra~ti',tO,.ui


1. Procurement of Equipment, Vehicles, Supplies, Materials, and 
Services. 

(1) Except as may be specifically approved or directed in
advance by the Grant Officer, or as provided in paragraphs (2), or (3),or (4) below, all equipment, vehicles, aterials, supplies, and services,
the costs of which are to be attributed to this Grant and which will befinanced with United States dollars, shall be purchased in and shipped
from the United States. In addition, 
 for any U.S. purchase transactionin excess of $2,500, the Grantee shall notify the seller that the item(s)
must be of U.S. source and production and comply with the componentrylimitations and other requirements applicable to suppliers under
Regulation 1; and that the supplier 

AID
 
must execute and furnish Form AID"Suppliers Certificate and Agreement with 

282 
the Agency for International
 

Deve.lopment."
 

(2) Exceptions to the foregoing are as follows (for Title X-

Grants only):
 

Grantee may permit a subgrantee (or the Grantee on his
behalf) to procure commodities already in its country (with the exceptionof contraceptives, drug products, pharamaceuticals, and motor vehicles)
in an amount not exceeding a total cost of $5,000 per 
 subgrantee perannum without regard to limitations, rules, and procedures applicable to
coimodity transactions financed by AID, Such commodities shall not beconsidered "already in its country" within the meaning of the aforementionedexception if the coiiodities have been imported or otherwise brought intothe country at the request of the Grantee or subgrantee. A subgrantee'sown country for this purpose shall in eventno include any of the following:
Australia, Austria, Belgiun, Canada, Denmark, France, Germany, Spain,
Italy, Japan, Lumxoebourg, Monaco, Netherlands, New Zealand, Norway, South

Africa, Sweden, Si,,itverland and United 
Kingdom. The Grantee shall takeall reasonable precautlons ensureto that the subgrantee does not procureany coUmr:odity which has as its country of ori' n any of the followingcountries: Albania, Bulgaria, China (Mainand and other Connuni st-controlledareas), including Manchuria, Inner Monogolia, the provinces of Tsinghai
and Sikang, Sinkiang, Tibet, and former 
Kwantung Leased Territory, the
 
present Port Arthur Naval 
 Base Areas, and Liaoning Province, Cuba,German Democratic Republic, Hungary, North Korea, North 

the 
Vietnam, OuterMongolia, Poland, Rum.ania, and the. Union of Soviet Socialist Republics. 

(3) Printed or audio visual teaching materials may, to theextent necessary, be purchased outside the United States when: 

(a) Effective use of the materials depends on their being

in the local language, and 

(b) 
Other funds including U.S. owned and controlled local
currencies are not readily av4ilable for procurement of such material.
 



page 2 of
 

The order of preference as 
to countries in which such purchases outside
the United States arc ma.tde shall be: 

1 The AID receiving country.
 

2 Countries ailling within AID Geographic Code 901. 

3 Other countries falling within AID Geographic Code 899.
 

AID Geographic 
 Codes are cl1fIined in., PR 7-6.5201.1. 

(4) Procurements In the country in which an activity Is beingundertaken, and which are less than $2,500, and are for ateria.s (regularlyavailable and normally sold on the local market) which or e:-pendud diring the purlodl of th; , grant, 
are to be consumed 

are exempt from the conditionsc;f aragraph (1) zdrov.., pr vTJlh.d tit the ori n of such materialsSuppJ i : fad the co1:;,::cn parLe the reof Is,; a 
and 

froe world country as

described i- All) Geograiphlic Coc> 935.
 

(5) All i.n.er... .r .ide by the Grantee, thecost!; of which are to be tri ,ute.d to h iti Grant, shall be on 
-t made U.S.flag carrier unlc; . : iJr:cirit would, In the judgerient of the Gran tee, bedelayed an un re:i :ivaltn., a carricr, eithert: r U.S. at the pointof origin or tr':,:a;h.l. :;;ic, provi.d..d tli.t tl.o (;Ia'tc.c certifJes to the
factL; in the do cu:. 
 .a-tsrora/n.c o!:; p:.rt o h.; Craut records for postaudit by AlP. All in.terat Ob'a1 .l; made by the'lt i:n:,] Grantee, thecosts u hiclh .art L ttr,- -0hich nrt .. . ' :LoL-lJ be made onfl .g v'e::;.~.~';Ir. V.or,': U.S.

-S.
" . vii:,.!.] ,; aro nt:. a%,aJiA l, le, or their use ... c:,U±IL in i delay, the Gran.tee n'i obtain a. releasefrom this- rf-t , .......ro..-,nt Llic -. in.porta -ion Suoport Division, Offi.ce ofCommodity Lin.. .:nr. , A[l), laD;iingtou, O.C. 2052', as appropriate, giving

the h.,s for L.- )cquu!;t.
 

(6) "lhe (;raote Sh.1ha obtain co:::;,,.ti t Ion to the maximum extentpossible for any procureo:int tlhe cost of which i!; to be attributed to thisGrant. Procurer., t b h tL (;rtil ee: l;' Olit con.-J.der. 11on of iore than onesource mu5.t !w :qi', rov'd by the Grant Ofic .r. In no event wJll anyprocure.ent h: on a co:;t-i) c1-a-pec.u.:.s,(.-ofco.,t ha:;is. The Grantoeeshall take all rc:1..o:.,)le ste:.c ncce,;.avy to insure that subgrantcesprocurin , in :icror!:;,c i."'r:m ;p:' (') OhlLrin cor:petftion to the extentpossi e. In ;(Iditiou o tle for ,:gol!;-, f,.,r b:,.e,; mad In the UnitedState,;, th(? Co!;L of ..'!iicli ; to hi,. .tt:'!ba .'. to t hif; Grant, the Granteeshall culply v.'ith tl o]llc" 'tr,, rn : 1.. ,tU.:-:'.1 rt AID In accordancewith the .;riaj 1 P ;Jne:;, I'rov";i-:m; of thr. :hr o]cu'Itv Act, to giveLin Ited tE Lt,-v ; : A I1 2t:,1ir, T, firm.!'; nn lor.t i Vy to :;articipate inisupplying ro.:..:. ,,t e 1:!.. SO ,'ICeC. procured- vii,,or thi; (;rant, the Grantee,shall, to the1 %:::x×muI extent po::;!!. le, pro'vide the follo-','Ing Informationto the Office of Sir-ill IJusJns;, AID, Whf D.C.Jittmgton, 20523 at least45 davs prior to p,].m' ,,g anv. 'cLr or rontract Irin exLOIs of Five Thousand($5,000) eolar:.,except whore a short.or time Is r(quested of, and granted
by the Office of Small Business: 

eWr
 

http:short.or
http:co:::;,,.ti


page 3 of
 

(a) Brief general description and quantity of commodities
 
or services.
 

(b) Closing date for receiving quotations or bids.
 

(c) Address whore lnvitations or specifications a.y be 
obtained. 

(7) Funds provldcud under this Crant shrill. not br used to procure 
any cormnodity or co-:,(-diy-r4lat- .rvJce.; furnishvd by nny supplier whose 
nanic appears on tl-e L ist of iS :.-i,1."~SupI ers of Cc :..i;:o tti c; plul± :; und 1,r All) legtlation 8,andI C.: .rm.;' ".c , .~.l rc o"Slpplof er ies 

9 
Cc-wo2i '1.6'L'L.*r:("!,-)'--,,.!Ii.tc:, Services Ineligible for 

AID Finaicing," publi:shud ,.0orthly by AID. Crantcc q{.rees to review1 said 
list prior to undertl-ing any procuro,".rit the cost of which is to be 
attributed to this Grant. All) wi)l pruvide (/raItce. With this list. 

9/1 

http:1.6'L'L.*r:("!,-)'--,,.!Ii.tc


Salaries (Oct. 1974)
 

All salaries, wnges, feen, and stipends, the costs of which will
 
be attributed LO this Grant, shall be paid in accordance with the Cranteets
usual policy a;nd practice as reviewed and approved in writing by the Grant 
Officer. In the absence of an ihpproved policy, costs of salaries, wages,
fees, and stipends shall be attributed to this Grant in accordance with
Subpart 7-]5.205-6 of the Agency for International Devlopment Procurement 
Regulat ion; (AIDPR) 



n. International-Travel and Allowances (Oct. 1974)
 

International travel and allowances, the costs of which are 
to 
be attributed to this Grant, shall be undertaken in accordance with the 
policy and practice of thc Grantee, a reviewed and approved by the Grant 
Officer. In thc absence of an approved policy, the Grantee shall follow the 
regulations contained in the Federal Travel Regulations (FTR). 



0. Excess ot Near-Excess Forei&n Currency (Oct. 1974)
 

All expenditures of the Grantee in excess or near excess currency

countries, including per diem (subsistence) expenses, which will beattributed to this Grant, shall be funded from U.S.-owned foreign currency,
unless otherwise authorized in writing; by the Grant Officer. The conversionof U.S. dollars for foreign currcnclen; shall be made by the Grantee either 
through the U.S. Treasury Department in Washington, D.C., the U.S.
 
Disbursing Officer, U.S. Ebassy, or the USAID Mission Controller, unless 
otherwise authorized in writing by the Grant Officer. 

2)0
 



p. Subordinate Agreements (Oct. 1974)
 

The placemenf of subordinate agreements, (e.g. leases, options,
etc.) grants, or contracts with other organizations, firms, or institutions;
and the provition: of such subordinate greements are subject 
to prior
written consent of the Crant Officer if they will result in costs whichwill be attributed to thii Grant. In no event .hall any such subordinate
agreement, grant, 
or contract tc on a cost-plu-a-percentag-of-cost basis.
Subordinate contractors (including suppliers) shall be selected on a
competitive basis 
to the maximum practicable extent. consibtent with the 
obligations and requirements of this Grant. 

3'
 



q. Subgrantee Audit and Records (Oct. 1974)
 

(1) The Grantee shall require uubgrantees to maintain books,

records, documents and other evidence and accounting procedures and
 
practices sufficient to rt-flect properly that any funds provided by the
Grantee were expencded e::clusively fcr the purposes of the subgrant. Such

records shall be inaintained 
 for three yea,rs following the expiration of
 
the subgrant.
 

(2) The Grantee shall. ensure that after each twelve months of 
a subgrant an audit is conducted on the subgrantee's records by an independent

public accountant with a national certification similar or equivalent to 
a certified public accountant. If the Graiutce determines that an audit
is not possible or feasible he shall -ubiit to the Grant Officer the 
reasons ,)hy sv:ch adi t is not pojsibie or feasible, and present for the

apprval of the ;r.:rt Officcr alt,'rriariv'es whi c:ili achieve the

object'ive --;(' fort in 
 this Gene il >rovisiun. The Grantee shall include
in each suh-ranl- heictinder a clause by w;hich the Grantee asserts the right

to audit if the ilrdC,,eiident 
 ad!t o-. not take place or is unacceptable.
The Grantee Sh;all al:,o r,.quir* that the subgrantec shall make available 
any further Inform.ation a:- requesteJ by the G'antee with respect to 
(Ito;tstons concernin, the a.udit. The report of independent audit shall besubinittud to the Grirx.teCO and reti;nc:d i,y hiu !jt accordance with theGeneral Provision entitled "Accouratiu.:, Audit, and Records." 

(3) Th.? purpose of tile audit Dhall be to determine the propriety
and necessity of the !;ubgraiitee's expeniditures in terms of the purposes for
which the fund.; were nade available, and to determine the adequacy of the 
subgrantee's financial management. 



r. Title To and Use of Property (Oct. 1974)
 

Title to all property purchased with funds to be attributed to 
this Grant shall vest in the Grantee, subject to the following conditions: 

(1) The Grantee shall not, under any Government contract or

subcontract thereunder, or any Government grant, charge for any commodities,
depreciation, amortizatiom, or use of any property title to which remains
 
in the Grantee under the clause. 

(2) The Grantee agrees to use and maintain the property for the 
purposes of the Grant. 

(3) With respect to items having an acquisition cost of $1,000
 
or more, title to which vests in the Grantee, the Grantee agrees:
 

(a) to report such items to the Grant Officer from time
 
to time as they are acquired and to maintain a control system which will
 
permit their ready identification and location.
 

(b) 
to transfer title to any such items to the Government
 
in accordance with any written request therefor issued by the Grant 
Officer at any tivie prior to final paymnent under the Grant. 

Exceptions to this clause will be as approved by the Grant Officer.
 



General SupportAttachment C 

10-15-74 

PAYMENT PROVISION
 

Pgriodic Grant Disbursement 

Each -*nth, Grantee will submit to AID's Office of Financial
 
,-annjomunt, Voucher Form SF 1034 (original) and SF 1034-A, three copies,


"' voucher identified by the appropriate grant number, in the amount
 
S i'ated,.
cash needs for the following month. The voucher shall be
 

supported by 
in original and two copies of a report rendered as follows: 

Ai.ount of Grant 
 $ xxx
1Ixiended this period $ xxx
 
1.xpended to date 
 $ xxx 
.Advaces to subgrantees (if any) $ Xxx 

I I[c~atod expenditures
 
next month (dates) 
 $ xxx 

-.ash received to date 
 $ xxx 
'!,h required next month 
 $ xxx 

-h
report shall include a certification as follows:
 

"'fl.e undersigned hereby certifies: (1) that the above represents the best 
(4.L~mates of funds needed for expenditures to be incurred over the period
descrihd, (2) that appropriate refund or credit to the grant will be made 
;omthe event funds are not expended, (3)that appropriate refund will be
,.ide in the event of disallowance in accordance with the terms of this 

8r:mr., and (4)that nny interest accrued on the funds made available herein
 
'l be refunded to AID.
 

i_ ;1,[:
___DATE
 

3t
 



- -

) DEPAF'TMENT OF STATE
 
AGENCY FOR INTERNATIONAL DEVELOPMENT 

WAfSHINGTUN. D.C. 20$21 UHIINAL 

Mr. Paris W. Reidhead
 
Director
 
Institute for International
 
Development, Inc. DEC 2 0 74 

8150 Leesburg Pike, Suite 504 
Vienna, Virginia 22180 

Subject: 	Grant AID/csd-3*05, Amendment No. 3
 
PIO/T 932-13-950-034-73-3255017
 

Dear Mr. Reidhead:
 

Pursuant to the authority contained in the Foreign Assistance Act of
 
1961, as amended, A.I.D. hereby grants to the Institute for International 
Ylevelopment, Inc., an additional sum of One Hundred Thousand Dollars 
($.00,ooo). 

This grant Is effective upon signatutre of the Crant Officer and applies 
to coSts incurred during the period from November 18, 1974 to 
November 17, 1975. This raises the total amount obligated to $300,000.
 

The subject 'rant, as amended, is hereby further amended as follows:
 

1. On the Cover Ltt:-, paragraph 2, delete the dute "November 17, 1974" 
and substitute in li' ti.ereof "November 17, 1975". 

2. In Attachmc -,MATED BUDGET ­

a. Delete -udget shown in Item I. Budget, and substituto in lieu
 
thereof the fol. .wing:
 

"I. BUDGET 	 P1m: 8/18/72 F1: 11/18/74 Total 
To: 11/17/74 To: 11/17/75 

1. Salaries and Benefits $358,903 $230,000 $588,903
 
2. Travel 
 74,069 76,000 150,470
 
3. Rent-Services and Equipment 41,069 27,000 68,069
 
4. Utilities and Office Expenses 43,601 41,000 84,601
 
5. Professional Services J 1,400 	 2,000 3,400
 
6. Promotion Expenses 	 - 12,000 
 15,000
 
7. Contingencies 	 ­

$522,443 $388,000 $910,443
 

b. In paragraph II, BUDGET PROVISIONS, sub-paragraph A., delete the
 
figure "$200,000" from the first sentence and substitute in lieu thereof
 
"$300,000". 

ORIGINAL
 



2 Mr. Paris W. Reidhead 


c. In paragraph II, BUDGET PROVISIONS, sub-paragraph A., delete the
 
figure "$517,000" from the second sentence and substitute in lieu
 
thereof "$610.443'.
 

Please acknowledge receipt of this amendment by signing in the space

provided below, nnd returning the original and six (6) copies, including
 
the two stmped "Funds Obligated", to my office. One copy may be
 
retained for your records.
 

Si cerely yours,
 

erald P. C 1
 
Grant Offi
 
Chief, P Branch
 

Central Operations Division
 
Office of Contract Management
 

: rkBYO a: 

TYPED N Alfred A. Whittakar
 

TITLE: Executive Director
 

DATE: January 23, 1975
 

FUNDS OBLIGATED
 

Ipprop. No. ?Z'-.t/_ iY_2-----­

ob. o._W,9._oTobj.c. .
Asowit$/D, &.----------


FM/CSD
 
By -------------- ate---­



(SEP!-


DEPARTMENT OF STATE .9 
AGENCY FOR INTERNATIONAL DEVELOPMENT 

WASHINOTON. O.C. 80513 

Mfr. Paris W. Reidhead 
Director
 
Institute for International Development, Inc.
 
8150 Leesburg Pike
 
Suite 501
 
Vienna, Virginia 221B0 

Subject: AID/csd-3705, Amendment No. 2
 

Dear Mr. Reldhead:
 

Pursuant to the authority contained in the Foreign Assistance Act of
 
1961, as amended, the subject grant, as amended, is 
 hereby further
 
amended as follows:
 

1. On the Cover Letter, paragraph 2 - Delett, the date "August 17,
 
1974" and substitute in lieu thereof "November 17, 1974".
 

2. In Attachment 2 - ESTLATED BUDGET, in the second column
 
delete the date"8/17/74" and substitute in lieu thereof "Ui/17/74".
 

Please acknowledge rereipt of this amendment by signing in the space
 
provided below and returning the original to this office.
 

Sincerely yours, 

Gerald P.d 

Grant Officer
 
Chief, PHA Branch
 
Central Operations Division
 
Office of Contract Management
 

ACMiO:LEDGED:
 

TYPE NAME saris W. Reidhead 

TIL Director General
 

DAT September 20, 1974
 

37 



DEPARTMENT OF STATE ORIGINAL 
AGENCY FOR INTERNATIONAL DEVELOPMENT 

WASHINGTON 

ND0!LAED 

Approp. No.72-_ // L/ 

,r,. -------­1r. Paris W. ReidheadDirector Amnt0 to@4SOAWo uit n o -Obj ci '-' --- -
Institute for International - - P oj.- - "--- ---- - - -........ 

Development, Inc. 
1901 . 

Rosslyn, 
l'oore Street 
Virgiria 22209 

By FM/CSD 
.. Date3 y.'2 

/ 

Subject: 	 Grant !1o. AID/c;1-3705 
Amendment !!o. 1Ref.: PIC/- 93.-13-950-03473­

3245004 

Dear Mr. Roidhead: 

.Pursuant to the authority contained 	in the Foreign Assistance 

Act of 1961, as amended, the Agency for International Development
 

hereby grants to the Institute for International Development, Inc.
 

an additional sum of One Hundred Thousand Dollars ($100,000).
 

This grant is effective upon signature by the Grant Officer and
 

applies to costs incurred during the period August 18, 1973 through 

August 17, 1974.
 

The Subject Grant is hereby amended as follows:
 

1. On the Cover Letter, paragraph 2 - Delete the date 

"August 17, 1973" and substitute in lieu thereof "August 17, 1974". 

2. In Attachment 2, ESTL ,ATED BUDGET ­

a. Delete the Budget shcwi in item I. Budget, and 

substitute in lieu thereof the followring:
 

;2
 



-2­

"I. BUDGET 	 F: 8/18/72 8/18/73 TOTAL 
To: 	 8/17/73 8/17/74 

1. 	 Salaries and Benefits $179,000 $230,000 $409,000 

2. 	Travel 46,500 76,000 122,500 

3. 	Rent - Services and
 
Equipment 20,500 27,000 47,500
 

4. 	Utilities and Office 
Expenses 42,000 41,000 83,000 

5. 	Professional Services 3,000 2,000 5,000 

6. 	Promotion Expenses 28,000 12,000 40,000 

7. 	Contigencies 10.000 ---
 10,000 
$329,000 $388,O00 $717,000
 

b. In paragraph II, BUDET PROVISIO;,S, subparagraph A., delete 

the figure "$100,000" from the first sentence and substitute in lieu 

thereof "$200,000."
 

c. 
In paragraph II, BUDGET PROVISION1S, subparagraph A., delete
 

the figure "$29,000" from the second sentence and substitute in lieu
 

thereof "517,000".
 



-3-

Please acknowledge receipt of this amendment by signing
 

in the space provided below, and returning the original and six (6)
 

copies to my office.
 

Sincerely yours,
 

SGerald P. Go
 
Grant Offic 
PItA Branch 
Central Operations Division
 
Office of Contract Management 

ACKN0WL. GF: 

BY:.
 

TYPED IWAE: Pris Reidhc-d
 

TITLE: Director (Cn'rA]


SP V 1973 
DATE: 



D---PART'1,EI-.'T ST ORIGINALOF- STATE 

AGENCY FOR INTERNATIONAL D[VEL.OPtENT r 
WASHINGTON. D.C. 2C$Z3 OLr 7 ? 

Mr. Paris W. Reidhead 
Director Gencral 
Institute for International Dovelopment, Inc. 
10901 North .',oore Street 
Resslyn, VTrginia 22209 

Subject: Grant No. AID/c'd-3705

PIO/T No. 932-13-950­
034-73-3235004
 

Dear Mr. Rcidhead: 

Pursuant to the Foreign Assistance Act of 1961, as amnded, theAgency for iPnernatioral Dcelornent, (he"-inafter r'efrrej to as "A.I.D,'' >'r.b' grants to the In .... e fcr Internaticna.Develo,. .2n-', ine. (h.-i.:tr rer.d to a-- "!ID11" an-ICr the­
"Grant ") , th- zum c' One ,.un.red Thcusand Dollars ($cOoO) underthe subject vrz.nt to 4C serveioJln "nn^r, 

"n 'dcr I-'itI to a3 a catalyst to.. ' -l-".4-oc 

in lesz ,e.'i,: countries, as means of fostering locally n.edr. .anacad y cine.d andand 

Th4.s Isi.,i:. 
ve .ipon signature by .h. Grant.0fficor (AID) and
the Or,-,ree's authori 7ed reoresentatve 
 nd shall aply to costs incurred
in imple-menting the activities supported by the IIDI Budget during the
P"Icd .u 3, ~ throuh ,ugust 1?, 1973. 

This grant consists of this letter and its attachments and is made

to IM) on the condition that your organizati n shall administer thefunds in c..rdanc - .th all f-'ovi.ion- of this gr.ant as containedin the Prograr D2-crip ion, h. 2ud. t, and the Terns and Conditions 
attached hereto and made a part hereof. " 

Please zign the cricinal and al! copies in the space below to acknowledge
your under3tanding of the conditions under which these funds have been
granted. 
The original and 5 signed copies of this letter and all attachments,
 

. M-, J J J'­

rL 



-2­

plus one signed copy of the Statemedt of Assurance of Compliance 
should be returned to this offIco. 

Grant GffMcer
 
Contract Services Division
 
Office of Contract Nanaienert
 

Attachronts i
 

1. Program Description
 
2. Bud-get
 
3. Terms and Conditions
 
4. Statement of Assurance of Compliance
 

ACK:O.IZ,[ D :
 

B 

FUO1DS AVAILABLIF 

~3/
ProJO'­

Fro~~~eN---- :t --- .5/...----- '"------_-

,A. ...• ~ .,.'_- - .'. - - a--'".&" 

By A.. . .-. .. ... 

http:ACK:O.IZ


ATTAC":'TNT 1 

PRCCRAMi_ DI'SZRIPTICN 

A. OBJETIVE 

I. The objective of this grant is to provido on a general support
 

basis a portion of the funds required to support tho Grantee's program
 

of locating, familiarizing and oncouraging U.S. buninessmen to 
invest
 

in small'and mcdiu size business opportunities located In less developec
 

countries (LDC's).
 

B. SCOPE 07 C%\:T REL\TED ACTIVITIES 

1. 
IIDI functioning as a private non-profit organization, des.gned
 

to serve 
as a catalyst to join potontial U.S. Investors with viable
 

business opportunities In loss developed countries, will perform
 

certait, supportive fuct.ions which s'hall Include but not be limited Lo
 

the fo]lowlng:
 

a.* Screen and evaluate incoming requests and reco:nnendations
 

..for*: projqcts *n:.olvlnG.a. ousiness-enterprise .-In
a LEC; with.particula.
 

b.p!':.s13 on solectin,a projects havtn£ a .­,ooi e..iploy~ient enerattnr
 

potential.
 

b. 
Locate and Infor,, a qualified U.S. investor of the proposed
 

business opportunity.
 

c. 
Assist potential Investorc In making on-site feasibility
 

surveys throu-:h the utilization of IIDI's staff,6oourcos, domostic
 

and overseas'contacts.
 

d. Through IIDI's do-estic and overseas contacts acquiro, 

organIo, and Inturprot key Infor-natlon concerning invest.nont opportunitlcs 

that would bo if Intoreat to U.S. busi,,os;xen. 



es 
 Provide advice, background information, specialized
 

Instruction and related expertise, as required during the various stages
 

of establishing a business enterprise in a LDC.
 

f. AssiSt the U.S. business enterprise In the location and
 

placement of qualified personnel required to 
Implement the objectives
 

of a ID business enterprise.
 

g. Arrange for pre-employnent orientation and guidance
 

applicable to the geographic area and type of work the prospective
 

employee will be expected to perform.
 

2. In the perfornance of the above stated activities and other
 

related tasks IIDI will not make busfness decisions, operate a business
 

enterprise, contribute or Invest its funds in any organization that
 

has been assisted under the terms and conditions of this grant. 
 Further­

more, IIDI shall not derive any Income from fees for-the services
 

provi1ded under this grant, but the businessmen investing in IIDI
 

appro~ed 133C pro~octs wil1 be as;ed to agree to the -£Qliowingz 

a. Tralh local cLtizens.to operate the business.
 

b. Pro ,ote local citizens as rapidly as possible.
 

c. Establish a profit sharin& plan and as soon as possible
 

a share purchase plan.
 

d. 
Sell all U.S. interest to local citizens when long-term 

loans are ropnid and the Investor has obtained a.ieasonable return on
 

his investment.
 

e. EncouraGe U.S.'bustnessmen to use at least a part of thb 

ropaid capital and profits to establish another project In a devol6ptng 

country.
 

-2­

4JL. 

http:cLtizens.to


C. PROGRAM CCCRDI'ATIO' AND R'lATIONSHIS 

1. The Grant Manager in PHA/PVC and the AID I'llssion or U.S.
 

Embassy located in the LDO involved will be kept informed of any
 

projected feasibility surveys, as well as planned or actual investments
 

to be made In the country conoerned.
 

2. Wherever possible IIDI will coordinate its activities with and 

wor% through local institutions promoting small business investment.
 

3. The Grantee will consult as requested with AID/d and USAID/
 

Embassy officials on matters directly related to-the grant objectives.
 

The Grantee is also responsible for obtaInInS or insuring that the U.S.
 

business enterprise obtains appropriate cooperat~ns./qountry clearances. Liaison
 

with cooperating country officials and other local nationals will be
 

the responsibility of Grantee or his U.S. business associate,
 

. The Grantee will conduct Its overseas activities without
 

recourse to USAIDs or E.ibassles for administrative or 1bistlc support..
 

5.. The Grant a.waaer ?i,/?;' will be the pr.c1jil lalsona offlcla 

in AID/.: for :-tters ,'Irectly related to the Grantee's pro-ra. ; The 

Zrant "Cff!cer will be cohsulted on administrative' atters pertin.ent 

to the Grant's terns and conditions.
 

-3­



AVTACHK2NT 2
 

INSTITUTL FOR INTSMrATIONAL DrVELOPiENT, INC. 

ESTIMAT'D BUDG3T 

For 12 months ending Aueust 17, 1973
 

I. 	BUDCe'
 

1. 3a0arles and Benefits 	 $179,01i
 

2. 	Travel 46,500
 

3. 	 Rent-Services arx Equtp:.iont 20,500 

4. 	Utilities and Office Exponses 42,000
 

5. 	Professional Services (Legal and
 
A.'couhting) 3M000
 

6. 	 Promotion Expenses 28,000 

7. 	Contingencies 10,000
 

-TOTAL $329,040
 

A. The ubove line Item budget i8 based on a iaximu.m 

c-tribution of A.I.D. -rant fun.s of ,*100,000. The renaininC portion 

of this estimated buleet, anounting to $229,000, will be funded from 

t)-e Crantee's private fune. N.)tWtt:.stanthInZ the estl-.ated viount 

of the above budgot it Is iutually awread t3 that tho Crantee will
 

expond a mininum of 2 of.his privately funled dollars f-r every 1
 

A.I.D. funded dollar,
 

B, Within the total a'nount of this Crant, the Crantoe nay
 

adjust the lino Itei aiounts sh'awn In the above Esttraated Budget as
 

-I­



reasonable and necOsary In support of the Progra.m rescription.
 

C. A.I.D. grant funds will be usod primarily to partially 

fund salaries of staff, travel expenses, rent, procure'ient of equipment, 

services and other items required tn support staff operations, 

D. All expenditures under the above estimated budget for which
 

A.I.D. funds are used, must be for items that are doternined to be 

reasonable, allowable and allocable costs In accordance with the principles 

set forth In sub-part 1-15.2 of the Federal Procurement Regulations.
 

E; Disbursement of funds will be In accordance withArticle II
 

of Attachent 3, and the 2 to 1 ratio of expenditures shall apply
 

thereto.
 

-2­



ATTACHMINT 3 

TERMS AND CONDITIONS 

ARTICLE I - ALLOWABLE COSTS 

The Grantee shall be reimbursed for direct costs incurred in imple­

menting the programs supported by the Budget contained in Attachment 2 

provided such costs are incurred in accordance with the terms and 

conditions of this grant, including the attached Budget, and are determined
 

to be allowable in accordance with the principles set forth in sub-part 

11-15.2 of the Federal Procurement Regulations, as in effect as of the date
 

of this grant. 

ARTICLE II - DISBURSEMNT OF FUNDS AND FISCAL REPORTS 

A.I.D. will disburse funds promptly to Grantee, on a reimbursement
 

basis, under the following procedure:
 

A precondition to the disbursement of any funds to the Grantee
 

is that the Grantee expend, during each period for which he seeks reimbursement,
 

a minimum of two (2) of his privately funded dollars for every one (1) AID
 

funded dollar. 

The Grantee will submit monthly to the Office of the Controller,
 

A.I.D., Voucher Form 1034 (original) and three copies of Voucher Form 1034(a),
 

properly executed, totalling Grantee's expenditures during the period covered
 

for which reimbursement hereunder is ought, together with an original and
 

two copies of a certified fiscal report rendered by the Grantee in a form
 

and manner satisfactory to A.I.D. substantially as follows:
 

Project: 
 A.I.D. Grant to IIDI - Period: 8/18/72-8/17/73 

Total Contributions to Total Budget from:
 
Budgeted Granteo Expenditures A.T.D. Expenditures
Caterory Amount To Date This Period To Date This Peric. 

$$ . .$_$_____ $ 

$__ 
tL(', 



ATrACIDIENT 3 

The fiscal rep6rt shall include a certification cirncd by an .uthorizcd 

roprosentative of tho Granteo as follows, 

"Tho undorsipicd hereby certifios: (1) that pa'yptent of 

the sum claimed under the voucber is proper and due under
 

the terms of the grantl and (2) that the infornation on
 

the fiscal report is correct and such detailed supporting
 

information as A.I.D, may require will be furnished by
 

the Grantee promptly to A.I.D. upon request.
 

BY-


TITLE
 

DATE
 

An original and two copies of a final fiscal report shall be submitted
 

to the Office of the Controller, A.I.D., within 90 days of tha end of the
 

calendar quarter in which the period for which t~h. grant was nade ends. The 

final fiscal report shall.also be accompanicd by.an original and three (3) 

copies of SF-1034 and SF-1034(a), marked "Final Vcucher". 

The partie3 agree that, if after revieviine the fiscal reports or other 

cost data, it is determined by the Grant Officer that fund4 provided under 

the granL have been expended for purposes not in accordance with the terns
 

of the Grant, the Grantee will, refund such amounts as directed by the Grant
 

Officer.
 

ARTICLE III - EXAMINATION OF HECORDS 

A. The Granteo shall maintain books, records, docubnonts, and other 

ovidonce and a9counting proceduro and practicos, ,nufficiont to rofloct 

C,
 



3 ATTACLX'iNN 


properly. all dirvct and Iudicct c,0.t. of whatcvor rtature clai ed to havo 

been incurrod and anticipatcd to be incurrcd for the lAerformance of this
 
Gra nt. The forcuoaiuI constitute "rocords" for the pir~uosc of this clause.
 

B. Tho Grantee acrces that tho Controller, A.I.L., ,4., the Comptroller 

Ceneral of the United !;tatvs or any of their duly authozrit-ed roproseutatives
 

uhall, until expiration of .- payment under this grant,
3 years fter final or
 

of the time.periods for tho particular records specifld in Fart 1-20 of tho
 

Federal Protu'cncnt 1cGulations CFR Port 1-20),
(41 whichever expires earlier, 

have access to.and the rlezht to examinc any directly pertinent books, docur.ents, 

papc-s, and records of the Grantee Involving transactions related to this grant. 

C. T11o Grantee further agrees to include in all its subordinate
 

arecments hcreurder a provision to the 
effect that the subordinate contractor 

aipees that the Controller, A.I.D., and the Comptroller General-of the United 

States or any of their duly authorized representatives shall, until oxpiraticn 

of 3 years after final payment unler the subordinate agreement, or of the 

tine specified in Fart 1-20 (41 C!.R P 'rt 1-20), whichever expires earrllev, 

havc access to and the right to exanino any dtrectly pertinent books,
 

docu.-cnts, papers, 
 and records of such subordinate contractor, involving
 

transactions related 
to the subordinate agreenent. The term "subordinate
 

arcemont" as usr.d in this clause excludes (1) purchase orders 
not oxceeding
 

$2,500 and (2)subcnntracts or purchaso ordcr- for public utility scrvicos
 

-at ratcn e-tabJishcI for uniform app]icability to tbo general public. 

AiM', I V - T r1V!.ATTOI11

Thiz j;r:,:nt may bo to"-ninatcd at any timo, in wholo or .in part, by tho 

3­



A r --AC F.;,I :3 

Grant Officer upon written notice to the Crantce whencver for any rcason 

he shall doternine that such termination is in the bost interest of the 

Covernment. Upon receipt of and in accordance stith such notice, the 

Grantee shall forthwith take appropriate action to minimize all ex-penditures 

and obligations financed by this Grant, and shall cancel such obligations 

whenever possible. Rxcept as - ovided below, no reinbursemcnt shall be 

made to the Grantee for costs incurred after receipt of such notice.
 

Within ninety (90) days after the effectivo dato of such notice of 

termination, the Grantee shall submit his final. claim for reinbursement 

of costs iicurred for obligations which were in effect but could not be 

cancelled as of the effective date of such termination.. Subject to the 

linitations contained in the grant, the A.I.D. Grant Officer shall 

deternine the amount or amounts to be paid by A.I.D. to thc Grantee. for 

ouch claim. 

ARTICLE V - REFUiDS 

A. Any unoo.unitted funds -nder the control of the Grantee remanlng
 

after the expiration of this Grant shall bo refundcd to A.I.D. by the
 

Grantee.
 

B. If, at any time the Grant Officer dctermines that funds provided 

to the Grantee under this Grant have been used In a Diannor or for 

purposes not in accordance with the terms and conditlon3 of this Grant, 

the Grantee at the discretion of A.I.D. shall either credit such amounts 

to this Crant or rofund such amount in U.S. dollars to A.I.D. on dcs4nad. 

-4­



ATTAC}IEi' 3 

ARTICLE VI - SALAIRTFS AD WAGES 

.All salarict and employees benefits paid fro fundo provided 

-by this Crant shall be in accordance with the Grantee's usual policy 

ard practico. Any deviation from Grantee's pblicj shall be documented
 

and such documentation shall be retained as part of the grant reccrds 

for audit by A.I.D. and/or the Comptroller Ceneral of the United States. 

ARTICLT VII - MQUAT. OPPORTU:ITY EX?,PLOr',Ei'T 

With'regard to the employnent of persons in the U.S. under this 

Grant, Crantee agrees to take all reasonable steps to insure equality 

of opportunity in its cmployment ptactices without regard to race,
 

religion, sex, color or national origin of such persons and that, in
 

accordance with Title VI of the Civil -Rights Act of 1964 when work 

funded by this Orant is perforhed in tho U.S. no person phall, on the
 

grounds of race, religion, tex, color or national origin, be excluded
 

from participaticn, be dcnIcd b.2nsfits, 
or be subjcctcd to dicrir.nation,
 

In addition, the Grarntee a-rees, .to comply in accordan,e with..its written 

Assurance of Compliance, writh the provisions of Part 209 of Chapter II, 

Title 22 of tho Code of Fcderal Regulations, czntifled "I'on-Discrn.iatjon 

in Federally Assisted Programs of the Agency for International Develop.ent -

Effectuation of Title VI of the Civil Rights Act of 1961". 

ARTICLE VIII - PIR0CUh EIT 

A. No motor vehicle shall be procured with A.I.D. funds. Except
 

as may be spccifically approved or directed in advance by the Crant 

Officer, ihe :ourco of any procurement financA horou~ndor shall 

-r ­



ATTAI1ENT 3 
be th United States and 3ny equipmont, matorials or supplic procured
 

tinder 
this grant shall havu been mined, grown, o :, throdh manufacturing,
 

proce3*ing, or assen-ely, produced in tho'United 
States. In addition, a
 

produced co::nrodity procured 
 in any transaction will not b3 elftible for
 
fin.anciizi 1f (i) it 
 contairns ce.poncnts from countries other than Pree
 

Wo-.1d Ccuntries and (1i) 
 the percentarc of permisable componentry
 

comiosition 
excceds 50,oof the commodity price. 

B. 
Title to all commodities procured with funds made available by
 
t.his grant, shall vest' in the Grantee. Grantee shall not, however, during
 

the period 
of this grant, transfer title to such items of equipment without
 

the consent of the 
Grant Officer. 

Expenses of any nature related to construction may not be
 

attributed to this -rant. 

A-?T]C:' X - O7TIC!!..iS :OT TO .E$?I? 

.No ..
c.ber or delegate to the Congress or roident Commissioner.ohall be
 

ad.ittcd to any share or part if th. Crait or to any benefit that may arise 

thercfrrm.. 

A[TICLE XT - CovaIAirArAI'JST CO,._I..C . FEES
 

Th,. Crartcu w:arzants that person or
no celling agency has heen employed 
or retained to solicit or secure this crant upon an agromcmnt or understanding
 

for a conmicrion, prccrtaGc, brokeratge, or contijifcnt foe cxccpt bona fido 
oinployt:cs or bona fide crtLabli::h;i# co:mmercJal or 3olling aeoncicr maintaincd 
by the C,.ant u jor the purpu..o, of 2;ccurJ.in, busino.. For breach or volatloll 
of tii,.; t.-r.;,t3r'L , hi,.ti H'l htA.i.D. Ittv'j thl,: to c:tncol thi:; (i a'iL itlthouL 

http:2;ccurJ.in


3 AWACIU-:.NT 

liability or, in its discretion, to deduct from the grant amount, or
 

otherwise rccovcr the full amount, of each comnssion, porcrintage, brokerage, 

or co:ntinaciL fee. 

AR'ICLE XII - COflFLIC' OF IhTEFFST
 

Other than in the performance of duty as specified by the Grantee in
 

accordance with this atanL, an employee or consultant assigned by the Grantee,
 

i:hone expenses may be reimbursable hereunder, shall not engage, directly or
 

indirectly, oiti'cr in ownhis name or in the naxte or through the agency of 

another percon, In any business, profession, or occupation in any country to 

which he is assigned; nor shall he make loans to or investments in any
 

bu.iness, profession or occupation in any country to which,he is.assigned.
 

ARTICLE :III-.SUBORDIIATE ACREE-MTS 

The 
pdace.2T.. of subordnate agrcenents, grants, or contracts (the costs
 

thccunJer ;:hch are attributable to. this grant) with oth.r "organizations, 

fir- s or institutions is subject to the prior rritten consent of the Grant
 

Officer. In no event shall any such subordinate aGrecment , grant, or contract 

be on a cost-plusa-percontage-of-cost basis. Subordirate contractors
 

(Ji-cluding suppliers) shall be selected on a competitive basis to the maximum
 

practicable cxtnt consltent with the obligations and rcouirements of thiv
 

grant.
 

http:pdace.2T
http:AWACIU-:.NT


ARTICLE XIV - SERVICES PROVIDED TO GRANTEE: 

In the event an entity within the Cooperating Country (private or govern­

mont) furnishes the Grantee free of charge with items or services which would 

otherwise be allowable costs hereunder, the value of such items or services 

shall not be considered as allowable costs under this Grant. 

ARTICLE XV - TRAVEL AND TRANSPORTATION EXPENSES
 

Within the limits of the funds provided by this Grant, the Grantee
 

agrees to utilize less than first class transportation accomodations
 

unless thr use of such accoodations wlll result in unreasonable delay
 

or increased costs. In addition, Grantee agrees to perform all travel by the
 

most direct and expeditious route. 

ARTICLE XVI - LI.AITATION OF TRAIISPORTATION 

A. All international air travel performed under this Grant shall be made 

on U.S. flag carriers. Exceptions to this rule will be allowed ju inu ao1lowing 

situations provided that the Grantee certifies to the facts in the documents 

retained as part of his records: 

1. where a flight by a U.S. flag carkier is not scheduled.to arrive 

in time for the conduct of official business; 

2. where a flight by a.U.S. flag carrier is scheduled but does not have 

accomodations available when reservations are sought;
 

3 -where the departure time, routing, or other features of a U.S. 

flag carrier would interfer with or prevent tho satisfactory performance 

of official business; 

4. where a scheduled flight by a U.S. flag carrier is delayed because
 

of weather, mechanical or other conditions to such an extent ihat use of a
 

non-U.S. flag carrier is in the'U.S. Government's interest; 

- o ­

http:scheduled.to


5. where the appropriato class of accommodations is available on both
 

U.S. flag carrier and non-U.S. flag carriers, but the use. of U.S. flag carriers.
 

will result in higher total U.S. dollar costs to the Grant due to additional
 

subsistence or other expenses; and
 

6. where the appropriate class of accommodations is available only 

on a non-U.S. flag carrier and the cost of transportation and related sub­

sistence is loss than the cost of available accommodations of another class 

on a U.S. flag carrier and related subsistence expense. 

B. AlU international air shipments made hereunder shall be made on U.S. 

Slag carriers unless shin,.ent would, in the Grantce':r judgement, be delayed an 

unrea:,onable time awaiting a U.S. flag carrier either at point of origin or 

transshipment; provided, however, that Grantee certifies to the facts and suoh 

certification is retained as part of the Grant records for audit by A.I.D. 

andfor t1-.h. Con:tro]ler G-neral of the United States. 

C. All international ocean transportation of persons and good3 which is 

to b . reimbursed in U.8. dollars under this Grant shall be by U.S. flag 

vcssels to the extent that thcy are available. 'W'ith respect to the trans­

portation of goods, whore U.S. flag vessels are not availabl, or their use
 

would result in a significant delay, the Grantee may obtain a release, in
 

advance, from thit; requirer.ent fror. the Resources Transportation D.vision, 

I4ency for International Development, W:ashington, D. C. 20523, giving the 

basis for the request. 

- 9­



ARk'ICI, XVII - REPORTS 

A. For details concerning the raquired monthly and other Fiscal Reports soo
 

%i£cleII.
 

B. A.quarterly report of IIDI's activi ios shall be submitted within 30 days
 

of the close of each calendar quarter. The first report will.cover the quarter
 

ending 90 days after the signature of the grant agreement. This report shall
 

h' due within 30 days of the end of the quarter and w.lJ be submitted In 

duplicate. 
Those reports will be In sufficient detail to provide a clear
 

picture of IIDI activities under the grant.
I" 

C. IIDI will also provide conprehensIve histories of projects IIDI assists. 
These histories will include data to measure progress toward employee training 

and advancenent, profit-sharing, and transfer to local ownership. 
These
 

bistortes will also show costs 
f assistance for each project, thk profitability
 

and life span of enterprises, and a comparative analysls of how IIDI success
 

differs from project to project. These histories will be:due nine months
 

fro, the Initiation of each project an 
will be .uoate yearly thereafter.
 

Cvnples will be furnished A.I.D. .n duplicate.
 

ARTIC,3 XIII - NiOTICES 

Any notice given by any of the parties hereunder, shall be sufficient
 

only if In writing and dcliverod In person.or sent by telegraph, cable, or
 

mail as follows:
 

To Grantees
 

Director Gener.s1
 
Inititute ,For International Dovelop.nont, Inc. (IIDI)
390] North :oore Street 
Hosslyn, VIirginia 22209 

-10­

http:Gener.s1
http:person.or


To A.I.D. 3 

Administrator
 
Agency for Intor.national Development.
 
Washington, D.C. 20523
 

Attention: 
Grant Officer (Naming the Grant Officer who.exucutes
 
this Grant)
Office of Contract. Mana.ement 

Central Contract Operations Division
 

-JI­



A~iOWhINT 4& 

ASSUIICE OF COMPITANCE WITH TFE AUNCY Fum 
1NTER!ATIONAL D-'VE)PKM PGUIATION UNME2M TMIE VI 

OF TBE CIVIL RIcirrS AC OF 1964 

Institute for InternRtional Develonm-nt, Inihereinafter called the "Grntee") 

(Name of Grantee) 

HEREBY AGREES THAT it will comply with title VI of the Civil R1ghta Act of 
1964 (P.L. 88-352) and all requirements Imposed by mr pursuant to the .Regu­
lation of the AGency for Internaional Develonent (22 CF Port 209, 30 FP 
317) Issued pur'-,kuit to th-it title, to the end that, in accordance with 
title VI of that Ace and the Fegulcrtion, no per3on in the United States 
shll, on the tr.-,i.d of race, color, religion, sex or national origin, be 
excluded from participatlon in, be denied the beneflt3 of, or to otkerwise 
subjected to dJ3crlmination under and prokgr= or activity for which the 
Grantee receives 1'tdera. financial asziatLnce from the Agency; and 1FAIEUY 
GIVE-, ASS1UJRNCE ThV.T it will ir/ediately take any measures nccesoary to
 
effectvaLe this i.greenent.
 

real prjp:r4

aid of Federal f r.&acial a531stance extended to the Grentee by tha Agenc:,,

this ossurt.rce s}~ll oblipte the Grantee, or in the casle of ary irunsfcr
 
of such projr-rty, any transferee, for the period diring which the real
 
property or structure is used for purpose 


If r-ny n.y or strJ.iture thereon is prcvided or improved with the 

a for whi:-h the Federl financisl 
assiztnce is extended or for another pirpnse involving ti. provision n­
st'lnar ner.-:1ce% -,r benefits, T4 ary :'or.lon.l rty - ±2c
r; ;rotdM
 
thi; assurance si r-1 the Grazitec for
obliFL e the F_rlod Curr hich it
 
retailz t.:.rst' the properL,. In all othe r c.2zos, t.,1s
<r posession of 

assur.-_cc -*,,a!? obligate .- rv-n'.!..e :r the p.:!- duri:. ,'.c the
 
Federa. flnnq :iasiss:lstaiizc is extended to !t by the Aency.
 

- 13. in o,.rat-o of and for the l3,'t.in cn.F s" of obtaining
 
any and all. Federnl .ronti,
]'nnc, contrcts., przp rr.%, dloc:unts or other.n;
.o ._, la .z%-.cc -xt- r.iod ,fc ti-, e .. _o ot._VG 'n 

by tY A'rcy, .,.,p in-t.\ll-,r. payrn.nts t_.;- z:c:C date (r acco'j-.t of 
applicationa for Ycderal financial aasistance wnilch v.re epproved before such
 
date. 'I'e rcrr,'Le rcco,:.idcs and agrees tiat 31u.h Fcd:r%l f-imncial assist­
ance %-.'11be e:t.',ccd in rclic.nce zn t-',- reprc:.cn..tIcm:. ar &-'-ento
 
r.- - , and th! Uaited Sta .3 shil .zve t:- riFit to
a2 in th 
ce.k j V.:cP] ' rcc.-c.t of th;i a:surrnce. i-s&suranc. Is t idlng oa the 
Grant-, I,_', trr, Psi~necs, and th._-,i orsucc.. trnsfcrocz, %nft 
persons whose "ignstares appuar below are authorizcd to sign this a33Lrance 
on behalf of the Grantee. 

(Grantee) ­

BY(Sigr Patur4isd. TedM Director General 

T NAME Paris W.DATE August 25, 1972 

<
 


