
&93-o /7
 

FY /
 



Arnrmerit/F
 



PAI3 1 OF 2
 

Amen - ,No. 2. Efective Date 3. Grant No. Et4.Tective Date 

3 
 Signature Date AFR-0217-A-00-1065-00j October 1, 1980
 

Grantee Name and Address) 6. Aciministered by
)pportunities Industrialization Centers
 
Internation, Inc. Grit Officer 

!40 West Tulpehocken Street Regional Operations Division 
'hiladelphia, PA 19144 Office of Contract Management

Agency for Internatinal Development
:mployer I.D. # 23-1726113 Washington, D.C. 20523 

PIO/T No - N/A 8. Previous PIO/T's-

Appropriation No. N/A
 
Allotment Symbol N/A
 

693-021 3-10001Obligated Prior to this Am. $954,941 


Oblig. by this Amendment S -0

a] Obligated Amount $954,941
 
0ne above numbered Grant is hereby modified as follows: 

PURPOSE: 
 To release the remaining obligated funds for payment of incurred expenditures.
 

COVER LETTER OF JULY 8, 1981:
 

A. First Paragraph: Delete "$653,501" and substitute in lieu thereof "$954,941".
 

AID TECHNICAL OFFICE: AFR/DR/CCWAP
 

This amnenment is entered into pusuant to the authority of the Soreign Assistance I 
f 1961, as amended. Ecept as herein provided, all terms and conditions of the grnnt
aferenced in Block #3 remain c ged. and in full force and effect.

Grantee is reuired to sign this document ald rettnn 7 coies to Issuing orzice. 
* GRANT

....l ,''" NITFOSFTSC A.DC 

Ws/LHlleyT I GA DEVEOMET 

Leon H. Sullivan Wesley L. Ha ley VP 
CN-me typed or printed) (Nam typed or printed) 

E'h: Chairman of the Board TT : Grant Officer 

AYE: June 1.8, 1982 DATE: I . 



-2-


B. 	Third Paragraph: Delete in its entirety.
 

ARTICLE 	II - FUNDS OBLIGATED, ESTIMATED COST AND 
COST-SHARING 

A. 	Section A.l: Delete in its entirety and substitute in
 
lieu thereof the following:
 

"1. 	The total AID dollar funds allotted
 

to this Agreement. $954,941"
 

B. 	Section A.2: Delete this section in its entirety.
 

C. 	Section A.3: Renumber this section to Section A.2.
 
Delete "$653,501" and insert in lieu thereof "$954,941".
 

ARTICLE III - SUBSTANTIAL INVOLVEMENT UNDERSTANDINGS
 

Delete Article III in its entirety and renumber Articles IV
 
through VIII to Articles III through VII, respectively.
 



MOD-IFICATION OF A 

01 1981 of: 

1. Amendmentt No. 2. ective Date 3. Grant No. 4. ective ate-
1 f Signature Date AFR-0217 -00O-1065-00 October 1, 1980

5. Grantee (ame arid A.dAdmi)istere y-Opportunities Industrialization Centers 
International, Inc. Grant Officer

240 West Tulpehocken Street RegiralOperatioru Divsion
Philadelphia, Pennsylvania 
 19144 
 Office of Contract Management
 
Employer ID # 23-1726113 Agency for International DevelopmentWashington, D.C. 20523 

7. PIO/T No - 693-0217-3-lupi8 Previous Is-

Appropriation No. 72-1111021.3

Allotment Symbol 143-52-693-00-69-11 
 693-0217-3-10001 

kmt. Obligated Prior to this Am. $653,501
\mt. Oblig. by this Amendment $301,440
otal Obligated Amount $954,941

9. The above numbered Grant is ereby mnodifed as ol 
A. In grant cover letter dated July 8, 1981 delete the date of "30 September 1981" in

second paragraph, line four, and substitute therefore the date "March 25, 1982" 
B. In grant cover 
letter dated July 8, 1981, delete the obligated amount of'$653,501"


in second paragraph, line one, and substitute therefore the amount of "$954,941"
C. In grant cover letter dated July 8, 1981, delete the amount of "$253,501" in the


third paragraph, line three, and substitute therefore the amount "$554,941." 
0. Ingrant letter dated July 8, 1981, second page, delete the amount "$653,501"
under Total 
Estimated Cost of Agreement and Total Amount Obligated and substitute
the amount "$954,941" under both categories.
 

E. Article II - Funds Obligated, Payment; Estimated Cost and Cost Sharing
 
1. Section Al  delete amount "$653,501" and substitute the amount "$954,941."
 

AID TECHNICAL OFFICE: 
 AFR/DR/CCWAP
 

entered to pursuant tof 1961, as amended. iteau:y 1teForeign sistancExcept as herein provided,eferenced in all terms nd conditions ofthe grantBlock#3 remainuncTanedandin1. ranteeisrequiredto full forceand effect.sign s andreoaunent n7cpeso su go je7 

UNITED STATES OF AMERICA
AGENCY FOP, ]2rENICNAL DEOM~r 

Y: 
BY:- / 

..Jo .Slil -jvan1 
 M. [I. Snyder (NE:ldp)
arm: typed or 1a9etDypAed:printed) 9-2t8-8) 

ITLE: Chairmanof the Board TITL: GrantOfficer 
IATE: Se tmber 29 1981 DATE: 9-28-81 



-2

2. Section A2 - delete the amount of "$253,501" in line four and
 
substitute the amount "$554,941." Delete Total Estimated Agree
ment Costs amount "$653,501" and substitute the amount of "$954,941."
 

F. Article III - Substantial Involvement Understandings
 

1. Section A, line one, delete the amount "$235,501" and substitute
 
the amount "$554,941."
 

2. Section B, line three, delete the amount "$253,501" and substitute
 
the amount "$554,941."
 

G. Article IV - Period of the Agreement 

Delete the date "September 30, 1981" and substitute the date "March 25, 1982" 

H. Article VII - Budget 

Delete the budget narrative and substitute the following:
 

AID
 

Personnel (includes $10,030
 
consulting) $157,388
 

Fringe Benefits 44,366
 
Allowances 137,352
 
Travel and Transportation 79,596

Participant Cost 8,110
 
Other Direct Cost 5,882

Local Program 297,927
 
Indi rect 224,320
 

TOTAL $954,941
 

The recipient may not exceed the total 
amount of the budget. Adjustments
 
among the line items are unrestricted.
 

I. Article VIII - Special Provisions 

Add the following to the Agreement: 

1. Section 7 - Nondiscrimination in Federally Assisted Programs
 

2. Section 8 - Cost Principles for Non-Profit Organizations 



VIII.Special Provisions :tion 7
 

NONDISCRIMINATION IN FEDERALLY ASSISTED PROGRAMS
 

(a) No person in the United States shall 
be excluded from

participation in, 
be denied the benefits of, or be
otherwise subjected to discrimination under, any program
or activity receiving financial assistance from AID,

in accordance with:
 

(1) Title VI of the Civil Rights Act of 1964
 
(Pub. L. 88-352, 42 U.S.C. 2000-d) which prohibits

discrimination on the basis of race, color or
 
national origin, in programs and activities
 
receiving Federal financial assistance,
 

(2) Section 504 of the Rehabilitation Act of 1973 
(29

U.S.C. 794), 
which prohibits discrimination on the
 
basis of handicap in programs and activities
 
receiving Federal financial assistance,
 

(3) The Age Discrimination Act of 1975, 
as amended,

(Pub. L. 95-478) which prohibits discrimination
 
based on age in the delivery of services and
 
benefits supported with Federal funds,
 

(4) ritle IX of the Education Amendments of 1972 (20
U.S.C. 1681, et. seq.) which prohibits discrimi
nation on the basis of 
sex in education programs

and activities receiving Federal 
financial
 
assistance (whether or not the programs or
 
activities are offered or sponsored by an
 
educational institution); and
 

(b) In accordance with its written Assurance, the Grantee
 
agrees 
to comply with AID regulations implementing the

above non-discrimination laws, 
set forth in Chapter II
of Title 22 of the Code of Federal Regulations.
 



VIII. Spei:ial Provisions Section 8
 

Cost Principles for Non-Profit Organizations
 

A. The cost principles applicable to this Grant or Cooperative Agreement are
 
set forth in OMB Circular A-122 "Cost Principles for Non-Profit Organizations.'

All 	references to "Subpart 1-15.-2 -
Contracts with Commercial Organizations"

in the Standard Provisions shall be deleted wherever they appear, and in their
 
place reference to "OMB Circular A-122 - Cost Principles with Non-Profit Organi

tions" shall be inserted.
 

B. 	OMB Circular A-122, Attachment B-3 reserves the sections on bid and proposal

costs and Attachment B-17 on independent research and develnpment costs. AID

and the grantee/recipient hereby agree upon the following treatment of these
 
costs, pending such time as the OMB Circular A-122 is amended to include them.
 

1. Bid and proposal costs. Bid and proposal costs are the immediate costs
 
of preparing bids, proposals, and applications for potential Federal and
 
non-Federal grants, contracts and agreements, including the development

of scientific, costs, and other data needed to support the bids, proposals,

and applications. Bid and proposal costs of the current accounting period
 
are allowable as indirect costs. Bid and proposal costs of prior account
ing periods are unallowable in the current period. In this regard, bid
 
and proposal costs incurred for the preparation of requests for specific

projects and programs are acceptable for recovery as indirect costs.
 
However, proposal costs incurred in the attempt to obtain unrestricted
 
funds are to be treated as fund raising and must be included in the
 
organization's direct cost base. Bid and proposal costs do not include
 
independent research and development costs which are covered by para
graph (2)below, or preaward costs covered by Attachment B, Paragraph 33,
 
of OMB Circular A-122.
 

2. Independent research and development costs. Independent research and
 
development is research and development conducted by an organization

which is not sponsored by Federal or non-Federal grants, contracts or
 
other organizations. Independent research and development costs must
 
be included in the organization's direct cost base for allocation of
 
its proportionate share of indirect costs. 
 The costs of independent

research and development, including its proportionate share of indirect
 
cost, are unallowable under AID agreements.
 



4 /6R /&A 1- 



July 8, 1981 

Opportunities Industrialization Centers 
International, Inc. (OICI)


210 West Tulpehocken Street
 
Philadelphia, Pennsylvania 
19144
 

Gentlemen: 

Subject: AFR-O217-A-O0-1065-O0
 

Pursuant to the authority contained in the Foreign Assistance Act of 1961,
as amended, and the Grant and Cooperative Agreement Act of 1977, The Agency
for International Development (hereinafter referred to as 
"AID") hereby
provides to OICI the sum of S653,501 for a program more fully described
in Article I of the Schedule entitled "Purpose and Program Description."
 

This Agreement is effective and an obligation of $653,501 is made as of
the date of this letter and shall apply to commitments made by the
recipient in furtherance of program objectives during the period 1 October
1980 through 30 September 1981.
 

Of the total 
amount provided herein, $400,000 will be available
immediately for the incurrence of costs hereunder and added to the recipient's
Federal Reserve Letter of Credit. 
 The balance of the $253,501 will not be
dispersed to the recipient until conditions as stated in III A & B of Agreement,

are fulfilled.
 

This Agreement is made with OICI on condition that the funds will be
administered in accordance with the terms and conditions as set forth in
the Schedule and "Standard Provisions" dated September 1977 and Alterations in Standard Provisions dated August 1978, which have been agreed to

by your organization.
 

Please sign the Statement of Assurance of Compliance, enclosed herein, and
the original and nine (9)copies of this letter to acknowledge your acceptance of the conditions under which these funds have been provided.
 
Please return the Statement of Assurance of Compliance and the original and
ei.gtlt (8)copies of this Agreement to the Office of Contract Management.
 

Sincerely yours,
 

Michael H. Snyder 
Agreement Officer
 
Regional Operations Division, Africa
 
Office of Contract Management
 

Enclosures:
 
1. Statement of Assurance of Compliance
 
2. Schedule
 
3. Standard Provisions 



2 AFR-0217-A-00-1065-00 
 r2UL 3 I 1981 

ACCEPTED 

BY: U& 

TITLE: Chairman of the Board 

DATE: August 3, 1981 

Fiscal Data
 

Agreement No.: AFR-0217-A-00-1065-00
 

PIO/T No.: 693-0217-3-10001
 

Allotment: 143-52-693-00-69-11
 

Appropriation: 72-111101.3
 

Total Estimated Cost of Agreement: $653,501
 

Total Amount Obligated: $653,501
 

Method of Payment: FRLC
 

Technical Office: AFR/DR/CCWAP:Ed Barnes
 

Project No.: 693-0217
 



I. PURPOSE AN'D PROGRA9 L'ECRIPTION
 

A. Purpose of Agreement: The purpose of this cooperative agreement is to provide

support necessary to permit OICI to continue to work toward the establishment of a
 
viable non-formal agricultural training center and demonstration farm at Notse which
 
can provide appropriate training and effective extension assistance to 
small farmers
 
in the TOGO Plateau and Maritime regions.
 

B. Specific Objectives: In pursuit of the objectives of this program, the
 
recipient will:
 

1. Conduct residential agricultural training programs at OICI's
 
122-hectare agricultural training center at Notse-Todoae. At
 
least 80 Togolese farmers per year will undergo 6-month pro
grams of residential instruction at the center (and upon ccm
pletion of training will return to farming occupations).
 

The training programs at the center will emphasize:
 

a) cultivation of maize, cotton, rice, beans and vegetables; 

b) proper raising of swine, sheep, goats and chickens; 

c) use and maintenance of hand tools;
 

dl snall farm construction skills; 

e) use of animal traction production techniques;
 

A 40-50 hectare area at the center will be divided into a
 
series of 1-2 hectare plots to be used for demonstrating

appropriate cultivation techniques and conducting seed 
germination trials and other training-related crop experi
ments. Also, each student will be assigned appropriate

types and numbers of farm animals to care for on appro
priately sized plots. 

All training situations will simulate actual farming con
ditions of Togolese small farmers in general and the cen
ter's students in particular. Appropriate technological

methods and devices will be utilized to demonstrate im
proved crop production. Livestock training will emphasize
 
use of locally available feeds, feed formulation, housing
routine management, record-keeping, health care, and
 
slaughter.
 

2. Provide systematic follow-up training and assistance to
 
all graduates of the center on problems encountered in farm
 
start-up activities, crop selection and production, live
stock raising, etc. This follow-up training and assistance
 
will be provided with sufficient frequency to assure effec
tive application of their training. During the period of
 
this grant such follow-up assistance will be provided to
 
students who comleted training at the center at any time
 
after September 30, 1979. Written records will be main
tained on visits to graduates.
 



.3-


The PIO/T specifies that only $400,000 can be paid out to the recipient until

certain agreements are met as specified in 6(a) and (b). 
 Only $400,000 will
be put in the FRLC at this point until these conditions are met and then the
additional $253,501 will be added upon the Agreement officer receiving assurances
 as 
specified in III A of agreement. 
The full $653,501 is being obligated in

the agreement based on the above understanding.
 

Title to goods purchased under this agreement will 
rest with the cooperating

country so standard provisions 12A and 12B were deleted.
 

There will be $47,937 worth of cost sharing done by the local participating

government, and is reflected in the recipient's proposal.
 

Cost Negotiations
 

Negotiations were conducted by phone on 5/22/81, 5/27/81 with Mr. Green, Controller
of OICI, and Neil Edin, Cooperative Agreement Negotiator. A revised proposal
was received on 6/3/81. A summary and discussion of the proposed and negotiated

costs follow:
 

Line Item Proposed Negotiated Difference
 

Personnel 
 $110,940 $103,165 $ 7,775
Fringe Benefits 31,323 
 29,150 2,173
Allowances 
 130,950 100,190 30,760

Travel & Transportation 36,583 
 35,879 704
Participant Cost 8,110 8,110

Other Direct Cost 2,940 2,940

Local Program 219,060 219,060

Indirect Cost 
 168,849 155,007 13,842
 
Total 
 $708,755 $653,501 $55,254
 

Salaries: revised after discussion since some of positions were not filled

for complete year, and also some salary increases were given during year.
No salaries were at the FS I level 
so no exception is needed. One consultant/
expert at 56,530 is included as nor PIO/T budaget and recipient budoet.
 

Allowances: 
 The chart below also includes various allowances allbwed as

Part ofthe Standardized Regs and also the Recipient's internal policies.
Notes Are placed following chart for further details on how arrived at.
 



- 4 -

Expected Output of the Project
 

During FY 81, annual training projections include the enrollment of 125
 
farmers and completions of at least 70 on-site trainees and 45 off~site
 
trainees.
 

Inputs to the Project
 

The major project inputs detailed in the OICI project proposal log-frame

include (1)a Technical Cooperation Team from OICI to provide assistance
 
in the establishment of the agricultural training center, and (2)the 300
 
acre (122 ha) project site donated by the Notse community to launch the
 
training center and (3)the cost sharing in the amount of $47,937 by the
 
Togo government to cover certain costs above and beyond the amount provided

for in this agreement.
 

II. Funds Obligated, Payment, Estimated Cost and Cost.Sharing
 

A. The recipient will receive funding for the costs incurred by him in
 
providing the assistance as described in Section I,Program Description, in
 
accordance with the applicable provisions of the Agreement and the
 
Standard Provisions, subject to the following limitation:
 

1. The toal AID dollar funds allotted to this Agreement. $653,501
 
(See Standard Provision 30,Limitation of Cost clause and
 
Scction VII, Financial Plan)
 

2. Of the toal amount provided herein, $400,000 will be available
 
immediately for the.incurrence of costs hereunder and added to the
 
recipient's Federal Reserve Letter of Credit. The balance of the
 
$253,501 will not be dispersed to the recipient until conditions
 
as stated in III A & B of Agreement are fulfilled.
 

TOTAL ESTIMATED AGREEMENT COSTS $653,501
 

3. An additional amount of $47,937 will be provided as cost sharing by

the GOT above the $653,501 amount.
 

B. Payment will be made under the terms and conditions in Standard
 
Provision 7A, Federal Reserve Letter of Credit.
 



- 5 -


III. .Substantial Involvement Understandings
 

A. Before rne recipient can be paid for the additional S235,501 listed in the
 
agreement letter, the recipient will furnish, in form and substance sat
isfactory to AID/T,a written agreement with Togo's Ministry of Rural
 
Development which (a)spells out OICI's relationship to the Ministry and
 
their mutually perceived objectives of the OICI/Togo program; and (b)

spells out present planning as how agricultural training center at Notse-

Todome will be integrated and incorporated into the Ministry's ovwrall
 
agricultural and extension efforts.
 

B. The recipient shall provide the Agreement Officer with notice of his
 
adherence to the above understandings from AID/T, prior to receiving

the additional $253,501 under the agreement.
 

C. The Director, USAID/Togo, or his designee will be the contact person il

the field and will monitor activities covered under this agreement for AID,
 

IV. Period of the Agreement
 

The'Period of Agreement is from October 1, 1980 until September 30, 1981.
 

V. Evaluation and R6ports
 

A. OICI will submit quarterly reports to 1) OAR/Togo 2) AID/AFR/DR/CCWAP
 
3)as listed in V.B6. These reports will be due January 15, 1981, April

15, 1981, July 15, 1981 and a final report October 15, 1981.
 

B. The report should briefly present the following information for-each program,

function and activity involved as described in the Specific Objectives

and Implementation of Article I.
 

1. A comparison of actual accomplishments with the goals established for the
 
period. 
 Where the output of the
 
programs can be readily quantified, such quantitative data should be related
 
to cost data for computation of unit costs.
 

2. Reasons why established goals were not met.
 

3. Other pertinent information including, when appropriate, analysis and
 
explaination of cost overruns or high unit costs.
 

4. Between the required performance reporting dates, events may occur that have
 
significant impact upon the project or program. In such instances, the
 
recipient shall notify AID/T and AID/AFR/DR/CCWAP.
 

5. The recipient will also submit financial reports quarterly which will in
dicate total funds received, dispersed and committed along with the reports
 
sent to AID/T and AID/AFR/DR/CCWAP.
 

6. Other report requirements (.as listed in following).
 



(a)The Contractor shall 
submit two copies of each written technical repor
 
prepared under the terms of this Contract (e.g. progress reports, final
 
report, etc.) to 
the AID Reference Center, Agency for International
 
Development, Washington, D.C. 
 20523. The title page of all 
reports
 
forwarded to the AID Reference Center shall include the contract number,
 
the project number and the project title which are set forth on the cover 
page of this Contract. 

(b) When preparing reports, the.Contractor shall refrain from using 
e.laborate art work, multicolor printing and expensive paper/binding, unless
 
It is specifically authorized in the Schedule of this Contract. Wherever 
possible, pages should be'printed on both sides using single spaced type. 

VI. Negotiated Overhead Rates
 
Pursuant to the provisions of the Clause of the Standard Provisions of thisAgreement entitled "Negotiated Overhead Rates 
-
Other than Educational
Insitutions," a rate or rates shall be established for the period beginning
October 1, 1980 until amended. 
Pending establishment for final 
rates for the
initial period, provisional payments on account of allowable indirect costs
shall be made on the basis of the following negotiated provisional rates applied
to the base which is set forth below:
 

Rate 
 Base
 
32.1% 
 Total direct costs less commodities and equipment
 

VII. Budget 

Personnel (includes $6,530 consulting)
Fringe Benefits 
All owances 
Travel & Transportation 
Participant Cost 
Other Direct Cost
Local Program 
Indirect 

AID 
$13,165 
29,150
100190 
35,879 
8,110 
2,940 

219,060 

GOT(cost sharing) 

47,937 
155,007, 

TOTAL 
$653,501 47,937 



The 	recipient may not exceed the total 
amount of the budget. Adjustments
 
among the line items are unrestricted.
 

VIII. Special Provisions
 

A. The Standard Provisions, Attachment 3,dated 9/77, are modified accordingly:
 

I. 	 The terms "Grant" and "Grantee" are changed to "Agreement" and
"Recipient", respectively.
 

2. The following provisions ar2 deleted in their entirety:
6 Limitation of Funds 
7B - Payment, Periodic Advance 
7C - Payment, Reimbursement 
11 - Government Furnished Excess Personal Property
12B 	- Title to and Care of Property (U.S. Government Title)

12A - Title to and Use of Property (Grantee Title) 
15 - Voluntary Participation 
16 - Prohibition on Abortion-Related Activities 

3: 	 Standard Provision 28 entitled "Utilization of Excess and Near
 
Excess Foreign Currencies is added to the Agreement.
 

4. 	Standard Provision 29 entitled "Participant Training" is added
 
to the Agreement.
 

5. Standard Provision 30 entitled "Limitation of Cost" is added
 
to the Agreement.
 

6. 	Alterations in Standard Provisions dated August 1978 are added.
 

B. If the recipient makes a subagreement with a non-U.S. subrecipient,

Standard Provisions entitled "Non-U.S. subgrantees, other than
Educational Institutions, " shall be applicable to the subagreement,

changing the terms as above.
 



Standard Provision Number 30
 

Delete Standard Provision #6 Limitation of Funds clause and replace with
 
Limitation of Cost clause below.
 

LIMITATION OF COST (DEC. 1970) (FPR 1-7.202-3)
 

(a) It is estimated that the total cost to the Government for the performance
 
of this Grant will not exceed the estimated cost set forth in the
 
Schedule, and the Grantee agrees to use his best efforts to perform the
 
work specified in the Schedule and all obligations under this grant
 
within such estimated cost. If, at any time, the Grantee has reason to
 
believe that the costs which he expects to incur in the performance of
 
this grant in the next succeeding 60 days, when added to all costs
 
previously incurred, will exceed 75 per cent of the estimated cost then
 
set forth in the Schedule, or if at any time, the Grantee has reason to
 
believe that the total cost to the Government for the performance of this
 
grant , exclusive of any fee, will be greater or substantially less than
 
estimated cost hereof, the Grantee shall notify the AID Grant Officer in
 
writing to that effect, giving the revised estimate of such total cost for
 
the performance of this grant.
 

(b) Except as required by other provisions of this grant specifically
 
citing and stated to be an exception from this clause, the Government
 
shall not be obigated to reimburse the Grantee for costs incurred in
 
excess of the estimated cost set forth in the Schedule, and the Grantee
 
shall not be obligated to continue performance under the grant (including
 
actions under the Termination clause or otherwise to incur costs in excess
 
of the estimated cost set forth in the Schedule, unless and until the
 
Grant Officer shall have notified the Grantee in writing that such estimate
 
cost has been increased and shall have specified in such notice a revised
 
estimated cost which shall thereupon constitute the estimated cost of
 
performance of this grant. No notice, communication, or representation

in any other form or from any person other than Grant Officer shall affect
 
the estimated cost of this contract. In the absence of the specified
 
notice, the Government shall not be obligated to reimburse the Grantee for
 
any costs in excess of the estimated cost set forth in the Schedule, whether
 
those excess costs were incurred during the course of the grant or as a
 
result of termination. When and to the extent that the estimated cost set
 
forth in the Schedule has been increased, any costs incurred by the Grantee
 
in excess of the estimated cost prior to such increase shall be allowable to
 
extent as if such costs had been incurred after the increase; unless Grant
 
Officer issues .atermination or other notice and directs that the increase
 
is solely for the purpose of covering termination or other specified
 
expenses.
 

(c) In the event that this grant is terminated or the estimated cost not 
increased, the Government and the Grantee shall negotiate an equitable 
distribution of all property produced or purchased under the grant based 
upon the share of costs incurred by each.
 

3. All other terms and conditions remain unchanged.
 



A''ACH94ENT 2 
Specific Support Grant
 

SEPTEMBER 1977 (OTEI)
 
U.S. Grantees and U.S. Subgrantees: 


OTHER THAN EDUCATIONAL INSTITUTIONS
 
INDEX OF
 

STANDARD PROVISIONS
 

1. Allowable Costs and Payment (Other Than Educational Institutions) 13. Conversion of United States Dollars to Local Currency
 
14. Termination
2. Accounting, Records, and Audit 

15. Voluntary Participation
3. Refunds 


Prohibition on Abortion-Related Activities
4. Frual Opportunity in Employment 	 16. 
Other Than Educational Institutions Voluntary Participation Requirements for Sterilization
Negotiated Overhead Rates -	 17. 


Programs
6. limitation of Funds 

18. Publications
'A. Payment - Federal Reserve Letter of Credit (FRLC) Advance 

'711.Payment - Periodic Advance 19. Patents 
7C. Pu inent - Reimbursement 20. Regulations Governing Employees Outside the United States 

21. Subordinate Agreements
8. Travel and Transportation 

22. U.S. Officials Not to Benefit
9. Ocean Shipment of Goods 
23. Covenant Against Contingent Fees
10. Procurment of Goods and Services Under $250,000 

24. Nonliability
11. Government Furnished Excess Personal Property 

25. Amendment
:?A. Title to and Use of Property (Grantee Title)


2B Title to and Care of Property (U.S. Government Title) 26. The Grant
 
'2C. Title to and*Care of Property (Cooperating Country Title) 27. Notices
 

,I-cto-FITyFayin-nt prvis ion from Group 77 
.,elect only-I property provision from Group 12, if title to all property is to vest in one entity; however, if title is to be split by 

stequries among two or more entities, select the appropriate provisions from Group 12 and identify the categ4ioies and entities in 
t,ichment 1 of the Grant. 

1. ALLDWABLF 'USTS AND PAYMENT (OTHER THAN EDUCATIONA. national origin of such persons and,.in accordance 
with Title VI of the Civil Rights Act of 1964, when
 

This r--s on isapplicable to other than educational work funded by this Grant is performed in the U.S. no
 
institutions.) 


T(ETT=uuI-

person shall, on the grounds of race, color or national
 

The fGrantev shall be reimbursed for costs incurred in origin, 
be excluded from participation, be denied
 
carrying out the purposes of this Grant which are determined benefits, or be subjected to discrimination. In addition,
 

b the Grant Officer to be allowable in accordance with the the Grantee agrees to comply, in accordance with its
 
ttms of this Grant and Subpart 15.2 (Contracts with written assurance of compliance, with the provisions of
 

of the Code of Federal.r)rrercial Organizations) of the Federal Procurement 	 Part 209 of Chapter II,Title 22 
(41 CIR 1-15.2) in effect on the date of this Regulations, entitled "Non-Discrimination in Federally94ulations 

,,"ant. Payment of allowable costs shall be in accordance Assisted Programs of the Agency for International
 
with the payment provision of this Grant. Development - Effectuation of Title VI of the.Civil
 

Rights Act of 1964."
 

ACCOUNTING, RECORDSLAND AUDIT 
 (b) In addition, the Grantee agrees to take all 
reasonable steps to ensure equality of opportunity in- records, documents, 


mnd otter evidence in accordance with the Grantee's its employment practices without regard to sex, religion,
The Grdj-.hJT-f ai books, 

accounting procedures to sufficiently substantiate age and handicap, in accordance with P.L. 92-261, P.L.usual 

charges to the Grant. The Grantee shall preserve and 93-259, P.L. 93-112 and P.L. 93-508. When work funded by
 

make available such records for examination and audit 
 AID under this Grant is performed in either the U. S.
 

by AID and the Comptroller General of the United States, or overseas no person shall, on the grounds of sex,
 
religion, age or handicap, be excluded from participation,
or their authorized representatives (a)until the 


expiration of three years from the date of termination be denied benefits, or be subjected to discrimination,
 

of the program and (b)for such longer period, if any,
 
an audit and to resolve all 5. NEGOTIATED OVERHEAD RATES - OTIER THAN EDUCATIONALas is required to complete 


questions concerning expenditures unless written approval INSTITUTIONS
 
(This provision is applicable to other than educationaltms been obtained from the AID Grant Officer to dispose 

of the records. AID follows generally accepted auditing institutions.)
 
practices in determining that there is proper accounting 
 (a) Pursuant to this provision, an overhead rate shall
 

and use of Grant funds. The Grantee agrees to include be established for each of the Grantee's accounting
 
periods during the term of this Grant. Pending
the requiremPnts of this clause in any subordinate 


dgreement hereunder, 	 establishment of a final rate, the parties have agreed
 
that provisional payments on account of allowable
 
indirect costs shall be at the rate(s), on the base(s),
3. REFUNDS 


(a) -iuse of the Grant funds results In accrual of 	 and for the period shown in Attachment I to this Grant.
 
(b) The Grantee, as soon as possible but not later
interest to the Grantee ur to any other person to whom 


Grantee makes such funds available in carrying out 
 than 90 days after the close of each of its accounting
 

the purposes of this Grant, the Grantee shall refund periods during the term of this Grant, shall submit to
 
the Grant Officer with copies to the Overhead and Special
 to AID an amount equivalent to the arnunt of interest 


accrued. 
 Cost Branch, Special Operations Division, Office of
 

(b) Funds obligated hereunder but not disbursed to Contract Management, AID, Washington, D.C. and to the
 

the Grantee at the time the Grant expires or is terminated, Office of the Auditor General, AID, Washington, D.C.,
 

shall revert to AID, except for funds encumbered by the Gran- proposed final rate(s) for the period, together
 
tee by a legally binding transaction applicable to this with supporting cost data. Negotiation of final over-

Grant.. Any funds disbursed to but not expended by the Gran- head rates by the Grantee and the Grant Officer shall
 
tee at the time of expiration or termination of the Grant be undertaken as promptly as practicable after receipt
 
shall be refunded to AID. 	 of the Grantee's proposal.
 
(c) If,at any time during the life of the Grant, it is (c) Allowability of costs and acceptability of cost
 
detenined by AID that funds provided under the Grant have allocation methods shall be determined In accordance
 
been expended for purposes not in accordance with the terms with Subpart 1-15.2 (Contracts with Commercial
 
of the Grant, the Grantee shall refund such amounts to AID. Organizations) of the Federal Procurement Regulations
 

as in effect on the date of this Grant.
 
4. EQUAt OPPORTUNITY 'IN EMPLOYMENT 	 (d) The results of each negotiation shall be set forth 

(lh -p-r s t grantees and 	 in a written overhead rate agreement executed by botho6 ion l 

Subgrantees who either perform work in the United States parties. Such agreement shall specify (1)the agreed
 

in the United States 	 (2) the base(s) to which the rate(s) applies,or who recruit personnel to do work 	 final rate(s). 
abroad.) 	 'and (3) the period(s) for which the rate(s) applies. T e 
(a) With regard to the employment of persons in the 	 overhead rate agreement shall not change any monetary 

U.S. und(.r this Grant, the Grantee agrees to take all 	 ceiling, Grant obligation, or specific cost allowance or
 
reasonable steps to ensure equality of opportunity in its disallowance provided for in this Grant.
 

employment practices without regard to race, color or (e) Pending establishment of the final overhead rate(s) for a
 



period, the Grantee shall be reimbursed either at the negotiatqd 

provisional rate(s) as provided above or at a billing rate(s) 

acceptable to the Grant Officer, subject to appropriate 
adjustmient when the final rate(s) for that period is 
established. To prevent substantial over or under payment, 
the provisional or billing rate(s) may, at the request of 
eltheir party, be revised by mutual agreement, either 
retroactively or prospectively. Any such revision of 

the neqIntlated provisional rate(s) provided in this provision 
shall be set forth ina mndification to this Grant. 

6. LIMiTAIIOl OF FUIDS 
(Thi,-'prov sion1 Is aipplicable to all increnentally or 
drrtil ly funded (Irarits, it becomes inapplicable when 

the grunt i, fully funded.) 
(.) It is estimnated that the cost to the Government 
for the performance of this Grant will not exceed the 
t-timat,,d cost set forth in Attachment I (hereinafter 
,'eferrel to as "the Schedule") to this Grant, and the 
1;rantee ?igres to perform the work specified in the 
,chedul, and all ooliqations under this Grant within 
such e' tilrated cost. 
(b) 7110 a1ount presently available for payient and 
oli oid uiler the Grant, the items covered thereby, 
.ind the p,.i od of performince which it is estimated the 
!,! igat,,d anuni will cover, are specified in the 

,ne, Il,. It Is cnont'ml~ated that from time to time 

iliti 03al funds will be obligated under this Grant up 


o'elle 'imated cost set forth in the Scheoule. 

,ieCrdntfC, agree to perform or have perforned work on 

"is Gr,ant u tc the point at which the total amount paid 

'- I)rable by tie Government pursuant to the terms of 

, (! approximatos not exceed the total
1rnt but does 

ount actually oblliiated under the Grant. 

)II aIt any tie the Grantee has reason to believe 


,,itthe costs which it expects to incur in the performance 

this Grant in the next succeeding 30 days. when added 


.>all costs previously incurred, will exceed 75 percent 

f the total armount ther;obligated under the Grant, the 

rnte Shall notify the Grant Officer inwriting to that 

if t. lhoi noticje shall state the estimated amount 

' additional funds required to continue performance for 


'l,, period set fnrth in the Schedule. Thirty days prior 

,v the end of the period specified in the? Schedule, the 

,rantee will advise the Grant Officer in writing as to 


,he estimated amiount of additional funds, if any, that 

iillbe required for the timely performtance of the work 

nder the Grint or for such further period as may be 

.Decified in the Schedule or otherwise agreed to by the 

,,irties. If, after such notification, additional funds 

ire not obl iqated by the end of the ieriod set forth 

,n the Schedule or in agreed date substituted therefor, 

he Grant. Officer will, upon written request by the 

;,rantee, terininate this Grant pursuant to the "Termination" 

'rovlsion of this Grant on such a date. Ii the Grantee, 

It. the exercise of it- , reasonable judgment, estimates that 

the funds available will allow it to continue to discharge 

It,, obligatlons hereunder for a period extending beyond 

such date, it shall specify the later date in its request 

od th, Grant Officer, in his discretion, may terminate 

this Grunt on that later date. 

d) Ex ept as required by other provisions of this 


:rant s:)eclfir.ally citing and stated to be an exception 

fror hes provision, thi, Governpment shall not be 

niliqgat.,d to reiruourse the Grantee for costs incurred 

,nexce s of the total amount obligated under the Grant, 
ind the Grantee shall not be obligated to continue 
perlonnice under the Grant (including actions under the 
"lerminintion" provision) or otherwise to incur costs 
in exceS of th'. a,,urt obligated under the Grant, unless 
and unt 1 the Grant Officer has notified the Grantee in 
writing that Suich obligated amount has been increased and 
,ias spe ified in such notice an increased amount constituting 
the tot. 1 arrinont then obligated under the Grant. To the 
extent he amount obligated exceeds the estimated cost 

;et for:h in the Sch.dule, such estimated cost shall 

5e rorr'espwndngly increased. No notice, communication 

'd r,,preseitaton in any other form or from any person 

uthue than the Grant Officer shall affect the amount 

ohl lgated under this Grant. In the absence of the 

,peciffed notice, the Government shall not be obligated 

to reimburse the Grantee for any costs in excess of the 


ATTACHMENT 2 . 
Specific Support Granm 

SEPTEMUER 1977 (OTEI)
 

total amount then obligated under the Grant, ithether 
those excess costs were incurred during the course of 
the Grant or as a result of ternination. When and to 
the extent that the an'ount obligated under the Grant 
has been increased, any costs incurred by the Grantee 
in excess of the amunt previously obligated shall 
be allowable to the sime extent as 
if such costs had 
been incurred after sit:h increase in the amount obligated, 
unless the Grant Officer issteb a trnination or other 
notice and directs that the increase is solely for the
 
purpose of covering terinnation or other specified 
expenses. 
(e) Nothing in this provision shall afiucs the right 
of the Government to terminate this Grant. In the 
event this Grant is terminated, the Government and 
the Grantee shall negotiate an equitable distribution 
of all property produced or purchased under the Grant 
based upon the share of cost incurred by each. 

7A. PAYMENT - FEDERAL RESERVE LETTER OF CREDIT (FRLC) 
ADVANCE 

(This provisin is applicable when the Grantee's total 
AID grants and cost-reinbursemnent contracts exceed 
$250,000 per annum and AID has, or expects to have a 
contInuing relationship with the Grantee for at least 
one year.) 
(a) AID shall open a Federal Reserve Letter of Credit 

"
 
(hereinafter referred to as an "FRLC ) in the amount of 
this Grant, against which the Grantee my present pay
ment vouchers (i.e., TUS 5401). The payment vouchers 
shall not ordinarily be subintted more frequently than 
daily and shall not he less than $10,000 or more than 

method enables the recipient
$1,000,000. Since the FIRLC 

organization to obtain funds from the U.S. Treasury 
concurrently with and as frequently as disbursements
 
are made by the recipient, thcre need be no time lag
 
between disbursetnents by the recipient organization and
 
drawdowns from the U.S. Treasury by FRLC. Therefore,
 
there is no necessity for the recipient to maintain
 
balances of Federal cash other than small balances.
 
(b) In no evepit shall the accumulated total of all
 
such payment vouchers exceed the amount of the FRLC.
 
(c) If at any time, SER/Fldeterinines that the Grantee
 
has presented payment vouchers in excess of the amount
 
or amounts allowable in (a) and (b)above, SER/FM shall
 
advise the Grant Officer who may: (1)cause the FRLC
 
to be suspended or revoked; or (2) direct the Grantee
 
to withhold submission of payment vouchers until such
 
time as, in the judgment of SER/FM, an appropriate
 
level of actual, necessary and allowable expenditures
 
has occilrred or iill occur under this Grant, and/or
 
(3) request the Grantee to repay to AID the amount of
 
such excess. Upon receipt of the Grant Officer's
 
request for repayment of excess advance paynnents, the
 
Grantee shall prumptly contact SEP/FM to make suitable 
arrangements for the repayment of such excess funds.
 
Advances made by primary recipient organizations (those 
which receive payments directly from the Government) to 
secondary recipients shall conform to the same standards 
outlined above applicable to advances made by the 
Government to primary recipient organizations. 
(d) Procedure for Grantee 
(fl After arranging with a com;iercial bank of its choice 
for operation under the FRlLC and obtaining the name and 
address of the Federal Reserve Bank or branch serving 
the commercial batik, the Grantee shall deliverto the 
AID Controller 3 originals of Standard form 1194,
 
"Authorized Signature Card ior Paymvent Vouchers on
 
Letters of Credit" signed by those ofitcial(s)
 
authorized to siqn payment vouchers against tfie FRLC 
and by an official of the Grantee who has authorized
 
them to sign.
 
(2) The Grantee shall subsequently receive one certi
fied copy of the FRLC. 
(3) The Grantee shall confirn with his commercial bank
 

that the FRLC has been opened and is available when
 
funds are needed.
 
(4) To receive payment, the Grantee shall: 
(A) Periodically ,although normally not during the 
last five days of the month, prepare paymxent vouchers
 
(Form TUS 5401) in an original and three copies.
 
(B) Have the original and taio copies of the voucher 

-2



signed by the authorized official(s) whose signature(s) 

appear on the Standard Form 1194. 
(C) Present tihe original, duplicate and triplicate 
copy 	 of the Fcnr. TUS 5401 to his, commercial bank. 
() Retain the quadruplicate copy of the voucher, 
(N) After the first payment voucher (Form TUS 5401) 
lm,, bC-I;'n processed, -tucceeding payment vouchers shall 
not th!;1;'isented until the existing balance of previous 
pavinpt, has been expended or is insufficient to meet 

r r'" '.'d. 
(Ij I,pret;,rill tse payment voucher, the Grantee 
a, i qe'. t. voucher nurler in numerical sequence beginning 

witl I id conti'iuinq in sequence on all subsequent pay-
manti vouihers sutnitted under the FRIC. 
(7) .1 report of expenditures (i.e., SF 269, "Financial 
Status Report") shall be prepared and submitted not less 

tillnquay terly within 30 days of the end of the period to 

of Financial Management, AID, Washington, D.C. 

)0523. This 5F 269 Report, submitted with Standard Form 

tt3.' . "Public Voucher for Purchases and Services Other 

Than Persanal", shill be in an original and 2 copies. 

(,RiThe St 26 report Is reviewed against the Grant 
tuvislons, and any iinproper disbursement is disallowed, 

1T-heGrantee is notified oy the reasCn for the disallowance 
ed i

, directed to adjust the next periodic report of 

the OjffIce 

.',p;n1 tures to reflect the disallowance and to reduce its 

ri-t payawInt Youcher against the FRLC by the amount of 
t' l .,.I I(,Wilce. 

In i.dditnn to the -,thmission of the SF 269 and the 
f.l2, the Grantee shall submit an original and 2 copies 
, /.:,"Federal Casth Transaction Report" as follows: 

t,! Fr,-advance,. totaling less than $1 million per year, 

,r ntee shall submit the SF 272 within 15 working 


,jay, alter the end of the reporting quarter, 

' ri) totaling more thin $1 million per year.
for advances 


212 within 15 working
t!u 6rantee shall sutnit the SF 
day, after the end ol each month, and 
h) The Grantee's cash needs for the ensuing period (i.e., 

be explained under the "Remarks".,trtar or month) shall 
of the 

(j.) Re(fund of Excess Funds 

(! If all cotsts have been settled under the Grant and 


lhe Grantee fails to cotmply with the Grant Officer's 

rquet for repa~yrent of excess FRLC funds, the Govern-

irnt shall have the right, on other contracts or grants 
h-ld with the Grantee, to withhold reimbursements due 

to the Grantee in the amount of the excess being held by 
thp Grantee. 
('u)If the .,rantee is still holding excess FRLC funds 

on 


•.,.ctior 'IF 272. 

e. ,rant, cont'act, or similar instrument under which 
,.orkhis been completed or terminated but all costs have 
rolK..en settled, the Grantee agrees to: 
(A) firovide within 30 days after requested to do so by 
the 	Grant Officer, a breakdown of the dollar amounts 


s;l-lhnot been 
 settled between the Government and 

toe Grantee. (The Grant Officer will assume no costs 

r' ir dispute if the Grantee fails to reply within 


nave 

(I l ritten request of the Grant Officer, returnllUon 

if any, which 


r.;r ,,ents thp difference between (I) the Grantee's 

iraiin position on claimed costs which have not been 


to 01- Governient the sum of dollars, 

-einihrued and (ii) the total amount of unexpended. funds 
ldlc, have bern advdnced under the Grant; and 
(C) If the Grantt.e fails to rorrly with the Grant 
Oft cvr", request for repayment of excess FRLC funds, the 
fkov,rii:ent -hall hove the right. on other contracts, 
-:rant, or Tt ilar instruments held with the G tee to 

and/or witin-witlhdid pa/mpnt of FRLC or other advances 
roll reinbursenwntindue the Grantee in the amount of the 
,-;- Ibn Ihi'ld by the Grantee. 

lt. 	 AYMfNl -- PIfRItlIC ADVANCE 
(Ti' f ioT- aUTTe when the Grantee's totalhnro 

All 'trots and cr;st-reimbursenent contracts do not exceed 
12,1 ,)0n per annur, or if the advance to the Grantee 
,lqIrl'qat c $2F0,000 per but there istire than annum 
not d cnntlnulng relationship of at least one year.) 
(vi Fach nenth (or quarter, if the Grantee is on a quar-
tv,, ntter the initial advance, the Grantee
iyhasls) 

.hll submit to th AID Controller an original and 2 

(.(pies of SF 272, "Federal Cash Transactions Report" as 

ATTACWiENT 2
 
Specific Support Grant
 

SEpTEI4ER 1977 (OTEI) 

follows:
 
woi) The Grantee shall suboit the SF 272 within 15
 

working days after the end of the reporting period, and
 

(2) The Grontee's cash needs for the ensuing period (i.e.,
 

quarter or month) shall be explained under the "Remarks"
 
section of the SF 272.
 
(b) Along with each SF 272 aubmlsslon, the Grantee shall
 

submit an original and 3 copies of SF 1034, "Public Voucher
 

for Purchases and Services Other Than Personal"; each
 
the and shallvoucher shall be Identified by Grant number 

state the total actual expenditures for the reporting
 
period.
 

or third
(c) Each quarterly voucher (i.e., SF 1034) 

monthly voucher, . the Grantee is on a monthly basis, 
shall also be supported by an original and 2 copies of
 

a SF 269, "Financial Status Report". 
 The SF 269 shall 
days after the end of the reportlngbe submitted within 30 

quarter and may b submitted separately from the SF 1034 
an..,.heSF 272; however, the SF 269 shall cover the same 

quarterly period as the SF 1034(s) and the SF 272(s). 
(d) Refund of Excess Funds
 
(1) If all costs have been settled under the Grant and
 

the Grantee fails to comply with the Grant Officer's
 

request for repayment of excess advance funds, the
 

Government shall have the right, on other contracts or
 
grants held with the Grantee, to withhold reimbursements
 
due to the Grantee in the amount of the excess being held
 

by the Grantee.
 
(2) If the Grantee is still holding excess advance funds
 

on a grant, contract, or similar instrument under which
 
the work has been completed or terminated but all costs
 
have not been settled, the Grantee agrees to:
 
(A) Provide within 30 days after requested to do so by
 

the Grant Officer, a breakdown of the dollar amounts which
 

have not been settled between the Government and the
 

Grantee. (The Grant Officer will 
assumre no costs are
 

in dispute if the Grantee fails to reply within 30 days.)
 

(B) Upon written request of the Grant Officer, return to
 

the Governent the sum of dollars, if any, which represents
 

the difference between (i)the Grantee's maximun. position
 

on claimed costs which have not been reimbursed and (ii)
 
the total amount of unexpended funds which have been ad

vanced under the Grant; and
 
(C) If the Grantee fails to comply with the Grant Officer's 
request for repayment of excess advance funds, the Govern

went shall have the right, on other contracts, grants or
 

similar instruments held with the Grantee. to withh)ld pay
tent of other advances and/or withhold reimbursements Me 

the Grantee in the auount of the excess being held by the
 

Grantee.
 

7C. PAYMENT--REIMBURSEMEIIT
 
(This provision is applicable to grants for construction, 
or to grants which do not provide for either a periodic 
advance or an FRLC in accordance with AID Handbook 13, 

paragraph 10.5.)
 
(a) Each month the Grantee shall submit to the AID
 

Controller an original and 3 copies of SF 1034, "Public
 

Voucher for Purchases and Services Other Than Personal";
 

each voucher shall be Identified by the Grant number and
 

shall state the total 
amount of costs incurred for which
 

reimbursement is being requested.
 
In addition to the SF 1034, cach non-construction
 

grant voucher shall be supported by an original and 2 

copies of SF 270, "Request for Advance or Reimbursement", 
and each construction grant voucher shall be supported by 

an original and 2 copies of SF 271, "Outlay Report and 

Request for Reimbursement for Construction Programs".
 

(b) 

c) Each quarterly voucher (or each third monthly voucher) 
a
shall also be supported by an original and 2 copies of 

SF 269, "Financial Status Report". The SF 269 shall be 

submitted within 30 days after the end (,fthe reporting 

quarter and may be submitted separately from the SF 1034;
 
however, the SF 269 shall 
cover the same quarterly period 

as the SF 1034(s). 

8. TRAVEL AND TRANSPORTATIOII
 
(This provision Ts--a-p-plcal when domestic or international 
air travel or shipment costs are reimbursable under the 
Grant.) 
(a) The Grant Officer hereby approves international air
 

travel hereunder provided that the Grantee shall obtain
 



written concurrence from the cognizant Project Officer 

in AID prior to sending any individual outside the United 

States to perform work under the Grant; the Grantee shall 


advise the Project Officer at least 30 days in advance 


df any trivel to be undertaken outside the United States. 


&fter con,.urrence is received the Grantee shall provide 

the cogniiant Mission or U. S. Embassy advance 

notification (with a copy to the Project nfficer) of the 

arrival date and flight identification of Grant financed 

traveller., 

(b) Travel to certain countries shall, at AID's option, 


When AID intends
he fr,dod from U.S.-owned local currency. 

to Py.rcise this option, it will so notify the Grantee after 


receipt of advice of intent tc travel required above. AID 

will issue a Government Transportation Request (GTR) which 

the,Grantee may exchange for tickets, 
or AID will issue the 


tickets directly. Use of such U.S.-owned currencies will 


Lonstitute a dollar charge to this Grant. 

(L) All International air travel and all international air 


United States
shipments under this Grant shall be made on 

fla carriers. Exceptions to this rule will be allowed 


in the following situations, provided that the Grantee 

certifIes to 
the facts in the voucher and other documents 

retain:d as part of his Grant records to support his 

(laim for reiinbursement and for pct audit: 

(1) Where the traveler, while enr.ute. has to wait 6 hours 


or Pore to transfer to a U.S. flag air carrier to proceed 


to the intended dostination, or 


02) Where a flight by a U.S. flag air carrier is inter-

rupted by a stop anticipated to be 6 hours or more for 

rfueling, reloading, repairs, etc. and no other flight 

by n U.S. flag air carrier is available during the 6 hour 

period, or 

(3) Where by itself or in combination with other U.S. flag 


.!lr carriers (ifU.S. flag air carriers are "unavailable") 

It takes 12 hours or longer from the original airport to 


the destination airport to accomplish the Grantee's program 

than would service by a non-U.S. flag air carrier or 

carriers, or 

(4) When the elapsed traveltime on a scheduled flight from 


urigin t-idestination airports by non-U.S. flag air 

carrier(,,) Is 3 hours or less, and services by U.S. flag air 


carrier(.) would involve twice such traveltime. 

NOT--:Where U.S. Government funds are used to reim-


burse Grtntee's use of other than 9.S. flag air carriers 


for international transportation, the Grantee will include 

a certification on vouchers 
invo'ving such transportation 

which is essentially as follows: 


CERTI-ACATION OF UNAVAILABIL'TY OF U.S. FLAG AIR CARRIERS 


I hereby certify that the trans~ortation service for per-


sonnel (nd their personal effects) or property by U.S. flag 


air carrier was unavailable for th~efollowing reason(s): 

(State atpropriate reason(s) as set forth above; see 41 CFR 


1-1.323-3 for further guidance). 

(d) Travel allowances shall be reimbursed in accordance 

with thiFederal Travel Regulations (FIR); however, if the 


Grantee'. domestic and international travel allowance 

policie, and procedures have been reviewed and approved by 

AID or nother Federal department or agency pursuant to the 


applical le Federal cost principles, the Grantee may use its 


travel allowance system in lieu of the FTRs after it has 

copy of such approval.
furnished the Grant Officer with a 


9. OCEAN SHIPMENT OF GOODS 

(Thi s-boTsfsn], appl-cable when ocean shipment costs 

are reimbursable under the Grant.) 

(a) 501 of all international ocean shipments made by the 

Grantee. to be financed hereunder, shall be made on U.S. 

flag vessels. Where U.S. flag vessels are not available, 

or their use would result in a significant delay, the 

Grantee may request a release from this requirement from 

the Transportation Support Division, Office of Commnodity 

Managqef.rit, AID, Washington, D.C. 20523, giving the basis 

for the request. 

(b) When the AID Transportation Support Division makes 

and issues a determination to the Grantee that U.S. flag 

vessels are not available, the ocean shipment costs on 

foreign flag vessels, as named in the determination, will 

be eligible for reimbursement under the Grant. In all 

instances Grantee vouchers submitted for reimbursement 

under the Grant which include ocean shipment costs will 

include a certification essentially as follows: "I 


AIACHMENI 2
 
Specific Support Grant
 
SEPTEMBER 1977 (OTEI)
 

here by certify that a copy of each ocean bill of lading
 
concerned has been subntted to the Maritime Administra
tion, Cargo Preference Control Center, Commerce Building,
 

Washington. D.C. 
 20235, and that such bill(s) of lading
 

state all of the carrier's charges including the basis for
 

calculation such as weight or cubic measurement, and indi

cate the applicable AID Grant Number."
 
(c) Shipments by voluntary non-profit relief agencies (i.e.,
 
PVO's) shall be governed by paragraphs (a)and (b)above
 
and by AID Regulation 2, "Overseas Shipments of Supplies
 
by Voluntary Non-Profit Relief Agencies" (22 CFR 202).
 

10. PROCUREMENT OF GOODS AND SERVICES UNDER $250,000
 
(This provision is ap licable when the total procurement
 
element (i.e., the sum of all purchase orders and contracts
 
for goods and services) 0f this Grant does not exceed
 
$250,000.)
 
(a) Geographic Source and Order of Preference
 

Except as may be specifically approved or directed in
 

advance by the Grant Officer, all goods (e.g., equipment,
 
vehicles, materials, and supplies) and services, the costs
 

of which are to be reimbursable under this Grant and which
 
will be financed with United States dollars, shall be
 
purchased in and shipped from only "Special Free World"
 

countries (i.e., AID Geographic Code 935) in accordance
 
with the following order of preference:
 
(1) the United States (AID Geographic Code 000),
 

(2) "Selected Free World" counties (AID Geographic Code
 

941),
 
(3) the cooperating country,
 
(4) "Special Free World" countries (AID Geographic Code
 

935).
 
(b) A lication of Order of Preference
 

iTen the Grantee procures goods and services from
 
other than U.S. sources, under the order of preference
 
in (a)above, it shall document its files to justify
 
each such instance. The documentation shall set forth
 
the circumstances surrounding the procurement and shall
 
be based on one or more of the following reasons, which
 
will be set forth in the Grantee's documentation:
 
(1) the pro:urement was of an emergency nature, which 
would not allow for the delay attendant to soliciting
 
U.S. sources,
 
(2) the price differential for procurement from U.S.
 
sources exceeded by 50% or more the delivered price from
 

the non-U.S. source,
 
(3) impelling local political considerations precluded
 
considerationi of U.S. sources,
 
(4) the goods or services were not available from U.S.
 

sources, or
 
(5) procurement of locally available goods or services,
 
as opposed to procurement of U.S. goods and services,
 
would best promote the objectives of the Foreign Assistance
 
Program under the Grant.
 
(c) Ineligible Goods and Services
 

Under no circumstances shall the Grantee procure any
 

of the following under this Grant:
 
(1) military equipment,
 
2 surveillance equipment,
 

commodities and services for support of police or
 

other law enforcement activities,
 
(4 abortion equipment and services,
 
5 luxury goods aridgambling equipment, or
 
6) weather modification equipment.
 
For a more detailed discussion of the subject, see AID
 

Handbook 1,Supplement B, paragraph 4D.)
 
If AID determines that the Grantee has procured any
 

of the ineligible goods and services specified above under 

this Grant, and has received reimbursement for such 
purpose, the Grantee agrees to refund to AID the entire 
amount of the purchase. 
(d) Restricted Goods
 

The Grantee shall not procure any of the following
 
goods or services from a non-U.S. source (i.e., other than
 
AID Geographic Code 000) without the prior writtten
 
authorization of the Grant Officer:
 
(1) agricultural commodities,
 
2 motor vehicles,
 
(3) pharmaceuticals.
 
4 pesticides,
 
5 plasticizers,
 

used equipment, or
 

-4



ATTACHMENT 2Specific Support Grant
 

SEPTEMBER 1977 (OTEI)
 

(2) To transfer title to any such Items to the Government
(7) U.S. Government-owned excess property. 

(For a detailed discussion of the subject, see AID In accordance with any written request therefor issued by
 

Handbook 1, Supplement B. paragraph 4C.) 
 the Grant Officer at any time prior to final payment
 

If AID determines that the Grantee has procured under this Grant.
 
any of the restricted goods specified above under this
 

TITLE TO AND CARE OF PROPERTY (U.S. GOVERNMENT)
Groint. without the prior written authorization of the 12B. 

(;rant Officer, and has received reimbursement for such (This provision is pplicable when title to property is
 

purpose, the Grantee agrees to refund to AID the entire vested in the U.S. Government.)
 

arount of the purchase. (a) Property, title to which vests in the Governent
 
under this Grdnt. whether furnished by the Government or
Grantee's Procurement System
(e) Thei 


(1) Thet-iee mnayuse its own procurement policies acquired by the Grantee, is subject to this provision and
 
is hereinafter collectively referrad to as "Governent
rnd procedures provided they conform to the geographic 

eriurce and order Lf preference requirements of this pro- property." Title to Government property shall not be 

vision and paragraphs 3. and 4., Attachment 0 of OMB 	 affected by the incorporation or attachment thereof to 

Lircular No. A-l10. 	 any property not owned by the Government, nor shall such 
(2) If the Grantee's procurement policies and procedures 	 Government property, or any part thereof, be or become a 

have been reviewed against the procurement requirements fixture or lose its identity as personalty by reason of 

el paragraphs 3. and 4. of Attachment 0 to OMB Circular affixation to any realty. 

tic.A-1I1and have been approved by AID or another Federal (b) Use of Government Property 
Government property shall, unless otherwise providedflepartment or agency, the Grantee shall furnish the 

6rrt Officrr with a copy of such approval; otherwise herein or approved by the Grant Officer, be used only for
 

the Grantee's procurement policies and procedures 'shall the performance of this Grant.
 

confomr to the specified req'irements of OMB Circular (c) Control, Repair of Government !
Maintenance and ert 

No. A-11O. (See AID Handbook 13, Chapter 1, paragraph The Grantee shall maintain and in accordane 
with sound business practice a program for the maintenance,
1u.) 

repair, protection, and preservation of Government property
(f) Small Business 


-, 	 so as to assure its full availability and usefulness for
To-p-T-T7(T in accordance with the small business 
provisions of the Foreign Assistance Act of 1961, as amended, the p Irformance of this Grant. The Grantee shall take 

-c live United States small business firms an opportunity all reasonable steps to comply with all appropriate 
directions or instructions which the Grant Officer may
-o participate In supplying commodities anc servicEs pro-


:ured tinder this Grant, the Grantee, shall, to the maximum 
 prescribe as reasonably necessary for the protection of 

e''tent possible, provide the following information to the the Government property. 

',.llBusiness Office, AID, Washington, D.C. 20523 at The Grantee shall submit, for review and written approval 

;,jt 45 days prior (except where a shorter time is of the Grant Officer, a records system for property 
rfrquested of, and granted by the Small Business Office) control and a program for orderly maintenance of Government 

to placing any order or contract in excess of $25,000: property; however, if the Grantee's property control and 

(1' Brief general description and quantity of goods or maintenance system has been revieqed and approved by 
another Federal department or agency pursuant to Attachmentservices; 
N of OMB Circular No. A-1I1(see paragraph IT of Chapter
 

lids; and 1. AID Handbook 13). the Grantee shall fUrnish the Grant

(11 Closing date for receiving quotations, proposals, or 


(3) Address where invitations or specifications can be 	 Officer proof of such approval inlieu o another
 
approval submission.
obtained. 

(1) Property Control
(g) Inelij'.ble SuppliLers 

The property contr-olsystem shall include but not
Tu6--s pravidN-unier this Grant shall not be used 


to procure any conrodity or commedity-related services be limited to the following:
 
(A) Identification of each item of Government property
furni',hed by any supplier whose name appears on the 


Ineligible Suppliers under AID Requlation 8, 	 acquired or furnished under the Grant by a serially
List of 

"Suppliers of Comnnonities and Commodity-Related Services controlled identification number and by description of
 

Ineligible for AID Financing" (22 CFR 208). The Grantee item. Each item must be clearly marked "Property
 

agrees to review said list prior to undertaking any pro- of U.S. Government."
 
(B) The price of each item of property acquired or
curement the cost of which is to be reimbursable under 


this Grant. AID will provide the Grantee with this furnished under the Grant.
 
(C) The location of each item of property acquired or
list. 

furnished under the Grant.
 
(0) A record of any usable components which are
II. GOVER1NMENT FURNISHED EXCESS PERSONAL PROPERTY 


(lhis p-ao-f-ipplies when personal property is fur- permanently removed from items of Government property as
 

ni,.hed under the Grant.) 
 a result of modification or otherwise.
 

The policies and procedures of AID Handbook 16, "Excess 
 (E) A record of disposition of each item acquired or
 

Property", and the appropriate provisions of 41 CFR furnished under the Grant.
 
Date of order and receipt of any item acquired or
101-43 apply to the government furnished excesspersonal (F) 

property under this Grant. furnished under the Grant.
 
The official property control records shall be
 

I?A, TITLE TO AND USE OF PROPERTY N TITLE) 
 kept in such condition that at any stage of completion
 
of the work under this Grant, the status of property
(This F-s-o-i6-I- -p-icable when te vernment vests 


title in the Grantee only.) acquired or furnished under this Grant may be readily
 

Title to all property financed under this Grant shall vest ascertained. A report of current status of all items
 

in the Grantee, subject to the following conditions: of property acquired or furnished under the Grant shall
 

(a) lieGrantee shall not charge for any depreciation, be submitted yearly concurrently with the annual report.
 

amortization, or use of any property, title to which 
 (2) Maintenance Program
 
remains in the Grantee under this provision under this The Grantee's maintenance program shall be such as
 

Grant or any other U.S. Government grant, subgrant, to provide for, consiste-t with sound business practice
 
end the terms of the Grant: (i)disclosure of need for
contract or subcontract. 

and the performance of preventive maintenance, (ii)
(b) The Grantee agrees to use and maintain the property 


nor the purpose of the Grant in accordance with the disclosure and reporting of need for capital type rehabil
recording of work accomplished under
riruIrenients of paragraph IT of Chapter 1, 'AIDHandbook 13. itation, and (iii) 


(() With respect to nonexpendable property having an the program.
 
(A) Preventive maintenance - Preventive maintenance is
anjuisition cost of $1,000 or more, title to which vests 


in the Grantee, the Grantee agrees: 	 maintenance gernerally performed on a regularly scheduled
 
basis to prevent the occurrence of defects and to detect
(I) To report such items to the Grant Officer from time 


to time as they are acquired and to maintain a control and correct minor defects before they result in serious
 

sysLem which will permit their ready identification and consequences.
 
location. 
 (B) Records of maintenance - The Grantee's maintenance
 



ATTArM14ENT 2
 
Specific Support Grant
 
SEPTEMBER 1977 (OTEI)
 

proqram shall provide for records sufficient to disclose assistance and cooperation (including assistance in the
 
the maintenance actions performed and deficiencies prosecution of suit and the execution of instruments of
 
discovered as a result of inspections, assignments in favor of the Government) in obtaining


A report of status of maintenance of Government recovery.
 
property shall be submitted annually concurrently (e) Access
 
with tile annual report. T T9vernment, and any persons designated by it, 
d) Risk of Los. shall at all reasonable times have access to the premises
il Ti rt. shall not be liable for any loss of or wherein any Government property is located, for the purpose

dlan.olqu to tle Government property, or for expenses of inspecting the Government property.
intidental to such loss or damage except that the f) Final Account iin and Disposition of Government Property 
Grantee shall 'e responsible for any such loss or damage Upon completion 6-Fti1s Grant, or at c-ear er
 
(itidlJidinoexpeises incidental thereto): dates as may be fixed by the Grant Officer, the Grantee 
(i) white0result, from willful misconduct or lack of shall submit, in a for acceptable to the Grant Officer,
 
loll fjltit Grantee's directors
on the part of ,ny of the inventory schedules covering all items of Government 
tool itrs, or on the part of any of its managers, property not consumed in the performance of this Grant 
,iup.rinttndents, or other equivalent representatives, who or not theretofore delivered to the Government, and shall
,,I p or direction of all prepare deliver, or make such other disposal of the,ervision or substantially all 

o. the Grantee's business, or all or substantially all of Government property as may t-e directed or authorized by 
tne Grantee's operations at any one plant, laboratory, or the Grant Officer. 
;Pearate location in which this Grant is being performed; (g) Communications 
;,) Whicn results from a failure on the part of the Al1 cormunications issued pursuant to this provision
,rjntee, due to the willful nfsconduct or lack of goad shall be in.oriting. 
t,'ith the part of any of its directors, officers, oron 
..ther r.presentatives mentioned in (I)above, (A) to 12C. 1lLE TO AND CARE OF PROPERTY (COOPERATING COUNTRY TITLE)
.iliitait, accordance with sound business (This provision is applicable to propeFtrty tted in theand administer, in 
,,ractict., tee program for maintenance, repair, protection, name of the cooperating country or such public or private
-ni prev.ervit ion of Government property as required by agency as the Cooperating Gowernmen. may designate.)
i)ahcie, or (b')to take all reasonable steps to comply (a) Except as modified by Attachment 1 of this Grant,

.ith a',approi)riate written directions of the Grant title to all equipment, materials and supplies, the 
"ri1er un;r (c)aboive; cost of which is reimbursable to the Grantee by AID or by
,0) 'or whieh the Grantee is otherwise responsible under the Cooperating Government, shall at all times be in the - p, terTi:s name of the Cooperating Government or such public or privatepets of the article or articles designated 

Attach,vnt I to this Grant. agency as the Cooperating Governmnt may designate, unless
 

,v) Wloch results frc(ma risk expressly required to be title to specified types or classes of equipment is
 
'%.ted under some other provision of this Grant, but only reserved to AID under provisions set forth in
 

the extent of the insurance so required to be procured Attachment 1 of this Grant; but all such property shall 
,idmaintained, or to the extent of insurance actually be under the custody and control of the Grantee until
 
recured and 111intained, whichever is greater; or the owner of title directs otherwise or conpetion of
 

Whi:h result., frort a risk which is in fact covered work under this Grant or its termination, at which time
 
insurance or for which the Grantee is otherwise custody and control shall be turned over to the owner of 

,timbursed, but only to the extent of such insurance or title or disposed of in accordance with its instructions. 
"elmbursement; All performance guarantees and warranties obtained from 

Provided, that, if rnore than one of the above suppliers shall be taken in the name of the title owner. 
,xceptions snail be applicable in any case, the Grantee's (b) The Grantee shall prepare and establish a program,
:lability under any one exception shall not be limited to be approved by the Mis:ion, for the receipt, use, 
',yany other exception, maintenance, protection, custody and care of equipment,

The Grantee shill not be reimbursed for, and shall materials and supplies for which it has custodial 
: include as an item of overhead, the cost of insurance, responsibility, including the establishment of reasonable 

,W anv provision for a reserve, covering the risk of controls to enforce such program. The Grantee shall be 
lo ,s (ifor damage to the Government property, except guided by the requirements of paragraph IT of Chapter 1,AID 
to the extent th:itthe Government may have required the Handbook 13.
 
Gaontee to cirry such insurance under any other provision (c) Within 90 days after completion of this Grant, or
 
of Ihis Gran.. at such other date as may be fixed by the Grant Officer,
 
(3) Ul on the haopening of loss or destructiom of or the Grantee shall submit an inventory schedule covering
Oni,, to the Government property, the Grantee shall notify all items of equipment, materials and supplies under 

the (;rant Offic(_r thereof, shall take all reasonable steps his custody, title to which is in the Cooperating Govern
if)protect the iovernment property from further damage, ment or public or private agency designated by the 
,ehart the dauutged and undamaged Government property, Cooperating Government, which have not been consumed In 
put all the Governent property in the best possible the performance of this Grant. The Grantee shall also 
,ide,,and furnish to the Grant Officer a statement of: indicate what disposition has been made of such property. 
I) The lo,.t,destroyed, and damaged Govrrnment property; 
ii) Iht: time and origin of the loss, destruction, or 13. CONVERSION OF UNITED STATES DOLLARS TO LOCAL CURRENCY 
I ,,f; Upon arrival in the Cooperating Country, and from time to 
(Iii) All knowm interests in commingled property of which time as appropriate, the Grantee's Chief of Panrty shall 
the Gk)vernment property isa part; and consult with the Mission Director who shall provide, in 
'iv) Tre insuranre, if any, covering any part of or writing, the procedure the Grantee and its employees shall 
litt,'5 in such cou'i'ngled property, follow in the conversion of United States dollars to 

Thi l6rintet ,hall make repairs and renovations of the local currency. This may include, but is not limited to,
dIiln,'rd take such other action as the conversion of said currency through the cognizant UnitedGovirnment. property or 
tnliGrar,t im.er rirects. States Disbursing Officer or Mission Controller, as 
(0) In th,.,vent the Grantee is indemnified, reimbursed, appropriate. 
or oth,.rine (:ornpen,,lted for any loss or destruction of 
or driii, to th,,Government property, it shall use the 14. TERMINATION 

r
 proc . to repair, renovate or replace the Government (a) For Cause. This Grant may be terminated for cause 
iloltrIy Invloved, or shall credit such proceeds against at any time, in wholeor in part, by the Grant Officer 
the t,.! of tilework covered by the Grant. or shall other- upon written notice to the Grantee, whenever for any 
.,, reinbllrse the Governnent, as directed by the Grant reason he/she shall determine that such termination is 
OIlLer. The (,rantee shall do nothing to prejudice the in the best interest of the Government. 
(.cvirnriwnt's right torecover against third parties for (b) Fo' Convenience. This Grant may be terminated for 
any %uch loss, destruction, or damage, and upon the convenience at any time by either party, in whole or in 
request of the Grant O)fficer, shall, at the Government's part, if both parties agree that the continuation of the 
experse, furnish to the Government all reasonable Grant would not produce beneficial results commensurate 



ATTACHMENT 2 
Specific Support Grant
 
SEPTEMBER 1977 (OTEI)
 

with the further expenditure of funds. Both parties 
shall agree upon termination conditions, including the 
effective date and, in the case of partial terminations, 
the portion to be terminated. The agreement to terminate 
shall be set forth in a letter from the Grant Officer 
to the Grantee. 
(c) Termination Pro(edures. Upon receipt of and in 
W,-rO ncI--w-T;-t-i--n-at-on notice as specified inT 

eIther paragraph (a) or (b) above, the Grantee shall 

ffrthwlth take inmnediate action to minimize all ex-
perdltureS and obligations financed by this Grant, and 
.hall 'ncel such unliquldited obligations whenever 
pu-ssible. Except as provided below, no further reim-
burt,e ilIt shall be made after the effective date of ter-
mination, and the Grantee shall within 30 calendar days 

after the effective date of such termination repay to 
the Government all unexpended portions of funds thereto-
fore paid by the Government to the Grantee which are not 

otherwise obligat;,d by a legally binding transaction 
applicable to this Grant. Should the funds paid by the 
Govennent to the Grantee prior to the effective date 
of the tennination of this Grant, be insufficient to cover 
the Grantee's obligations pursuant to the aforementioned 

legally binding transaction, the Grantee may submit to 

the. Gov.rrabent within go calendar days after the effective 
date of .uch termination a written claim covering such 
ollial'on,. and subject to the limitations contained 
in thl.-Grart, the Grant Officer shall determine the 

XTwUni or amount' to be paid by the Government to the 

(,rawteo uoidr such clair, in accordance with the applicable 

lederal cost principles. 


!,. VLIIVITAIY PARTICIPATIOIN 

(This, priJTiv in lTl--le to all grants invol ving 

.
1T 

ecttof iamily or population assistance activities, 

ind all 7itle X grants in narticular.) 

(a) lhe Grantee agrees to take any steps necessary to 
ensure that funds made available under this Grant will not 
hr used to coerce any InJividual to practice methods of 
,orily pldnning inconsistent with such individual's moral, 


lJ.ilosophic.al, or religious beliefs. Further, the Grantee
 
, 


agree t.oconduct its activities in a manner which safe-

quard, tho riqhts, health and welfare of all individuals 

who tctkepart in the program. 

(b) The Grantee shall insert paragraphs (a) and (b) of 


this provision in all subgrants, subcontracts, purchase 

order,, and any other subordinate agreements hereunder. 


16. PROIIIBITION ON ABORTION-RELATED ACIVITIES 
(Thils--oiin-J--plicable to all grants involving any 


aspect of family or population assistance activities, and 


all Title X grants in particular.) 

(a) No funds made available under this Grant will be used 

to finance, support, or be attributed to the following 


activities: (1) procurement or distribution of equip-

t-entintended to be used for the purpose of inducing 

abortions as a method of family planning; (2) special 
fees or incentives to women to coerce or motivate them 
to hive abortions; (3) payments to persons to perform 
abortions or to solicit persons to undergo abortions; 
(4) lnformition, education, training, or communication 

prorp vns that seek to pronote abrtion 3s a method of 

fimile planning. 

(0;) theGrantee shall insert pa, agraphs (a) and (b) of 
this prnvision in all subgrants, subcontracts, purchase 
orders, and any other subordinate agreements hereunder. 

11. VOLUITARY PARIICIPATION REQUIREMENTS FOR STERILIZATION 


(This pTE-sT-i is applicable when any surgical steriliza-

tion will he supported in whole or in part from funds under 


this Grart. ) 

(a) None of the funds made available under this Grant shall 
be used to py for the performance of involuntary sterili-

zatiron as a method of family planning or to coerce or provide 

any financial Incentive to any person to practice steriliza-

t itn. 
(b) The Grantee shall insure that any surgical steriliza-


tion procedures supported in whcle or in part by funds from 


this Grant are performed only alter the individual has 


voluntarily presented himself or herself at the treatment
 
facility and has given his or her informed consent to the
 
sterilization procedure. Infortied consent means the volun
tary, knowing assent from the individual after he or she
 
has been advised of the surgical procedures to be followed,
 
the attendant discomforts and risks, the benefits to be 
expected, the availability of alternative methods of family
 
planning, the purpose of the operation and its irreversi
bility, and his or her option to withdraw consent anytime
 

prior to the operation. An individual's consent is con

sidered voluntary if it is based upon the exercise of free
 
choice and is not obtained by any special inducement or
 
any element of force, fraud, deceit, duress or other forms
 
of coercion or misrepresentation.
 
(c) Further, the Grantee shall docunent the patient's
 
informed consent by (1) a written consent document in a 
language the patient understands and speaks, which explains
 
the basic elements of informed consent, as set out above, 
and which is signed by the individual and by the attending
 
physician or by the authorized assistant of the attending 
physician; or (2) when a patient is unable to read adequate
ly,a written certification by the attending physician or by
 
the authorized assistant of the attending physician that 
the basic elements of informed consent above were orally
 

presented to the patient, and that the patient thereafter 
consented to the performance of the operation. The receipt 
of the oral explanatior; shall be acknowledged by the patient's 
mark on the certification and by the signature or mark of a 
witness who shall be of the same sex and speak the same 
language as the patient. 
(d) Copies of informed consent forms and certification 
documents for each voluntary sterilization (VS) procedure 

must be retained by the Grantee for a period of three years 
after preformance of the sterilization procedure. 
Ce) The Grantee shall insert partgraphs (a), (b), (c), 
d) and Ce) of this provision in all subgrants, sub
contracts, purchase orders, and any other subordinate 
agreements hereunder involving the performance of any 
sterilization which will be supported in whole or in part
 
from funds under this Grant.
 

18. PUBLICATIONS
 
(This provision is applicable to any grant which produces
 
any book, publication, or other copyrightable materials.)
 
(a) If it is the Grantee's intention to identify AID's
 

contribution to any publication resulting from this Grant,
 
the Grantee shall consult with AID on the nature of the
 
acknowledgement prior to piblication.
 
(b) The Grantee shall provide the Project Manager with
 
one copy of all published works developed under the Grant.
 
The Grantee shall provide the Project Manager with lists
 

of other written work produced under the Grant.
 
(c) In the event Grant funds are used to underwrite the
 
cost of publishing, in lieu of the publisher assuming
 
this cost as is the normal practice, any profits or
 
royalties up to the amount of such cost shall be credited 
to the Grant.
 
(d) The Grantee is permitted to secure copyright to any
 
publication produced or composed under the Grant in
 
accordance with paragraph IT8.b. of Chapter I. AID Handbook 13. 
Provided, the Grantee agrees to and does hereby grant to 
the Government a royalty-free, non-exclusive and irrevocable 
license throughout the world to use, duplicate, disclose, 
or dispose of such publications in any manner and for any 
purpose to permit others to do so. 

19. PATENTS
 
(This pro-vi-son is applicable to any Grant which produces
 

patentable items, patent rights, processes, or inventions.)
 
(a) Grantee agrees to notify the Grant Officer, in
 
writing, of any invention or discovery conceived or
 

first actually reduced to practice in the course of or
 
under this Grant. The Grant Officer will determine the 
patent rights to be afforded the Grantee in accordance
 
with the Presidential Memorandum and Statement of
 
Government Patent Policy (36 FR 16889) and paragraph
 
1T8.a. of Chapter 1,AID Handbook 13. 
(b) Nothing contained in this provision shall imply a li

cense to the Government under any patent or be construed
 
as affecting the scope of any license or other right other

-7

http:lJ.ilosophic.al


ATTACHMENT 2
 
Spcific Support Grant
 

SETIMBER 1977 (OTEI)
 

wise granted to the Government under any patent, 	 without liability or, in its discretion, to deduct from
 
the Grant amount, or otherwise recover, the full amount
 

20. 	 REGULATIONS GOVERNING EMPLOYEES OUTSIDE TIE of each commission, percentage, brokerage, or contingent 
--rDffKT-ATS i fee.
 

(This pi--on--ipplicable only to the Grantee's U.S.
 
and third country national employees, it is not applicable 24. NONLIABILITY
 
to the Grantee's cooperating country national employees.) AID does not assume liability with respect to any third
 
(a) The Grantee's cvployees, when employed in work over- party claims for damages arising out of work supported 
seas, shall rtmaintain private status and may not rely on by this Grant. 
local U.S. Goverrvnent offices of facilities for support 
whil i so engaged. 25. AMENDMENT 
(h) fiiesale of personal property or automobiles by The Grantmy be amended by formal modifications to the 
Grantee employoes and their dependents in the foreign basic grant document or by means of an exchange of 
c.ountry to which they are assigned shall be subject to letters between the Grant Officer and an appropriate 
thi same linit,itions and prohibitions which apply to official of the Grantee. 
dIrct-hire AID personnel employed by the Mission, except 
as this n:y conflict with host government regulations. 26. THE GRANT 
(c) Other than work to be perfnrmed under this Grant for The letter to the Grantee signed by the Grant Officer, 
which an employee or consultant is assigned by the Grantee, the Program Description and the Standard Provisions
 
no re(ular or short term employee or consultant of the which have been reviewed and agreed to by the Grantee,
 
Grantee shall engage directly or indirectly, either constitute the Grant.
 
in his own name or in the nany? or through an agency of
 
another person, ir any business, profession, or occupation 27. NOTICES 
in the foreiqr. countries to which he is assigned, mor shall Any notice given by any of the parties hereunder, shall 
hp make loan. or Investments to or in any business, be sufficient only if in writing and delivered in person 
profesloi or occupation in the foreign countries to which or sent by telegraph, cable, registered or regular mail 
hv Is assijned. 	 as follows: 
(d) ThneGrantee's enmployees, while in a foreign country, To the AID Grant Officer at the address 
,-r,, show for its conventions, customs, specified in the Grant!xpected to respect 
a Id to abide by and institutlons, its applicable laws To Grantee At Grantee's address shown in 
rquilationfl, and not. to interfere in its internal political the Grant, or to such other address as either of such 
..lairs. parties shall designate by notice given as herein 
e) In 	 the evetntthe conduct of any Grantee employee is required. Notices hereunder, shall be effective when 

nut In a,,cordonce with the preceding paragraphs, the delivered in accordance with this provision or on the 
(oirlee's chiefI of party shall consult with the Mission effective date of the notice, whichever is later. 
(lirictcr and thc employee involved and shall recommend to 
thsGrantee n course of action with regard to such employee. 
(1) [he parties recognize the right of the U.S. Ambassador 
to direct the rermoval from a country of any U.S. citizen 
or the discharge from this Grant of any third country 
nitiunal when, in thn discretion of the Ambassador, the 
interests, of the United States so require. 
(f) If it is dt.,,rmined, under either (e) or (f) above, 
that the sPrvices of such employee shall be terminated, 
the Grantee shall use its best efforts to cause the 
return of such inpiloyee to the United States, or point 
of origin, a, approoriate. 

?I SI BORDINATI AGki.EMENTS 
ihe 11,tG,liTn-<-r- T ,te aqreiitwnts (e.g., leases, 

options, etc.), grants, or contracts with other organi
zations, firms or institutions and the provisions of such 
!,ubcrdinie arireecnts are subject to prior written 
consent of the (irant Officer if they will be funded 
hereunder, unless the,Grantee's procurement system has
 
bee-nreviewed and approved pursuant to the appropriate
 
section(s) of paragraph 1U. Chapter 1 of AID Handbook
 
i3. In no event shall any such subordinate agreement,
 
qr snt, or contract be on a cost-plus-a-percentage-of-cost
 
bsis. Subordinate contractors (including suppliers) shall
 
be selected on a competitive basis to the maximum 
practicable extent consistent with the obligations and
 
requirements of this Grant. 

2?. U.S. OFFICIALS NOT TO BENEFIT
 
No me -er- -OroeJ-t-toteTe S. Congress or resident
 
U.S. conrissioner shall be admitted to any share or part
 
of this Grant or to any benefit that may arise therefrom;
 
but this provision shall not be construed to extend to
 
this (rant if made with a corporation for its general
 
benef i t.
 

Z1. i OVIIANT AGAIN'il CONTINGENI FEES
 
The Gia ntee wnartrt iat no selling agency
-} person or 

has, bnen fnmployed or retained to solicit or secure this
 
,rait upon an aqrneisnt or understanding for a commission,
 
permentaqie, brokeragei, or contigent fee except bona fide
 
implove, or bona fil, established comnercial or selling
 
,,;eniies maintained by the Grantee for the purpose of
 
securing business. Fon breach or violation of this
 
warranty. AID shall have the right to cancel this Grant
 

-8



ATTACHMENT 2 (SUPPLEMENT)
 
Specific Support Grants
 
August 1978 (Both El & OTEI)
 

U.S. Grantees and U.S. Subgrantees

(BOTH EDUCATIONAL INSTITUTIONS AND 


28. ALTERATIONS IN STANDARD PROVISIONS 


The Standard Provision of the September 1977 Edition have 

been changed as follows: 

a. Standard Provision 7A. PAYMENT -.FEDERAL RESERVE 

LETTER OF CREDIT (FRLC) ADVANCE
 
(1) Delete the applicability statement and substitute 

the following therefor:
 

(This proviion is applicable when the sum of all
 

advances under the Grantee's contracts and grants with 

AID exceeds $120,000 per annum and AID has, or expects
 
to have, a continuing relationship with the Grantee 

for at least a year.)
 

(2) Delete the term "TUS" in paras. (a),(d)(4)(A), 

(d)(4)(C), and (d)(5) and substitute the term "TFS" 

therefor.
 

(3) Delete the term "SEP/FM" wherever it appears in
 
para. (c)and substitute the term "the AID Controller" 

tierefor; also delete the term "Office of Financial 

Hanagement" in para. (d)(7) and substitute the term 

"the AID Controller" therefor. 


(4) Delete the figures "10,000" and '$1,000,000" 

in para. (a)and substitute the figures "$5,000" and 

"35,000,000", respectively, therefor. 


(5) Delete the words "less than" in para.(d)(7) and 

substitute te words "ice than" therefor. 

b. Standard Provision 7B. PAYhENT-PERIODIC ADVANCE 

Delete t e v-p-l- lily statoint and substitute the 

following therefor: 


(This provi'in is applicable when (1) the sum of 

all advances under the Grantee's contracts and grants 

with AID does not exceed S120,000 per annum, or (2) 

when the sum of all such advances does exceed
 
S120,000 pe' annum, but ihere is riot a continuing 

relationship with the Grairtee of at least one year
 

c. Stand:ird Provision 10. PROCUREMENT OF GOODS AND 
SERVICSUDRSSO
 
Delete the entire provision and substitute the following 

therefor:
 

10. PROCUREMENT OF GOODS AND SERVICES UNDER $250,000T~fhis provrsion is --~'-b - en the total 
procurement element (i.e., the sum of all pur-
chase orders and contracts for goods and services)
of thi, Grant does rot exceed $250,000.) 

(a) IneLgible Goods and Services 


Under no circumstances shall the Grantee procure 

any of the following under this Grant: 


(I) military equipment, 


(2) surveillance equipment, 


(3) ccnrodities and services for support of police 

or other law enforcement activities, 


(4) abortion equipm'ent and services,
 

(5) luxury goods and gambling equipment, or 


(6) weather modification equipment. 


(For a more detailed discussion of the subject, see 
AID Handbook 1, Supplemene 3, paragraph 4D.) 

If AID determines that the Grantee has procured 

any of the ineligible goods anj services specified

above under this Grant, 5nd ha received reimburse-

ment for such purpose, the Grantee agrees to refund 
to AID the entire amount of the purcnase.
 

ITHER THA EDUCATIONAL INSTITUTIONS)
 

(b) Restricted Goods
 
ihe Grantee shall not procure any of the following


goods or services from a non-U.S. source (i.e., other than"
 
AID Geographic Code O00) without the prior written
 
authorization of the Grant Officer:
 

(1) ajricultural coqnodities,
 

(2) motor vehicles,
 

(3) pharmaceuticals,
 

(4) pesticides,
 

(5) plastici;ers,
 

(6) used equipment, or
 

(7) U.S. Governmnt-owned excess property.
 

(For a detailed discussion of the subject, see AID
 
Handbook 1, Supplement B. paragraph 4C.)


7f AID determines that the Grantee has procured any
of the restricted goods specified above under this Grant,
without the prior written authorization of the Grant 
Officer, and has received reimbursement for such purpose,
the Grantee agrees to refund to AID the entire amount of
 
the purchase.
 

(c) G,'ogrmrhic Source and Order of Preference 
Excep:.a. may be specifically approved or directed
 

inadvance by the Grant Officer under paragraph 10(b)

above, all other goods (e.g., equipment, materials, and
 
supplies) and services, the costs of which are to be
 
reimbursable under this Grant and which will be financed
 
with United States dollars, shall be purchased in and
shipped from only "Special Free World" countries (i.e.,

AID Geographic Code 935) in accordance with the following
 
order of preference:
 

(1) the United States (AID Geographic Code 000)
 

(2) "SelecteH Free World" countries (AID Geographic

Code 941).
 

(3) the cooperating country,
 

(4' "Special Free World" countries (AID Geographic
 
Code 935).
 

(d) Apphente or e pr freene
 
h e procures goods and services from other
 

thEn U.S. sources, under the order of preference in 10(c)
 
above, it shall document its files to justify each such

instance. The documentation shall set forth the circum
stances surrounding the procurement and shall be based
 
on one or morv jf the following reasons, which will be
 
set forth in ihe Grantee's documentation:
 

(1) the procurement was of an emergency nature, which
 
would not allow for the delay attendant to soliciting

U.S. sources,
 

(2) the price differential for procurement from U.S.
 
sources exceeded by 50% or more the delivered price from
 
the non.-U.S, source,
 

(3) impelling local political considerations precluded
 
consideration of U.S. sources,
 

(4) the goods or services were not available from U.S.
 
sources, or
 

(5) procurement of locally available goods or services,
 
as opposed to procurement of U.S. goods and services, would
 
best promote the objectives of the Foreign Assistance
 
Program under the Grant.
 



(P) The Grantee's Procurement System,
 

(1) The Grantee may use its own procurement policies
 

and procedures provided they conform to the geographic
 
source and order of preference requirements of this pro

vision and paragraphs 3 and 4, Attachment 0 of OMB
 

Circular No. A-110.
 

(2) If the Grantee's.procurement policies and procedures
 

have been reviewed against the procureirent requirements
 

of paragraphs 3 and 4 of Attachment 0 to OMB Circular
 

No. A-lO and have been approved by AID or another
 
Federal department or agency, the Grentee shall furnish
 

the Grant Officer a copy of such approval; otherwise 
the Grantee's procurement policies and procedures shall 
conform to the specified requirements of OMB Circular
 

No. A-11O. (See AID Handbook 13, Chapter 1, paragraph
 

1U.)
 

(f) Small Business
 

To permit AID, in accordance with the small business
 
provisions of the Foreign Assistance Act ef 1961, as amended,
 

to give United States small business firms an opportunity
 
to participate in supplying conodities and services
 
procured under this Grant, the Grantee, shall, to the
 
maximum extent possible, provide the following informa
tion to the Small Business Office, AID, Washington D.C.
 
20523 at least 45 oays prior (except where a shorter time
 
is requested of, and granted by the Small Business
 
Office) to placing any order or contract in excess of
 

$25,000:
 

(1) Brief general description and quantity of goods
 
or services;
 

(2) Closing date for receiving quotations, proposals,
 
or bids; and
 

(3) Address where invitations or specifications can
 
be obtained.
 

(g) Ineligible Suppliers
 

Funds provided under this Grant shall not be used
 
to procure any corimodity or commodity-related services
 
furnished by any supplier whose name appears on the
 
List of Ineligible Suppliers under AID Regulation
 
8, "Suppliers of Coimnodities and Cormodity-Related 
Services Ineligibl: for AID Financing" (22 CFR 208).
 
The Grantee agrees to review said list prior to
 
undertaking any procurement the cost of which is
 
to be reinbursable under this Grant. AID will provide
 
the Grantee with this list.
 

ATTACHMENT 2 (SUPPLEMENT) 
Specific Support Grants 
August 1978 (BOTH EI & OTEI) 


