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Please Rreply to: Kotak Pos 105
Surakarta
018/EM/TAL 75KN /B2
0l FPebrucry 1982
Mr. Soosacca Mgl todiningrat, D2irector
Directorate of Sanitary Engincering

Directoracte Cuneral Cipta Karya
J1. Pattimura No. 20

Kebayoran Baru

Jakarta Selatan

“he Consultant Services for
Ql/WNS-S/1/AKID/78

Contract for
Surakarta Wa-.uvr System No.

Subject

dated 28 Octoiwr 1978 as Amended 23 July 1831,
Dear Sir,
n accordance with Section 4,12 ard Appendix T of the
subjec* Contract, we are p.:iaged to submit fifteen
ccples of the Montnly Repor- No. 40 for the manth of
J anuarxry 1982 .
we trust that this report will meet with vour apvroval.
Very truly yours,
BURNS & MC DONNELL QEHBKR[NG Co.
TRANS-ASIA ENGINMLRL K, INC,
Q‘ 4 o ‘. N
VEVEASERTANR
>/ B AN
“ ‘l“? Ayl Yeoius .' j‘
( W’% Ceptrul” }ave /':‘;;7_ /
J.F. BLUCOM I R.L &
) [N LA B IR AN > e
ACTING CHIEL th,w
ce CIwsP L-=r"arang (10 copies)
USAID akavta { 5 copios;
EM/TAE Jakarta ( 2 copnies)
Burins & Mc Donnell Kansas City { 1 copy )
JIUSP T Sarakarts (1 copv )
Sk Shrakarta ( 1 nopy )
Mivor of Surakacta Carannirta L cony )
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NARRATIVE SUMMARY

The final bath house location was resolved in
January. No. 3-] will now be in the immediate
vicinity of Pasar Nusukan, one of the highest

rated areas in the Tity of Surakarta for chol-

3

era the last few yszars. This will provide not
only bathing and sanitary facilities, but also
a public hydrant for the citizens to obtain
water. The tie-in tor distribution Line "L-I"
to Line "L" at that same intersection has been
made and a new firc hydrant will be set there
which will give ihe area needed fire protection,
Tenders for the remaining public latrines are
being deiayed pendinyg receipt of required in-
formation firom Surakarta DPU. It is hoped
negotia.ons for that work may bhe finalized in

thhc month of Uebruaary.

Steel beams and pipe for stream crossings werc
received by 2hasc I anéd II contractors in the
latter half of January. Work is in progress
to —complete all stream crossings. Most of the
activitics of the Phase I contractor centered
around instaliaticn of the replacement A450 mm
transmission main along Jl. Kol. Sutarto in
Xelurahan Jebres. 1t was found the old piping
only has 0.3 meters of cover on the north-south
rur from the rese:voir. The total planned dis-
tributicn main work in the Project now is 58%  com-
plete, with Phase I at 69.6 and Phase II 59%.

Price quotations were received and cevaluated in
Januaxry and by moncihs end, Cipta Karya had for-

warded their reguest: €or approval to proceed
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James FooBaucom, Acting Chier Eoginasy

arrivad 26 Sevtesbor 1970

Aibert G, Ringlez, 0 & M Specialis:t

arrvived 09 May 198°

wdovasian Professional aand Tecunical :
T - -

wohamnad Khalil, dacerials Coocdivaios

arxrived 09 cctober 1978

Mohamad Syarif Lembah, Conztructing Sunarv?

arrived 61 Mz 1979

Garut Bramono, I.chc dold
pe

arrivad 19 Moromper 1279

Soewanto, Inspector
arrived 1l March 1980

Abdul Rasyid, Inspeccor
arrived 11 June 1981

Susena, Draftsman
arrived 20 October 1980

S0



Adninistrative

=~ Dradjat snruedjo, Of7ica Manacger

arvivod 02 Ochobhzr 1878

- Haryanl Pudyastnti. Secratary

hireda 27 Noverlare LG30

~ Rubivo, Ciark

l.—
"

hired 51 Novembe -

- Pamudjr Rzbardjo, L:riuve

R4
~t

Lo
‘-—4
~2
[€2)

hired ¢ Octoboy

- Purante, Driver

hirad 17 Cctobkay 1980

- Tukino, Office Boy/Lusbor
hired 10 Novzmber 1980
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set asidz by the pl.-ners for the TW-1 pump house
and a 10 m” rescrawcur will b built by Perunmas so
that the excess wate Lceom tho w2it will go to Su-
rakarta retwork. Thz DHV represantative requested
electrical reguirewr. 1ts5 for TW-1 pump ejguipmant so
he could include saw- next waekx in s discussions
with PLN for total Parumnas elactrical reguiraments,
Data will b2 obtainea Erom th> Coisultant in. Kansas
City via telex as scoun as prnaible. It 1s expacted
the improvements foc access voads will done abcout

[

mid-May and there wiil be facili*ioz built inte the

new bridge to suppo-'® the new pipeline.

Field meeting with T.ty DPU representative at the

new site of bath housz Mo, 3-3 to determine courssa
of action after flod foa thwe nearty, river crested 0.8m
above existing foundetion. The DPU representative

stated that conditicn had occured five timez last
year (which he cnangyzd the next day to "the ficst
cime in five years": . 1t was regquested thiuiz DU
provide additional fill to railse che intevior floor
and adjacent. exterior grade above flcod level since the
revised site had beer theic selection. The contrac
tor will be requestadc to raise the rough brickwork
and concrete columns by the szame amount. All other

dimensions cof the structure would remain unchanged

19 January 1982 : Coordination meeting with the

two distribution main contractors and SWE wherein
SWE was requested to axtend a ¢ 100 mm PVC line
north from Line "L" in Nusukan in order to service
the new site for bath house No. 3-1 and to install
fire hydrant No. 29 at the same time the Phase L
contractor installs the reolacement piping along Jl..
Nusukan. The Project offered to supply the materi-
als and the SWE agreed to make the in:ztailation.

SWE was requested to leave closed all corporation

stops on new service line constructions made to new

- 14 -



dis«rubuti " mainy uitil the line iz tested and turn-

ad over to tnowr for o .oracion,

(A

52 : Cocodination meeting with DSE

20 Jannary L

Wwolatics, pmembor of the Teander Committee,USAID, SWE
ana the ?.oiect conoe iiag orocuronent procedures
for the 0 & M Eyuipment Dff-Sheore purchases to be

inale . Alsc, the prooress status was discussed (see
7 -

A b Len mecbtirg rich heth aouse/public latrine

o
..-
(Y
—_
=
;
3

Co
conitractors was cante lea dus o other sch=eduled Teet-~

ineg.

22 Januaiy Lusg : Meohing with tile Director of SWE
as reguerced in 29 Jaruvery neeting to explain the

various O & M oweols, cguipeent and facilities. The

Director 2i7o2d Lo nrocedd with the total orocurenent,

25 - 20 Janu.ry 1982 @ Various meetings in officas

of USAID and DSE cene cning O & M Eguiprzat to  be
puschased leading up =o tho Director's letter to US-
recucuating conilivoaileon on the approval to spend
Loxn Fernids a2 datait! i in the Consultant's Lecter

No. 0/ /BM/TAE/Y2 dased 76 January 1932 (see Appandix VIL)

26 January 1982 : Coordinaticn meeting with the twe

distribution main conctractors and SWE wherein ap-
proval was given to tap the center of the g 450 mm
MJ plug. The contrac-ors were instructad to proceed
with installing the bridge steel for stream crossings

as soon as possible.

27 January 1932 : Coordination meeting with the

three contractors concarned with the bath houses
and public latrines wherein the contractors were
advised water services could ke done by SWE provid-
ed they pay the regular installation charge to SWE

and the service line not exceed four meters in length.



III-J

ACTIVITIES PLAMNYNEDR FOR NEXT MONTH

‘Continue with ell construction activity. Follow

up on the procurcmeat of O & M Equipment and ¢g250
mm pipe and fittings for Phase III., Define balance
of Phase III work to be donz in preparation of
tendering that Phase ©of the distribution network.
Call for tenders on the balance of public laztrines.
Receive and evaluate the bids received for the
deep well pumping egquipment and acuvessories., Re-
star: the leak survey with SWE personnel as thev

are made available.
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SURAKARTA WATER PROJECY
REPORT OF MAN-MONTHS EXPENDED BY CONSULTANT
BURNS 8 McDONNELL / TRANS~-ASIA ENGINEERING ASSOCIATES

CC'TRACT NUMBER

MAN- MONTHS

=

et Sttt

0l /WS-S/AID /78 FoR CUMULATIVE TOTAL IN | % OF TOTAL §
THROUGH - CONTRACT USED PER = ¢
. C )=
Al LLOAN 497 -U-044 JANUARY 1982 JANUARY 1982 SCHEDULE SCHEDULE 5‘;
_ RE
EXPATRIATES
PROCUREMENT ENG. 0.39 9.19 14.5 63.3 5.31
CHIEF ENGINEER ) 26.2 30 87.3 3.8
CONSTRUCTION SPICIALIST 1 28.1 36 78 7.9
LIAISON  OFFICER 0.16 4.83 7.5 64.4 2.57
PRINCIPAL 0 0.17 2 8.5 1.83
HYDROGEOLOGIST .—M—OM“NWM —&Il 12 67.5 3.9
DRILLING SPECIA IS T J 102 otz 87.5 1.8
0B M SPECIALIET 1 35,4 !
METES SPECIALIZT o) ~)'3 e 1%50'3 g']_'
MANAGEMENT SP..CIALIST ) “G0.2 - 96.1 0.8
SPECIAILIST )] ) 0 k}
DESIGN SPECIALIST 0 12 2 ‘wo o
- — s r—— ———r e e e - —- [ U _—
| EXPATRIATE TOTA . 255 162,69 R 81.5 36.81
INDC NIZS 1 A OO T B N




-

COUNTERPART CHIIF ENG. o 28.6 33 " es 4.4~
CONSTRUCTION SUPERVISOR 1 18.5 38 51.3 17.5
HYDROGEOLOGIST ‘ c 20.7 26 79.6 5.3 |
MATZRIALS COORCINATOR 1 40 a8 83 .3 )
INSFECTORS 3 119 146 81.5 27
DRAFTSMAN 1 51 56 77.2 15
ACCOUNTANT ) 34 32 106.2 (2)
TECHNICAL TRANSLATOR 0 17.8. 18 98.8 0.2
DESIGN ENGINEER c 6 8 75 2
SPEC. / COST ESTIMATOR 0 4.6 3 153.3 (1.6)
SR. URVEYOR /PLOTTER 0 5.4 5 108 (G.4)
SURVEYOR o C 3 100 0
INSTRUMENTMAN o] 6.3 1 5 12¢ (1.3)
INDON. PROF. 8 °TECH. ‘ - 4313 5

== By B e e T "5“:"7‘.‘5*.._.._.v.. bl PR S At 3"“ .9. ...A —TTrer .T:F‘:Z:;:L:::;'f"#—"’:z_‘h‘:‘f’—%‘k?!ﬁ?ﬂ“ﬂ:a B d ..74.—1—

) ~s n . . e o e q
INDOHESIAN ADMINISTR AT y

OFFICE MANAGER 1 40 48 01 83,3 8

| SECRETARY { BI - LINGUAL ) 1 3¢.6 _ 54 71.4 15.4
TYP:IST _ ”~ 2T, T e s i a3 ?23.68
CLERKS oo L EMLEL | il5.d (13.5). |
DRIVERS ' 3 is.3 P s 714 63.7
LABORERS 2872 ]!-:,,,_ A 848 20.8

{
RODMEN / CHAINMEN ] 13.0° . 5 fooiie ot 138.0 (3.8)
e e S v - S

ADMINISTRATIVE TOTAL | - ¥ .

».77 I 1 -r:.—z:z-.nrraér}:z;;’m:?___——..._ TR . X -&-s;—_" - —74_‘ 8::‘:3::::—_:1 o 18_4 = 3




SURAKAR

REPORT OF

BURNS 8 McDONNELL/T

“.4--..- P A ——— St g

CONTRACT NO
O1/WS-S/AID/7C

SIGNED 26 OCT. 1978
START 1 JAN. 1978

COSTS FOR

CULYILATIVE CCGSTS THROUGH

% OF TOTA.

e e e * g @ ) TRt B 0y camna

END 30 SEP. 1982 JANUARY 1982  AMOUNT BUDGET
 REIMBURSABLE ' | ESTIMATE
ZXPENDITURES
BN
Sciories and Rel3ted Costs 15,775.74 993,233.26 87.9
Trancsportaiion - 73,631.72 88.3
i Equipmant - 12,455.36 77.%
) B
Miscellan:ous - 63,563.48 109.4
l Ceniingencies - 53,543.45 g8d.e
- 4 —_
TOTAL DOLLARS 15,775.74 1,198,427.27 88.5
i NDC
Sa.jries 3,239,167 173,490.384 77.5
Transpor ration 983,970 71,205,503 84.8
Housing - 64,000,000 101.6
Vehicle Cos's | 621,000 49,868,972l  92.9
Equipmenr} Costs “ - 24,610,860 101.4
Miscellar.eoJs 838,250 83,705,710 91.1
Contingencios - 33,144,580 99.7
TCTAL RUPIAH 5,682,387* 500,027,009, 87.1
— 1
* Through
L2

Partial



APPENDIX - I

RTA WATER PROJECT
e :NGINEERING COSTS
TRANS-ASIA ENGINEERING ASS0C.
- -
CUMULATIVE PAYMENTS THIIUGH |
- ‘ - ! TOTAL BUDGET
| v
i )
Al AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT % OF | ESTIMATE FOR::
RECEIVED 1 RECEIVED TOTAL ‘ -
SR ! CONTRACT
i IN THROUGH JUDGET ;
| JANUARY 1982 JANUARZ 192 ISTIMATE | ;
< SOLLARS ' -
------ { -~!—- ' . l
| 1 ] . H
i 15,517.60C 979,457.52 ! 36.5 { '-'gg"_;}g R
i - '73,831.72 ; 38.3 3 15 . 000
| - 12,455.3: ' 77.3 ! '
N— - R e (Lo , —
d cs can , 109 - 2 : 56,063
! - BOo.o00. [ LS PSS ’
i o 3 ‘
. : 63,271
i - '53,470.70 | 84.5 ‘ rent
o Lo ; e
5 16,517.60 1,182,651.52 ! 37.3 | 1,352,856
NESIAN RUPIAH N i i
] { —~ .
- 163,329,2x7 | 72.9 | 223,795,250
- 68,331,483 | 81.4 ' 83,952,600
] S— -
I &w,275,000
- 64,000,000 101.6 | 53,675,000
- 48,029,472 89.4 -
- 24,610,860 101.4 24,253,000
- 82,362,140 89.7 :;'i;%'izg
- 33,144,580 99.7 R
10,380,000 ** 483,807,752 84.3 573,661,310

Payment of Rp. Invoice No.

Invoice No. 25 December 1981.

21 and 22,
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SURAKARTA
TECHNICAL W

ORIGINAL CONTRACT I

T

PERATIONAL 1978 1979
REAS OCT|NOV |DEC|JAN |FEB |MAR|APR MAY;JUN JUL |AUG|SEP|OCT INOV |DEC [JAN [FEB [MAR | APR |{MAY {WU

i
i

TECHNICAL ,
ASSISTANCE ,
EFQR TENDERS i
OFF SHORE 19/8/ 77 : j
'a) DUCTILE IRON SE—{-p+—Tr
PIPE8 FITTINGS ! $%— —{-p— —-R? i
ACIPCO 5 o tp— — R c
KJ.04.02 11/8/78|— — A '
(b) BUTTERFLY 8GATE ; 8t —[— P — 4 —IR’
VALVEBCASTINGS | | ; ‘ :
i
i

s+ —1—r

CLOW CORP.

KUQ4.02 13/7/78 fom i 4= — —{ A

¢) REPAIR PARTS, | l df— 1 - — p -
i

%
I
i
)
1 LR

TOOLS & TRUCKS'
THE ROHAN CO.
KU 0402 1/8/78 |— — =k —i — | — 1A
d) FLOW METERS & ':
ACCESSORIES
PT.COLCORINDO R. |
KU. 04 02.13/ 7 /78— =
OFF SHORE 20/6/79|— = — —— — — — — 4=~ =TD 4= 4= o ed — [N
| a) 3RASS GOODS ' 5 $'-R'
8 ACCESSORIES | '
FORD METER BCXCC ’
KU0402 02/i2/79 ;
oo — - — YF —F NS
3. TRANSFORT CCMTRACT. i . KA I R S !
TRANSMISSION MAIN , , '
{a) SECTION A2B —_—— el —— -.._.} — LT = - — {TD 4 N+~ — — —IsscnON"A" e
i

' .\- s’—-f—P-— -

!
!
|
3'—-"'-—* P"" —— emon | e _""-'—R'
{
|
!

I_
|
l
I
I
L
>

) e SE¢TION"B"
L bt
TO f— =t N, |~ - SECTION \'C

'p) SECTION C 8D
N. | section "0’

—— e e

5. TEST WELLS '

a) RESISTMVITY TEST | TO N 4= o = | = C

D) TW-1BTW-2 |— 4= = = e fo o | L TD [ ofe o o f= mf o fm | TD = oo o o] e —| N

¢) OFF SHORE PUMPE

| GEN.

DISTPIBUTION SYSTEM ; _

(! 100 ;mvices + 47 P.H i -1t

'b) KELURAHANS |- 8 ! —_—-T

lc) PIPE & FITTINGS | ~ | -
LOCAL PURCHASE

') Kelrahans 9-12 89-21 i -

le) Kaluchon 3815-17 P -

(f) Kelurghan 14-188 22 ’ ' -

Q) Vaive— Off shore i i -
PROCUREMENT !

PUBLIC LATRINES -

PUBLIC BATHS —_
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SURAKARTA W

OPERATIONAL
REAS

ORIGINAL CONTRACT

TECHNICAL W(

l

1978

1979

CCT |NOV

DEC

VAN

FEB

MAR

APRIMAY

JUN |JUL | AUG

SEP |OCT

NOV

DEC

JAN
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APPENDIX VI

MONTHLY PROGRESS MEETING

Date ¢ 20 January 1982
Hours : 10.00
Place ¢ PAB I Office
Jl. Brig. Jen. Sudiarto 534 Surakarta

Participants :

l. Ir. Supeno Ichsan DSE

2. Ir. Sorta Hutagalung DSE

3. Locarno Wahid Public Works, Jkt.

4. Ir. Hari Wahyuadi CIJWSP

5. Ir. Djaelani SWE

6. Ichsan SWE

7. Clare Copleman BM/TAE

8. J.F. Beucom BM/TAE

9. Albext G. Ringler BM/TAE
10. D.E. Warner USAID
11. Philip B. Tjakranata USAID
12. Sudjiono CJWSP

Notes :

Before formal vpening of the meeting conversation on 0 & M
equipment list while awaiting arrival of SWE representatives.
Mr. Locarno asked wether the list has been approved by Mr.
Soesanto, DSE which then answered by the Consultant that some-
time in September 1981 a verbal approval has been given by Mr.
.Susanto in Jjakarta for the Consultant to go ahead with the
list. The Consultant then presented that letters have been
sent for these equipment and a telex copy were shown and read
of off-shore equipment which indicate approval has been given
by USAID and Cipta Karya.

Mr. Locarno further asked if the purchase procedures and sys-
tem is in accordance with USAID requlations,which then answer-
ed by the Censultant that this purchase will not differ with
the purchase of the gate valves a few months back. Mr. Sorta
then said that this purchase has two aspects, of first is the

procedures of the purchase, the second is to bring/shipment
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of the materials into the country, because as for example the
gate valves purchase as or now, no permits from the Customs
has been given yet which means that second application follow-
ing procedures of the gate valves will not be accepted or is
prohibited. Mr. Sorta suspects that by following the same
procedures of- the gate valves, the clearance of the goods may
take more than one year. Mr. Supeno then explained that the
Customs will give exemption tc the goods provided that C.K.
could produce the L/C figures and the L/C number.

Mr. Hutagaldhg then quipped that exemption from Custom sduties
are applicable to : - personal effects

grants

project financed. by Loan,

which is contaihed in Decree No. 95 for - Exemption from Custom's
duties.

The meeting then agreed oa the snlution. that Burns & McDonnell
shall be the main supplier, with letter of authority issued by
original suppliers (Rohan, Wacker etc.)

Mr. Sorta says 'that C.K. will nes=d the. amount of Contract in
order they will be able to prepare the Contract then make a Con-
tract award to Burns & Mc Donneall, and CK. will also prepare
and open the L/C in the Bank of Indonesia. (May be classified :
the Bank charges will be absorb by C.K., and the Stamp tax, on
reimbursable basis, will be paid by Consultant but reimbursed
by the Project. The procedures ncminating Burns & McDonnell as
supplies are'acted and devised in order to anticipate the Cus-
toms difficulties. |

Further procedures of payment to the original suppliers were
also talked about, and concluded that USAID will pay the sup-
plier through their beneficiary bank because the L/C were
opened to Burns & McDonnell on behalf of the original suppliers.
USAID sees no difficulties in changing the DRA to meet these
requirements, all they need is copy of the Procurement Contract
so action can be made to change the DPA so USAID can pay the
suppliers.

Consultant then presented the Rohan list of cquipment that they
quoted and also letter from Rohan was produced in which stated

that their prices were of the lowest compared with othercdampanies.
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Consultant suggested that procurement of Item 37, radio'eqdip-
ment,be made of local sources -(in country), and also delete
equipment of A, 3 and C from the proposed L/C list. These A,
B-and C with approval from USAID can be purchased and sent in

country using other means.

Schedule Presented by Mr. Sorta. :

REPORT TO

20 PAPEDALUM & 1 3 18 30

T US%ID 2 AW%RD 3 IL‘C 5 DELIVERY 9

/I 4 II 4 /I 7 (“i '& fl
THES %?- APPROVAL 3 coNTRECT %  LETTER %? EXPTRED
MEETING FROM - > OF COM. DATE OF

PAPEDALUM & LOAN

USAID

Further USAID reéquested that the procedures for the O & M pro-
curement be prepared and made into a letter sent to the Consul-
tant for acknowledgment or approval.

C.K. then asked to the Consultant of Item 21 price, quoted by
Rohan because Rohan price is almost 3 x other supplier price.
Consultant said that prices may still be negotiated and other
supplier quoted lcwer than price. shown in tne list (Item 21
price) then purchase order can be issued ‘to the lowest bidder.

The Consultant then presented. a Recap of the proposed L/C as

follows :

'Rohan Us $ 78,025.00

Others 29,209.52
107,234.52

Less radio Item 37 ( 14,252 )
92,982.52

Less A,B,C 5,406
87,576.52

Total of proposed L/C 87,576.52

Add local radio 4,600
92,176.52

A question rises why CB is preferred than VHF radios was ans-
wered that CB is preferred because of lower costs of the main-
tenance, registration, monthly fee and licensing costs.

-VI-3 -


http:92,176.52
http:87,576.52
http:87,576.52
http:92,982.52
http:107,234.52
http:29,209.52
http:78,025.00

The informal conversation then proceed to formal by opening of
the meeting by Mr. Hari Wahyuadi who thanked those present of
their coming and the meeting topic is O & M equipment off-shore
procurement : Mr. Hari proceed that conversation of the last
hour were : - explaning/discussing procedures of off-shor.e pro-

curement.

" - approval of the O & M equipment, item by item -
of this SWE is requested to verify item by item
of the equipment and give approval of any items
which should be puirchased.

- procedures of shipment of the equipment.

The Consultant then proceed to explain the use of the equip-
ment item by item and also indicate that the building for the
O & M has been approved and renovation to the building  has
been made and other changes will be made by the construction
contractors to meet the requirements of an O & M building
which left only the equipment foundations for the building
which has not been decided and approved yet until equipment

is purchased.

The list that the Consultant had preépared contained tools and
equipmenrt in order to make all SWE equipment in good working
qrder. In question arised from Mr. Hari, should arrival of
the equipment exceeding the Consultant's Contract then Consul-
tant said that there's no obligation for the Consultant to
stay unless a new contract is made or CK or SWE has to provide
themselve an instructor to train the SWE p=arsonnel.

The tools and equipment on the list is prepared and recommend-
ed by the Consultant to SWE, SWE will decide wether these
equipment meet their need and requirement.

Because of the lack of quotes from other Company, other than
Rohan, Wacker, and Mc-Lane then the Consultant agreed to try
to negotiate the prices to make it lower. Quotes can not be
obtained from other Conpany because of time limitation. Also,
Rohan has an option that they will take the Contract for all
of item or none.
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The meeting then proceeded to scurtinize item by item's prices.
A recap then resulted from the scurtinizing indicating supplier
which will supply the requirement.

Rohan McLane Wacker No bid _Cancelled
1-17 18 ABCD
19 20
(negO 21) ® 8 o9 s e8P 8 ®PeSseOSs 21
22- 32

(neg. 33) ...33

(neg. ~4) ...34
(nec"‘ 35) ..ll......'........I....I.......I...I'l..’!l’l35

(RBG. 36) tueeeesoesasessossosacssssceassancnssacasannssdl

Mr. Sorta Hutagalung, Mr. Supeno and Mr. Locarno hag to leaye
tlie meeting so they could catch the 15.00 hours plane at Yagya-
karta to fly back to Jakarta.

The meeting proceeded with the Consultant report of: the Project
progress up to date. Mr. Baucom produced the chart of the Pro-
ject completion and through his explanation he indicated that

~ the Distribution works has reached 58 % complete and the Con-
struction of the Bath house and Public Latxines has. rgpachad

37.5 % complete. The Distribution Iines laid down for.the Phase
I has reaci:ed 25.5 km and Phase II 22 km.

The Consultant requested approval of additional costs o0f con-
struction cf septic tank which in the drawing exists, but in
actual was found none, and also approval to assign other site
of a Public Latrine which was deleted from the original drawing.

Further the Consultant explained that Phase III works is being
prepared and invitation to tender will be carried within this
month, coming February for the tender, award may be made in
March so the work of Phase III may start early April 1982,

The Consultant further reported their efforts in the leak sur-
vey since the SWE suffer lack of personnel and funds to do the
repairing, at the moment leak survey is temporary stopped, un-
til further solutions on the repair and personnel be mate up.

The meeting was adjourned at 13:45,
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APPENDIX VII

BURNS & McDONNELL Engineering Co.

" Architect — Engineers A JOINT VENTURE Consultants — Planners

TRANS-ASIA Engineering Associates, Inc.

Please Reply to: /0. Sahid Jaya Hotel
P.0. Box 41
Our Ref. : 40/BM/TAE/82 JAKARTA.

26 January 1982

Xr. H. Susanto Mertodiningrat,
Director of Sanitary Engineering,
Direc-orate of Sanitary Engineering,
‘Directorate General of Cipta Karya,
Ministry of Public tlorks,

Jalan Pattimura, 20,

JAKARTA SELATAN.

Dear Sir,

Subject : Request for Approval to Proceed with Procurement
of 0&M Equipment for Surakarta Water Supply
Project
erence : 1. Our Letter No. 011/BM/TAE/SKA/82
Dated 12 January 1982 of the same subject
2. Meeting in Solo 20 January 1982
3 Meeting this date with Mr. Sorta Hutagalung

b
L]
Hh

)

We wish to advise you we have completed negotiations with the
Rohan Co. as requested in referenced (2) meeting. Since that
time we have obtained agreement with USAID to do the following
pending your written approval on the above subject :

A. The Rohan Company - P.0. Box 6363 - Moore, Oklahama
73160 - Mr. Bill Gilles to supply Items 1 thru 17,
19, 22, 24 thru 32 and 36 for a total price CIF
Semarang of U.S. Dollars Forty Three Thousand Four
Hundred One and 12/100 (US$ 43,401.12).

B. Maclane International - 75 Lansing Street - San Francisco,
California 94105 - Mr. C.L. Wilkerson to supply Items
18a, 18b, 18c,.18d, 18e, 20, 33 and 34 for a total price
CIF Semarang of U.S. Dollars Twenty Two Thousand Three
Hundred Twenty Eight and No/100 (US$ 22,328.00).

cont'd ...../2
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BURNS & McDONNELL Engineering Co.

Architect — Enginaers A JOINT VENTURE Consultants — Planners

TRANS-ASIA Engineering Associates, Inc.

-2 -

Ir. H. Susanto Mertodiningrat

Director of Sanitary Engineering

pit. of Sanitary Engineering

pit. Gen. Cipta Karya

our Ref. : 40/Bll/TAE/82 26 January 1982

C. Wacker Corporation - P.T. Box 09402 - Milwaukee,
Wisconsin 53209 to supply Items 21 and 23 for a
total price CIF Semarang of U.S. Dollars Seven
Thousand Nine Hundred Sixty Five and No/100
(uss 7,965.00),

D. Total for offshore procurement listed above is Seventy
Three Thousand Six Hundred Nincty Four and 12/100
U.S. Dollars (US$ 73,694.12).

E. Items 35 (Shop Air Compressor) and 37 (Base Station
and tobile CB type radios with antennae) to be
purchatscd on the local market (in-country), provided
USAID Code 941 requirements are met, with Loan Funds
not to exceced Six Thousand Six Hundred Dollarg (s 6,600.00).

F. The other items added to the bottom of the price comparison
attached to our reference (1) letter will have to be
subject of separate procurement authorisation due to
shipping problema. The total price of USS 5,416.40 is
still good, however it may be nccessary to utilize air
freight, thercfore, USAILD is making a total allowance
of Ten Thousand Dollars (UsS$ 10,000) for all these
migcellancous items.

Aassuming we proceed with all of the above, of the one hundred
thousand Dollars allowance for theto things per Implementation
Letter No. 8, the total budqget would ba au follows

1. Agrced Offshore Procurcinuat (A thru D above) : § 73,694.12
2. In-Country Procurcment (E above) ......ooee. % 6,600,00
3. Allowance for Other Procurement (F above) .. : $ 10,000.00

90,294.12

<

TOTAL nU[)(;HTl ©e e D 8 68 0 00 8 T B 08 IS BN EIGS s

cont'd ...../3
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BURNS & McDONNELL Engineering Co.
Architect — Engineers A JOINT VENTURE Consulitants — Planners

TRANS-ASIA Engineering Associates, Inc.

Ir. H. Susanto Mertodiningrat

Director of Sanitary Engineering

Dit. of Sanitary Engineering

Dit. Gen. Cipta Karya

Our Ref. : 40/BM/TAE/82 26 January 1982

Of course any savings realized in 2 or 3 above would thereby
reduce the loan amount accordingly.

We trust this will keep you well informed and look forward to
receiving your early approval to proceed in this manner.

Very truly yours,

BURNS & MCDONNELL ENGINEERING CO./
TRANS-ASIA ENGINEERING ASSOC., INC.

(—Wf\

J.F. BAUCOM
Acting Chief Englneer

JFB/ms.
cc. : - Mr. Azis Sasmitadihardja - DSE
- Mr. Sorta Hutagalung - DSE
- Mr. David Warner - USAID
- Mr. Krisno Darusman - CJWSP
- Mr. Hari W. - PAB-I
- Mr. Clare W. Copleman - BM/TAE
- Mr. Weston Goodnow - EMD, KCO
- File

Approved by :

_Ir. H. Susanto Mertodiningrat
Director of Sanitary Engineering

Date :
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OFFSHORE PROCUREMENT OPERATIONS '& MAINTENANCE EQUIPMENT

PROPOSAL EVALUATION

SURAKARTA WATER SUPPLY PROJECT
(UPDATED PER 26 JANUARY 1982 LETTER)

Bidders Price C.I.F. Semarang

Equip.vList Qty. Description A
Itea No. Line Item ROHAN MACLANE DURKIN WACKER SHORING AS NOTED
Us$ Us$ Us$ Us$ Us$ Us$
1 1 ea. | Master Mechanics Tool Set ......... 4,421.00 | Incomplete
2 1 ea. | Metric Double-Offset Box Wrench Set 470.00 | See 1/15/82 Ltr.
3 1 ea. | Small Engine Service and Overhaul
Tool Jet veevecoconne cesstacsseaans 841.00 | Incomplete
1l ea. | Impact Wrenches - 1/4" & 1/2" Size 470.00 | See 1/15/82 Ltr.
1 ea. | Rigid-Frame Dial-Type Torque Wrench 464.00 | See 1/15/82 Ltr.
2 ea. | Swivel~Grip Strap-Type 0il Filter--
Wrenches ..vieeeeecceranoconcsnnnnes 59.00 | See 1/15/82 Ltr.
7 1 ea. | Clutch Alignment Tool Set ....c.c.. 70.00 | No Bid
8 1 set | Wheel Balancer, Tool and Weights .. 358.00 | See 1/15/82 Ltr.
9a 1l set | Portable Tire Tools for Passenger
07 905.00 | See 1/15/82 Ltr.
9b 1l set | Portable Tire Tools for Trucks .... incl. |See 1/15/82 Ltr.
10 1l ea. | Wheel and Bearing Seal Driver Set . 163.0GC |See 1/15/82 Ltr.
11 1 lot | Brake Maintenance Equipment ....... 587.00 | Incomplete
12 1l ea. | Pistol-Grip Compression Tester .... 104.00 |See 1/15/82 Ltr.
13 1l ea. | Remote Starter Switch .....cc000u0e 48.00 [See 1/15/82 Ltr.
15 1l ea. | Engine Vacuum and Fuel Pump Tester - 35.00 |See 1/15/82 Ltr.
15 1l ea. | (5) Test Hand-Held Engine Anlyzer '
Set c.ceeneee ceeessscssansns ceevoas 729.00 |No Bid
16 1l ea. | Starter-Generator Current Tester .. 29.41 {See 1/15/82 Ltr.
17 1l ea. | Power Timing Light ................ 152.00 }|See 1/15/82 Ltr.
18a § b l ea. | Meltirg Furnace with Lead Pot and
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Meleting Furnace with Lead ot and
Pouring Hook et
Portable Melting Compound Furnace,
Ladle & Runners ...eeeecencnsonas .
Field Lathe for Asbestos Cement
Pipe .tiiiesancrsosnnnvenceanes ceeene
Portable Pressure Recorders .......
Gasoline-Driven Breaker-Compactor .
Air Compressor 100 cfm with Acces-
sories - Portable .......c0c0venane
Gasoline-Powered Diaphragm Pump 3"
Size
Welder with Power Plant - AC Model

Welder w/ Power Plant - AC/DC Model
Riggers-Type Heavy-Duty Chain
Hoists 2 & 5 TONS .eveccecacscanes .
250 Amp. Combination AC/DC Welder .
Walding Hood e emiimiencnninaae cees
Gas Welding Uailt -~ General Descrip.
Cnly ticivieiracnaosnsansncanonscsnes
Single~Stage Regulator Outfit .....
Two-Stage Regulator Cutfit .....
Welding Cylinder Truck ............
Portable Disc Sander/Grinders and

Sarding Discs ...

Lubrication Equipment w/ Grease &
011 PUDP eeevenecerecerecconnasnoas
Twelve~-Inch Metalworking Lathe with
Stand seesececsesiesscessnnsrcansee

Air Compressor for Shop

Yo ?id
No Bid
2,935.00
Withdrawn**
HWithdrawn
12,552.00
Withdrawn
5,494.00
incl.
1,764.71

1,829,00
54.00

1,511.00
648.00
176.00

1,729,00

Withdrawn

Withdrawn

Withdrawn

4,936.00
5,652.00
4,281.00
2,402.00%
8,426.00
17,951.00%
1,925.00%
6,207.75%
incl.
3,047.00%

4,512.00%
incl,

incl.

incl.

incl.
1,705.08%
3,120.00%

6,218.00%

5,920.00%*

3,395.00

6,375.00%%x%

11,277.78

1,590.00k*x*

4,042.00

{Conmaco)
3,810.15




PTOPLEA EVATINIION
OFFSHORE PROCUREMENT 2PLUATIONS & MAINTENASCE ZQUIRLENT
SHURAKARTY, UIATER SUPCLY ZROJECT
(UPDATED FFE 26 JANUARY 1982 LETTER)

Bidders Price C.I.F. Semarang
Equip. List Qty. Descriptioen ) T " ] — - -
Item No. Line Item ROHAN | CLARE DURKIN WACKER SHORING AS NOTED
USS US$ US$ USS US$ USS
36 1 lot| No-Thread Couplings ...cccceevveans 4,789 .00% B8.387.50% (Ford Meter)
13,265.00
37 Rkk 1 lot| Mobile Radioc Equipment Cancelled - (Tactee System)
Buy Local ...ceevvioncncssencsncens No Bid 20,385.00* 14,252,030
(General Elec.)
17,473.00
{Motorola)
19,897.00
TOTAL PRICE PER SELECTED SUPPLIER :j 43,401.12 22,328.00 0 7,965.00 0

e, e ey
H Califis v e
.

Note : * ) Agent quoted on more than one manufactUrééf:~Th;.iéaégi_qupte43§§¢wisﬁhisqeq_pbove.
**% ) Not Portable.
k%% ) In-Country Procurement not to exceed US$ 6,600.00C
kkkk) Per 1-22-82 Telex.

1TEMS ADDED PER REQUEST CF CENTRAL JAVA WATER SUPPLY PRCSLCT :
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Surveying Altimeters - 260 to + 3,000 Meters .

Leak Detector & Line/Valve Locator with lixplements ..

ev s toonvarr

t....)'I'l.lllll..l'l.....l..l.‘...ll.'
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(Paulin)
3,920.00
(WHestern I)
1,329.90
(Lietz)
166.50

{Pcst)

189.00
(X & E)
284,69
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APPENDIX VIII

COORDINATION MEETING WITH S.W.E.

Date : 09 January 1982
Hours : 11.30
Place : PAB I office

J1l. Brig. Jen. Sudiarto 534 Surakarta
Participants :

l. Mr., Oemar Sidik D.S.E.
2. Mr, Krisno Darusman CJWSP
3. Mr. Hari Wahyuadi CJwsP I
4, Mr..Djaelani Saberan S.W.E.
5. Mr, Ichsan S.W.E.
6. Mr. Hary S. S.W.E.
7. Mr. J.F. Baucom BM/TAE
8. Mr. A.G. Ringler BM/TAE
9. Mr. Syarif Lembah EM/TAE

Conclusions :

- Mr. Oemar Sidik gave suggestion that the new SWE director
to 'immediately prepare or study the organization structure
which exists at present and prepare an effective Time Sche-
dule and also following' instructions in the Manuals pre-
pared by the Consultant for the SWE, or following rcccmmen-
dations made by the Consultant to SWE. Mr. Hary S. is not pexmanent.

- According to O & M Specialist, leak survey will be complet-
ed ‘this year and this will solely depending upon the ab:ility
of the SWE ‘itself. Staff absenteeism is causing loss of efficiency at Wil

- According to Mr. Krisno for the use of circulation eguipment
‘to the swimming pool, approval has been given by Mr. Soesanto.
And Mr. Krisno stresses' that installation of this ecuipnent
should be completed before the Consultant's Contract ends
(September 1982).

- The Consultant provided copies of charts and December Monthly
Report Appendices i inaicate present progress of Project.
It was said the items still to be done mainly involve Phase
III distribution piping, Phase IV Replacement program and
the leak survey with 0-J-T when the O & M Equipment arrives
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